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Whereaa it is mn the. opinion of the nern'oers of this As-
sociation desirable that thore should be establikhed a great
British Schoo1 of Law which would ha worthy of the legal
tradition of the British Empire and, would serve as the
centre of legal instruction andi research foi ail the British
Doroinions,

Andi whereas such a school would be mnost fittingly estab-
lished at the ancient homne of our Conimon Law, where the
most Piexitifui records of its past growth andi developrnent
are to be founti, and where it stili recelves it most authorita-
tive exposition andi application,

Therefore be it resolveti by tiais Association that repre-
sentations be conveyeti tbrougl' appropriate chenneIs to
proper suthorities andi persons in Englanti suggesting the
possibility and de8irability of ec-tablishing at London, Eng-
landi, a British School of Lawv which would alan to provide
cornplete, thorough andi systematic instruction andi training
in law tu miet the needs of students not only froan the
British Isles but froa ail parts of the British Dominions;

Andi in connection with the eatabtishment of such a school,
this Association would venture to make the following sug-
gestions:

Location-That the School be locateci near the Law Courts
at London where students mnay have daily opportunity of
attending the Courts and ob8erving proceedîngs therein, so
that they may. not only see how proof is properly madie andi
legal rules ascertaineti andi applied, but aiso thât they may
have an opportunity of observing andi becomning acquainteti
with the ethical andi proftessional standards which obtain in
those Courts;

Curriculurn-That careful attention be devoteti tu fram-i
ing the curriculum of the School, to the endi that it may be
broad enough tu cover all branches of the law andi thorough
enougli tu ensure adequate preparation for students enter-
ing upon the practice of the law;

Staff - Tit the School be equipped with an adequate
staff, sufficient in nurnber tu enablo each niember thereof to
becomne thoroughly mater of hie subject, and that in creat-
ing such a staff an effort be madie, with a view of inaking
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