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THE PBOPOSED ISSUE OF LAND DEBENTURES IN THIS COUNTBY, 
(ENGLAND).
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Tun Canada Landed Credit Company is a highly respectable Canadian 
Association. The principles on which it is founded are so sound, that if they 
are but rigidiy adhered to, its character will infallibly be marked with success, 
as well as with great public utility. It is very desirable that these principles 
should be made known and understood, as a Bill has been introduced into the 
House of Commons during the last few days, having for its object the issue of 
debentures, chargeable on land, to the extent qf half the value qf the estate, so 
that a landowner may go to his banker and ask him to cash his debenture,after 
the manner of a railway debenture, and without the expensive machinery of a 
mortgage.

The plan of the Canada Landed Credit Company may, with great advantage, 
be consulted by the farmers of the Ijand Debentures Bill of Ireland, for it has 
been found to work well. The leading features in this Company's plan—and 
it is the principle which wili insure success—is that the mortgages on which 
it advances money are themselves paid off by means of a sinking fund. This 
principle is found to act perfectly, both as regards the owner of the estate and 
the Company. The security of the debenture holders is not only that of the 
Company—the Directors of which are men of the first standing in Canada— 
but they have this double security—Ist. The uncalled capital of theCompany. 
2nd. The security of the land, on which the Company makes advances to the 
extent of only one-third of its real value. Nothing appears more sound than 
this guarantee, based as it is on real estate, and there is no doubt it will find 
growing favor with the investing public.
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