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.adopted by the town, and carefu11y car-
lied out, compietely checked it, and flot
a single case of the fever has appeared
here since, that couid flot be traced to

some other locality, for its origin."*
Ground was broken for the sewers Feb.

16, 1882, and ail work on them was
finisbed July, 1882, although some ofthe
private connections were flot done tilI

after that date.
The estîmated cost of the work was

$2,000; the actuai cost including a
number of items, not originally estimated
upon, was $5 1,785.77.

The question bas been frequently asked,
"With the knowledge gained from the

work done, what changes would be ad-
vised, was it to be repeated elswhere ?
difficuit question to answer, as no two
places are similarly situated, either geo-
graphicaily, sanitarily, financialiy, or any
other way. It may be sufficient to say,
that some of the details of the bouse con-
.nectîons, such as grease traps, cesspools,
,and fresh-air inlets, %vould probably be

somewhat différently arranged, and the
former but of cast-iron rather than
.brick, while the generai features of the
plan would remain uncbanged.

CAUSES AND) ORIGIN 0F CHOLERA.

Otber events in Egypt bave cast tbe
choiera epidemic rather too mucb into the
shade. The possibility of tbe spread of

the disease next sommer is sucb that ahi
interest in it shoold flot be lost. Any-
tbing reliabie relating to its cause and
origmn wilI be profitable, and ougbt to be

interesting to aIl who take any interest in
sanitary work. At a meeting of the
Epidemilogicai Society of London, (Eng.)
on january 9 th, 1884, an important dis-
cussion took place upon this question, of

ivbich the following is a synopsis from a
report in the Medical lies-

Surgeon Generai Hunter, who has been

investigating the outbreak of choiera in

Egypt, said, that in regard to the recent

outbreak, there wvas one point in bis report

to the Government which was of such

paramount importance, that he wished to

bring it before the niembers of the Society,
and he intended to limit his remarks to

that oneC point, viz. : to enquire into the

origin of the commencement of the out-

break. Egypt, lie said, was about the

saine size as Belgium, but with a popula-

tion close u1)of 6,8oo,ooo inhabitants, or

1 Y million more than Belgiumr. The soil

was alluvial, rich in decomposîflg organic

matter; the peop)le were agricultural, and
led an out-of-door life. The country was

almost raînless, except for three montbs

during the cold season, the sky was cloud-

less, the air dry, the winds almiost always

nortberly. The Nule was the only source

of water supply, and perio(lî(ally inun

dated the country ; the rise began in june,
and attained its highest point in Septem-

ber, then gradually falling tili the following

J une;* the subsoil water level of course

follow ed that of the Nule. The inhabi-

tants mostly drank water unfiltered and

before it had time to settie. At Cairo

there was only one tank for drinking pur-

poes and the water was highly charged
with inorganic and organic iimplirities ; ini

the fashionable quarter there wvas no at-

temipt at filtration. The water supply at

Alexandria wvas good, it wvas the only town

in Egypt with a wboiesonle watcr supp)iy.

The Nile was polluted aimost from its

very source with filth, garbage, and the ex-

crcta of ahl the towns on its banks. At

Cairo and Alexandria it was found to con-

tain minute bacteroid organisms in con-

siderahie numbers. There had been great-

er pollution of the river than usuai, by the
carcasses of animals that had died of

typ)hus fever being tbrown in, in order to

avoid the fee payable on their death


