
of special departments. It is freely accessible and 
affords great facilities both for “browsing" and for 
serious study.

Furthermore must be mentioned

The Chance for Assistance

from Students' Aid Funds and Scholarships. Gener­
ous endowments by the late Rev. Ralph Brecken, 
D. D., of Toronto, and J. Wesley Smith. Esq., of 
Halifax. N. S.. enable the Faculty year by year to 
dispense very considerable sums to those who could 
not without such help obtain a university training. 
These are awarded partly as entrance bursaries to

have proved by their careers the powers of their in 
tellects and the value of their education.

Of all the prizes open to modern students one of 
the most note-worthy is the Rhodes Scholarship— 
about $1,500 a year tenable for three years in resi­
dence at Oxford University. Teachers through the 
provinces and parents should keep this prize in mind 
and direct the attention of clever boys to it. Appoint­
ments are made by the various universities of the 
Maritime Provinces from their students, who must 
be prominent !>cth in student activities and in their 
studies among which must be included Greek. Mount 
Allison has the appointment of a scholar three years
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pupils who have been lenders in their schools, and 
partly to students who have done good work durint? 
their course at Mount Allison. In addition a con­
siderable number of prizes are open each year to 
competition. By all these means, added to his power 
of earning during the long summer holiday, every 
clever energetic student in these provinces has within 
his reach a university education. The expenses of 
tuition, room and board in the Residence, Society 
fees and all, will amount for an Arts student, to less 
than $250 a year. (The Mount Allison year is 
thirtv-three weeks. ) Probably nowhere in the world 
is education of so high a standard so well within the 
reach of all classes of people as it is here in theMari- 
time Provinces. And probably, too. nowhere has 
been found a more intelligent group of students, who

out of every seven. Since 1905 Mount Allison has 
nominated five scholars and will nominate another 
during the present year, who will begin residence at 
Oxford in 1917. In addition three other Mount 
Allison men have been awarded scholarships, two for 
Newfoundland, and one for Bermuda.

Co-Educational

All degrees, honors and prizes, except the 
Rhodes Scholarship just referred to, are open on 
equal terms to all students without distinction of sex. 
Indeed Mount Alhson was the first Canadian Col­
lege to throw open its doors to women, for as early 
as 1875 a woman was granted the degree of B. S., 
and in 1882 another the degree of B. A. With its 
close relation to the Ladies* College giving unusual


