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Une predomiinating. Faiint indications of an unieven t. a. hine. Thle discal
mark alniost obsolete. Fainit terminal dots may be discerned. Hinid
wigs gray without huies. Two sp)eciinen)s, Savannah, Georgia, in Mus.
Brem.

'l'lie more of our species of Catocalinie Noctuids, b)elonginig to the
group of whlich Dr-aster-ia rnay be considered typical, the so-ca-lled
"lGrass M'votlis," I have become acquaited %vitli, the nmore do I see tue
necessity for tlîeir geîîeric revisioni. But tue material I have hiad at any
one tinie lias been so smiall and fragnîentary tliat 1 have been unable to
atteml)t it.______________

DESCRIPTIONS 0F CERTAIN LEPI DOPTEROUS LARVÎE.

1W HARRISON G. DYAR.

Collas I3ehrii, Edw.

Eg,ý --Spinidie shaped, a littlc coîîtracted just before the tip, iih low
longitudial aîîd traiîsverse ridges, ivhich divide the surface inito shallow,
rectangular parallelogranms. Length, 1.3 IPM.; %vidth, .6 mnm. The eggs
are laid sinigly on tlie upper side of the leaves of a species of grounld
huckleberry, its food plant.

Fiirst stage.- Head rouîîded, dark brown ; width, .25 mnm. Body of
normal shape, sordid whitishi, apparently without, marks ; minutely pilose.

Ff/h stag,,e. -Head rounded, very slighitly bilobed, slightly reticulated
witli browni ; nio other marks ; wvidtli, 2 min. Mouth. parts brown ; ocelli
and jaws black. An even, pinikishi white dorsal linie, very îîarrowly black
bordered. runis the lenigtlî of the body, tapering a little at each enid,
obsolete on joiits 2, 3 and i-. A lîroader, eveni, subdorsal huie, nearly
whlite on tue cdges, salmon.coloured ceîîtrally, and bordered above by a
black luiîate shade oni the anterior part of eachi segment. A siniilar, very
eveni substigmatal band, piîîkishi centrally ; the borderinig black shades
surround the spiracles and are larger ai-d more diffuse than those above
the subdorsal batid, but very fainit oni the tlioracie segments. A fainit,
eveni, lateral.band, paler tlian the gro und colour, whlich is probably sonie
slîade of green in living specimens. Spiracles wvhite, the p)air on joint 12

larger than the others. Thoracic fect testaceous.

Pipa.-This seenis not distinguishable froni that of othier species of
Collas. Thorax large, tlîe back arçlhed and cases proninient; abdomeni
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