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WIREWORMS AND SKIJACKS.-(Knoiledoe.)

BY E. A. BUTLER.

In turning up the soul round garden plants, we sometimes
find a stiffish, elongated, shiuy, yellowiah-brown, worm-like
thing, about the thickness of a stout pin, aud about three.
quartera of an inch in length. Uuder the impressiom that any
living creature found in garden-soil is au intmuder that ahould
be summarily disposed of, we may proceed to eudeavour to put
these ideas into practice, ouly, however to fiud that this is not
quite s0 easy a matter as it seemed ; the thing is so stiff and
tough, that even a good liard squeeze seexus to rnake but lîttie
impression on it. This tough, worm-like thiug is a wireworm
(Fig. 1), and ao dire a foe is it to vegetation, that we are per-
fectiy justified in nîakiug ail efforts to despatch it. Ou éxam-
iuîng it more cloaely, we flnd that it is not tmuly cylindrical,
like a piece of wire, but somewhiat flattened beueath, and that
it is made up of a series of thirteen segments, placed in hune,
one behind the other. The first of th 'se is the head, and the
next three carry six short legs, one on each aide of each seg-
ment, with which the creature crawls along, trailiug tbe
rémaînder of ita body after it. The head is black, and is for-
niahed witb a pair of btout, trausveraely-movimg jawa, and a
pair of 'Short au teuunie.-

Wireworm8 are the larvie of varions kinda of beeties, called
"askipjacka " or ',click beeties," froni a peculiar of springing
up into the air, and at the sanie tume, produce a sharp clicking
aound. Skiî-jacks are narrow, elongate insecte, with short legs
and bard integumenta (Fig. 2 ' . The head ia amati sud
oftes mucli ,unk into the thorax, and carrnes a pair of long,
diatinctly jointed auîtenrnu ; the thorax is of large size, and,
roughly speaking, itore or less quadrangular in outline. sud
couvez above and beueath. The elytra or wiug-cases cover the
body, sud conceal a pair of ample membranous wiugs. Eaeli
ia somewhat triangular in shape, and they forni wheu closed a
strongly archcd, shield.sbaped surface ; they are usually
marked longitudinaliy with parallel grooves or fnrrowa and
covertd more or leas deusely with. short haire. The under.
surface also is strongly convex, sud the legs are short, and
capable, like the anteuxie, of being folded close up to the body.
Wli thus comipactly folded np, the insect mayeaaily be mis-
taken for a piece of stick or earth. When surprised or alarmed,
it will thus feizu death, relaxiug its hold of what it nmay have
been clingimîgz to. and falliug to tbe ground, as often'as not, on
ita back.

Now usually, wheu a beetie gets into sucli a position, it
frantically waves its legs about till one of theni by chance
atrikes the gronnd ;then, seîzing any irregularies of surfase
with the shaip claws at the end of its feet, sud aasistiug itself
with the end of its shanks, it levers itself over sidewayA. But,
owing te the couvexitv of its back sud the ahortuesa of its
legs, a skipJack is unable to use this method, unleas there hisp.
peu to be close to it some objects of sufficieut heiglit te be
reached by its waviug legs ; failing this, however, it would lie
were it flot for a remarkaule contrivan ce, as helpleas as a turtle
in a aimular position, sud would stand a good chance of being
doomed to continue ils nnavailing stmuggles, at the mercv of
any paasing foc, till exhanation ended ita woea b~y desth. The
contrivance is as f ollows :-The hiuder edge of the thorax is
produced in the middle uuderueath into a long curved blunt
apine, which is received into a little pit at the base of the body.
The thorax is loosely articulated to the abdomen, and an
lie freely moved up sud dowu like the lid of a box on its binge.
When on its back, therefore, the skipjack arches ita body hy
bendiug its thorax bdekwarda, sud ao, balances itself on the
two txtremities (f its body ; this movement relea8s froni its
hollow the spine above referred to. Haviug astretched itacîf to
the utmost in this attitude, the insect suddenly sud Iorcibly
rebumes its former aupine position-a movemeut which. bas the
efl'ect of causi -g i t to reboun d troni the gronnd sund shoot np-
wards into the air to the height of several inches, at the sanie
tume bringing the opine back into its sheath with s sharp
clickiug uud. Ou returuing to the grouud, the iusect generally
managea to land itself right aide up ; if not succesaful the tirât
time, however, iL reuews the attempt, sud continues skipping
tilt the desired reanît is obtained.
'About 60 species of skipjacks beiong to the Britisli Fanna,

sud tliree or four of theni, browniah insecta belongiug to the
genera Athous sud Agriotes are exceedingly com mon ; the latter
genus furnishes the mosn destructive wireworuis. Iu their
larvai existence they are subterranean iu habits, living for
several years a littie below the surface sud spending their time

in devouring the roots and underground stems of plants, and
thus, of course, doing much more harm than can be rneasured
by the amount of matter actually devoured. In the winter
they retire to a greater depth, descending farther and farther
as the frost inceases, and pausing in their depredations only ini
the coldest weather. Thev devour ail kinds of agricultural
produce, destroying both root, grain, and fodder crops. Carry-
ing on the ravages as they do in the complete obscurity of sub-
terranean life, they are rarely detected when at work, and the
first evidence that the fatal work lias been doue is seen in the
apparently causeless withering of the plants.

St is f(Jrtu(ate that creatures so destructive have natural
enemies. Anîoug the most important of these is the mole,
which devours the larvoe with avidity. It is aided in, its praise-
worîhy efforts by several kinds of* birds, such as rooks and
lapwinga. A variety of artificial remedies have been propised
for checking the spread of the mischief, sncbi as the application
of liquid manure, which bas the twofold effect of atrengthening
the plants that have not been irieparably injured, and driving
away or killingy the wireworrns ; paring off a thin coating of
the soil, which will contil mobt of the insect8, and then bum'-
iog it ; imbedding in the soul at short distancea apart slices of
carrot and turnip to serve as traps, and then examining thelu
and destroying the wireworms every other day. The latter
method bas been found serviceable in hop-grounds, as mauy as
150 wireworms having been trapped close to a single hop-hill.
It should be remeînbered in this conuection that the abundance
of many agricultural pests is due in great measure to man bini'
self. We greatly increase the supply of anitable food for these
creaturps, aud in other ways make the surroundings more and
more favourable to their existence, and we need not wonder,
therefore, that the inevitable resuit follows, and that the addi,
tional task devolves upon us of devising means to ýounteract
the excessive development we have ourselvea unintentionalY
occasioned.

The group to which these insects helong possesses a fe'w
British rt-presentatives of considerable brilliance in colourin',y
but they are far surpasaed, both in beauty and in size, by exotio
forins, some of which are amongst the nost brilliant of all
beetles. To this group, also, belong the well-kuown and re-
markable Fire-flies of the West Indies, not to be coufonnded
with the Lanteru-flies, which are members of a widelv-differeflt
order of insects, the Homoptera. The light emitted by fire-
flues proceeds froru two patches on the thorax aud froni othel1
coucealed beneath the elytra wheu they are closed, but reuI'
dered visible when tbey are spread for flight. An old writer,
Pietro Martire, gives the following quaint account of a method
of catching these crvatures ''"Whoso wanteth cucuij, goeth
out of the bouse in the first twilight of the night, carrying a:
burning firebraude in bis hands, and asceudcth the next hillock
that the cucuij may see it, and hee swingeth tbe firebrande
about, calling cucuius aloud, aud breaketh the syre with ofte]3
calling anil crying out 1 cucuie, cncuie l' Mlany simple people
suppose that the cucuij, delighted with that noise, come flyiug
and flockiug together to the bellowing souind of him that
calleth theni, for they corne with a speedy and headloug course,
but 1 rather think that the cncuij make haste to the brightnless
of the firebrande, because swarmes of gnattes fly into everl
light, whichi the cucuij eat in the very ayre, as the martlets sud
swallowes tloc. Some cucuins sometimes followeth the flre'
bran de, and lighteth on the grounde ; then he is easily takeD2,
as travellers may take a beetie, if they have need thereof,
walking with his wings shut. In sport or merrimeut, or to the
intent to terrify sucli are afrayed of every shadow, tbey 89Y
that many wan ton, wild fellowes sometimea rubbed their faces
by riight with the fleshe of a cucuins, being killed, with pur
pose Io meet their neiglibours with a flaming ccuntenance, s5
with us wanton young men, putting a gaping vixard over th61it
face, endeavour to terrify bildren or women who are esSil
l'righted."

MONsTER RussiAN BRIDGE.-It is reported froni Rus8'
that the question is being agitated of counecting çronstldt
and Oranienbaum hy a bridge a at cost of 2,400,000, Th"O
structure is to rest upon granite pîllars flxed by the caisso
method, each of theni protected froni the action of the wale'
during the prevalence of aouth-weat -sinds by an angular Wall'
like guard of atone. The bridge will be about five miles$ '1i
leugtb, and it is expected to be completed by 1889. Whon
fiuished-if it ever ia finisbed -it will consist of two parts
railway and a foot-bridge.
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