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because Mr. Dupuy was representing the
United Kingdom in an officiai capacity at
Vichy. If you ask rne wby I say that, my
answer is that I find that some erroneous
statements and declarations have been rnade
about Marshal Petain, the bead o! unoccupied
France during the war. He was treated just
the same as if be had not; been recognized by
tbe United States, by Canada and unofficiaiiy
by the United Kingdom. As those facts must
be true, and I use the evidence of Winston
Churchill bimseif, I wonder wby people do
nat; admire the old man who bas done his
best ta save the largest possible number of
lives of bis countryrnen? Who could bave
done any better than be bas done ta save the
lives of Frencbrnen wbo were there? It was
a sacrifice for bim ta accept that position at
bis age. Not oniy that, but rny colleague the
bon. member for Bonaventure (Mr. Arsen-
ault) the other day made a speech about de
Bernonville. I do not know bim. Ail I know
about bimi is what bas been said in tbe bouse
by tbe bon. member for Bonaventure. Those
who complain about bim do not know any
more than does the average citizen. It is easy
to utter abominations against any rnan. Who
are the Canadians who bave died on account
o! de Bernonville? Why do we not bave the
names? Tell us who tbey are. It is said
tbat Canadians bave been kiiled on account
of de Bernonville, but no name is given. Wbat
is most important, Mr. Speaker, is that be
bas been condemned in bis absence by the
court of Toulouse, and Toulouse is a city of
France whicb is in compiete contrai o! the
communists. Recently there was a seizure of
arrns there. We hear denuinciations by the
communists; and when a man is attacke by
tbe cornmunists, everybody is credulous
enougb and naive enougb ta say, "Let's get
rid of bim"~.

The behaviaur of tbe former French am-
bassador ta, Canada on tbe question of de
Bernonville was shameful. I do nat know
wbat was the matter witb him but let us
remember at the present time France can
expect mucb more from Canada than Canada
can expect from France.

In referring ta the estirnates a manient ago
I tbaugbt of one tbing. Sa far as external
aiffairs are concerned it is nat s0 much the
Department o! External Affairs whicb is the
rnost important. It is the Departrnent af
Citizensbip and Immigration. I congratulate
the new Minister of Citizenship and Immi-
gration (Mr. Harris). He must realize tbe
importance of the tasks tbat bave been
assigned ta, hlm by the Prime Minister of
Canada (Mr. St. Laurent). He must educate
those wbo are not real Canadians, wbo rnay
be good citizens but wbo bave not in their
bearts a real pride in their country, and
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who do flot yet consider Canada first when
rnatters of importance have to be decideËL

I noted what the leader of the C.C.F.
group (Mr. Coldweii) said about the men-
tality of Anthony Eden. He said it in a
discreet maanner but I was in agreernent
with him. When I think of the progress that
the Conservative party bas made witb regard
to a Canadian spirit since the present leader
of the opposition (Mr. Drew) bas been at its
head in the house I arn surprised. I neyer
expected that to happen, and I say that
sincerely. For a time I thought the great
division between the party would be on the
one hand a Canadian party and on the other
band a party carnposed of imperialists, al
those who have an inferiority compiex, com-
munists, everybody. Now I see there is pro-
gress, and I congratulate the leader of the
opposition and the leader of the C.C.F. graup.
I see that there is some progress being made
in the other corner aiso. Let as be Canadians;
let us be proud of our race and o! our great
country and let us not be frightened by the
faise declarations that are made by sorne
people who cannot support tbem.

Mr. Knowles: No progress on your side?

Mr. Pouliot: This is a good sidýe; corne over.
As I said, this is a new era. It is a compiete
change, and hon. rnembers know that very
well. That is wby I arn prouder than ever
af rny party.

Mr. Johnston: You bad better be careful
or you will not stay there. You wiil be over
here again.î

Mr. Pouliot: No. I say there is progress,
and no one is rnore biind than be wbo wil
flot see.

Mr. lCnawles: The bon. mernber ougbt ta
know.

Mr. Pouliot: The bon. rnember for Bow
River (Mr. Jabaston) is too clever, too bright,
and has too rnucb experience in poiitics to
deny it. He would not deny evidence. 1
wiil not inisist on it. I arn just about finished.
I rely on the spirit of justice, patriotisrn,
dignity and pride a! the new incumbent o!
the office o! Minister of Citizensbip and
Imrnigration not to do something that he
wouid regret ail bis life. I thank you, Mr.
Speaker, and I thank the bouse for having
been so kind ta rne once more.

Mr. L. T. Stick (Trinity-Conception): Mr.
Speaker, it may be a task for a new rnember
a! the bouse to address this gathering on the
question of external affairs. Much bas been
said about the eastern situation during this
debate. The complaint has been made that
we do not receive sufficient information on
foreign affairs sa that we rnay inteiligently
debate the issue. At first sight we rnay be in


