
lReceitt occturrexceet
The Hon. Williarr.Glenholme Falconbridge, jus-

tice of the High Court of judicature for Ontario,
has been adlvanced to the dignity of Chief justice of
the Queen's Bencli Division. (Ontarian Famililes, ii., 47.)

Lieut.-Col. William-Dillon Otter, commanding 2nd
Bat. Royal Canadian Regt. serving- in South Africa,
has been promoted to be Colonel. (0..tarian Familles, i., ioi.)

This is the first instance since Confederation of
promotion of a Regimental Officer in the Militia to
that rank.

MARRIED, 6 June, Henry-Pery-Ranftirley Temple,
son of Robert-Handcock Temple, to, Lillie-Louise, dau.
of J.-?. Ridley oï New Orleans. (Ante, P. 4-2.)

MARRIED, 9 June, Henry-James Chewett, C. B., to
.Alice-Isabella, dau. of the late J.-G.-N. Ward of Yat-
ton Court, Co. Hereford, Eng. (Ontarian Families, ii, 79.)

MARRIED, 23 June, Charles-Christopher Riordlon, to
Amy-Louise, dau. of the late Rev. Charles-Williamn
Paterson. (Ante, p. 9)

MARRIED, 27 June, Alexander-Dobbs Cartwright,
Barrister-at-law, to Ada-Elizabeth-Seymour, dau. of
the late Lucius Hart. ;0ntarian Famnilles, L., 64.)

MARRIED, - Sept., John-Shirley Denison, Barrister-
at-law, to Maud-Beithi, dau. of James-B. Fairbairn of
Bowmanville. (Ontarian Famnilies, i, iii.)

MARRIED, 12 Sept., Phineas-DeVere Hunt, of Cran-
brook, B.C., eldest son of the Rev. Phineas Hunt,
Rector of St. Kevin's, Dublin, Ireland, to Maggie-
Glen, dau. of the late John-11. Bruce, Barrister-at-law,
of Hamilton. (Ante, P. 7-5)

MARRIED, 20 Sept., Robert-LanglIey Porter, M.D.,
of London, England, to Antoinette-Louise, dau. of the
late Thomas-Street Plumb. (Ontarian Families, L., 176.)


