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besides, an invitation ta iinperfect orcier thii
the devotional exercises be saînethîng ro
prelude te, the other business of the meeting
of Christ is nothing, if not aggressive and i
ont meetings have no point or >purpose, if
not ini direct obedience ta His farewell corc
there is no business under heaven concernii
of which we cau wait upon HRa with grea
being heard and helped than in our work
Gospel te others. Let our selectiens for Sc
be suchi as wilI deepen this conviction, stren,
in the ultiniate and complete triumph of Hi
encourage us in our sometinies discouragi
deavoring to promote that triumph, and w
,prayer we will feel no necessity for the
saints or virgrn;- we will be in close4t t
whose servants wve are, and with whoin il

help, "Whether with many, or with ther
power." One great secret of success in ini
is ta employ theru, and the President 'will f
cise an opportunity of engaging a goodly pi
meinhers, especially if fthe have prepared,
wise te do oocasionally, a number of se
Soripture bearing on the points alreadj
which case all may take part in reading th
ing of the minutes, whioh seems ta be genei
exercise, only to be tolerated for the sake
a business standpoint, need not neoessarily
oharacter. The Secretary, by the applical
judicions thought, may iinpart almost as
them as was pseedby the meeting of'
record, and miay make their reading a, profi

Aiso it goes without maying that 'n this,
else read or spaken, the reader or speaker
a position, and speak with sach distinetness
heard by every one present.

In san-e measure these remarks concerru
will apply ta the next two itemns ini thei
-the reports of thie Treaâurer and Oorrespc
Concerning the latter, which cansists largei~
tion of letters frein the varions fields of
hinted, as in regard ta the devatianal exerc
terest taken in ' the meeting may be promo
of the work of reading them. Ta niake th~
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