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Sec. 13. No person sliall draw water from the River St
Lawrence for the purpose of selling the same in any part of
the City.

Sec. 14. No person shall use any Hand Hose for sprinkling
the streets or for any other purpose, unless such person shaU
have previously obtained permission from the Water Com-
naittee so to do, and paid the rates charged for such permis-
sion m the said Tariff; and in no case shall the said Hose be
used for sprinkling or watering the streets, between nine
o'clock in the forenoon and five o'clock in the afternoon; nor
shall any such Hose be used by bui'ders or contractors, or
any person in their employ, for sprinkling or watering bricks
or V ^her building materials.

Sec. 15. No metre shall be used for determining the quantity
of water supplied by the said works, unless the same shall
have been previously submitted to and approved by the said
Superintendent.

Sec. 16. The several rates enumerated and specified in the
Tariff contained in the subjoined schedule, shall be and the
same are hereby imposed for water to be supplied from the
Water Works of the said City.

Sec. 17. The said rates shall be due and payable to the City
Treasurer, in advance, on the fifteenth day of August every
year, by the occupant or lessee, or occupants or lessees of all

buildings, parts of buildings, or tenements in the said City,
supplied with water from the said works, as well by those
who shall consent, as by those who shall refuse to receive the
water pipe to supply the said water, or to use the same.

Sec. 18. A discount oijive per cent, shall be allowed to all

water tenants who shall pay the said rates on or before the
fifteenth August in any year.

Sec. 19. /L'l charges for specific supplies, or for fractional
parts of the yciir, shall be payalle in advance, and before the
water is let on.

Sec. 20. In all cases of non-payment of the rates imposed by
the present By-law for thirty days after the same are due. the


