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way equal to the best of their confreres.
Amîong the prominîeint members of the

inedical profession in Chicago, are num-
bered nany Canadians, soi-e occupyi ng
positions on the fLculities of the colleges
and hospitals. Of the homœopaths we
met Prof. J. R. Kippax, M. 1). formerly
ot Toronto, who has achieved a national
reputation as an authority on diseases of
the skin, in addition to being weil known
through his writings on fevers etc.
From a very large and luerative practice
he takes time to attend to the duties of
secretary of the Chicago lomœoeopathie
Medical College, the plhenomn )al suc-
cess of which institutioii is largely due
to his efforts. Dr. J. E. iletherington
professor of Physiology in the sane cel-
lege is an old St. John, N. B. boy who
las earned an enviable reputation as a
teacher. He lias built up a finepractice
on the fashionable West side, rivaling
that of many of the obler practitioners.

The Chicago Homweopathie Hiospital,
adjoining the college, and directly op-
posite Cook (ouity Hospital is one of the
model snall hospitals in the country.
It's capacity is about 35 patients, or the
same as our own institution and it's in-
come averages over 1,600 per mnonth.
The greatest surgeons of the humoepa-
thie school are on its staff ami it's iedi-
cal advisers are the most celebrated in
the country. Many valuable improve-
ments have been made in it's appoint-
ments and equippage, notable amîong
then being the private operating room,
complete, compact, and admirably suit-
cd to the hospital's requirenients. The
hospital is presided over by Miss Han-
sen, to whose untirinîg energy, and clever
executive ability the success of the insti-
tution is mainly due. Dr. W. S. White,
the Superintendent, has certainly reason
to be proud of what has been accon-
plished during his tern of office.

Hahnemann Hospital on the South
side was also visited, where we were
courteously received by the Superin-
tendent, Mr. Burt. This hospital is the
adjunct of old Hahnenann College, is
about as large as the Montreal General

Hospital and, as it is hardly finished yét'
is, of course, one of the mnost modern
equi)ped in the world. Some of the pri-
vate roons, lookingout on Lake Michigan
are marvels of elegance and confort.

h'lere are private operating roons on
each floor, completely appointed. The
public wards furnish the patients for the
college clinies at one of which it was our
good fortune to see Dr. Il. I. Chislett per-
forn a difficult operation of the kidney.
Dr. Chislett enjoys the reputation of
being one of the quickest and neatest
operators on the Cook County Hlospital
staff and is regarded as one of the coming
su rgeons of ti tine. Halinemann Hos-
pital, is, we think, the best equipped and
apl)oitited homoeopathic hospital in
Anerica aînd equalled by but few insti-
tutions of the old School.

The district surrounding Cook County
Hospital is one of the greatest nedical
and surgical centers in the world, there
being seven niedical colleges bordering
on the square and containing nearly
'2500 students. There are four other
hospitals, muaking the total number of
patients cared for in tle district about
1500, exclusive of the dispensary cases
of which there are nearly 60,000 per an-
nuim. Thendllinois Traiing School and
Nurses Home with it's 250 nurses is also
in the vicinity, as are the public and
high schools with 2000 pupils. By tak-
ing in the different colleges and hospitals
one may attend a continuous medical or
surgical clinic for six days per week and
observe every known forni of disease.
and treatment. The constant clanging
of the ambulaice bells, the flitting by of
wonien in striped uniforrrs, the little
knots of men on the corners discussing
Senn's, Murphy's, Fenger's or Pratt's
latest operation and the air redolent
with chloride of lime and iodoform
mnakes one wonder if this can possibly be
Chicago and not Vienna or Berlin.
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