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There has just been published the report of the De­
partment of Mines, of Quebec, on mining operations 
during 1917. A preliminary report by Mr. Denis, pub­
lished in March, gave a summary of the production 
during 1917. The report includes information on as­
bestos, copper and sulphur ores, iron, chromite, zinc, 
lead, molybdenite, gold, silver, magnesia, mica, kaolin, 
antimony, graphite, mineral paints, building materials, 
silica, peat and coal. Particularly interesting and useful 
are the accounts of development of “war minerals.” 
Quebec has important deposits of chromite, molyb­
denite, magnesite and pyrites, and these deposits are 
being worked very successfully, and Quebec is making 
an important contribution of minerals for munitions.

THE ADVISORY COUNCIL’S REPORT

The Department of Mines has just published two 
reports that will he of special interest to those engaged 
in developing mineral resources of Northern Manitoba. 
Memoir 105 ; The Amiek-Athapapnskow Lake District, 
hy E. L. Brnce, and the Summary Report, 1917, Part D, 
hy E. L. Bruce, F. J. Alcock, J. R. Marshall and W. A. 
Johnston, are full of information on the mineral re­
sources of Manitoba.

There has recently been much talk over proposals to 
establish in Canada, institutes like the Mellon Institute 
of Pittsburgh and the Bureau of Standards, Washing­
ton. There can be no doubt that these institutes are 
doing very valuable work in the United States and that 
we should have had similar ones here years ago.

Approval of the proposal to establish a central re­
search institute in Canada is contained in the report of 
the Advisory Council for Scientific and Industrial Re­
search just published. According to the press despatch 
which contains this announcement, the Advisory Coun­
cil has discussed the matter at great length for the last 
nine months and the chairman has, on several occasions, 
consulted collectively and individually the heads of 
the various technical bureaux in Washington on the 
subject and a majority of the members of the Council 
visited Washington to discuss the matter.

Apparently the Advisory Council has profited by its 
own preaching. When first appointed, some of the 
members took great delight in talking about subjects 
of which they obviously knew little. If they had had 
the good sense to consult the technical heads of Cana­
dian bureaux, as they have since done, those of Wash­
ington, they would probably not have been so çareless 
in their statements. Fortunately, they were correct in 
their main argument : that Canada will benefit by pay­
ing more attention to the application of research to 
industry. They have themselves demonstrated that 
research is good for Advisory Councils.

The Advisory Council has important work to do and 
it has the assistance of men who can do good work. 
If the Council has thç ability to use to any appreciable 
extent the volunteer service that is represented on its 
various advisory committees, it should be an important 
factor in industrial development. While we have not 
been able to give the Advisory Council any great praise 
for its statements concerning industrial research in 
Canada, we still have hopes that it may eventually fill 
the place it occupies. If it can carry on a successful 
campaign for the establishment in Canada of research 
bureaux it will deserve our thanks, particularly if it can 
do so without spreading misinformation concerning the 
mining and metallurgical industries.

The Advisory Council, if we may judge from the 
publicity given to the subject, evidently considers its 
most important accomplishment to be the exploitation 
ol the lignite deposits of Saskatchewan. On the advice 
of the Council, the Dominion Government and the Gov­
ernments of Manitoba and Saskatchewan are spending 
a large sum of money on an experimental briquetting 
plant at Estevan, Manitoba. If this plant proves to be 
a commercial success the Council, together with the 
Commission of Conservation which has advocated the


