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carelessness. This is no imaginary dan­
ger, hut one which experience has many 
times shown to be very real. Let us 
make sure, then, that there be no relaxa­
tion from effort, that no contentment 
with the present interfere in the future 
development of our Alma Mater.

The result of the intermediate game in 
Toronto, while not a decisive victory, as 
had been hoped for, is yet very satisfac­
tory, and the team are to be congratulat­
ed upon winning the championship. With 
six of the seven players, and as many of 
the seniors, in college next year, there is 
every reason to hope that McGill will 
have a seven that, under Capt. Ramsey's 
guidance, will bring the championship 
back to McGill.

Hut, once again, congratulations to 
Capt. Scott and his team!

One feature of the Students’ Society 
meeting which is extremely gratifying to 
the editors was the report presented by 
Mr. McGougan on behalf of The Martlet. 
The college publication not only is self- 
sustaining, but actually has contributed 
between one hundred and fifty and two

hundred dollars to the Council. This sur­
plus will enable the editors next session 
to improve the quality of the paper in 
many details, and, if the students give 
the boards proper support, the finances 
should be in even better shape than this 
year.

The request of the editors for volun­
teers for Martlet work has not been an­
swered except by tv o students. Surely 
there an* many more who are kept back 
by mere, modesty, who, now that the ice 
has been broken, will come forward and 
offer their services.

We arc publishing in this number a 
letter from Mr. T. R. Davidson in reply 
to our editorial asking for criticism of 
The Martlet. Our correspondent’s re­
marks are, we feel, just, even where he 
most takes exception to the management. 
We are glad that one at least of our 
alumni has sufficient interest in the wel­
fare of McGill to state his opinions so 
frankly. If a few more would do the 
same our successors would have some 
really valuable material upon which to 
work when they endeavor to improve The 
Martlet.


