
CHURCH WORK.

safely descended on the deck; and
straighteningy himself up, with a
smile on bis face, ivalked to the
stern of the ship.

"'What did your go belowv for,
when ordered aloft ?" asked a pas-
senger of the brave boy.

III went-to pray, sir," replied
the boy with a blush, and a slight
quiver of the lip, as he turned
away.

W\ho aniong my readers are as
brave and thotughtftul in the time
ci danger or teml)tation ?

SUNDAY PRAYERS FOR 1883.

MO1RNING.
BLESSED LORD, wbvo as on this

hoiy day didst rise from the dead,
give us grace to risc from sin and
to live to Thy glory. Let us rest
from, wor1d1y work and worldly
care, and make us, O Lord, this
day joyful in Thy house of prayer.
Let us truly and humbly confess
our sins, and do Thou blot out al
those sins in Thine own preciaus
blood. Feed our bodies with need-
fui food, and our souls with the
bread of Thy Word. Give to mv
-Pastor, grace to preachi the Gospel
with zeal and su,.cess. By Thy
earthly Sabbaths prepare us for an
endless Sabbath above, where, with
the Father and the lloly Spirit,
Thou dost reign for ever. Amen.

LVEFNI NG.
We thank Thee, O Heavenly

Father, for the rest of another Sab-
bath, and before we lie down to
sleep, we give ourselves anew to
Thee. Forgive our wandering
thoughts in prayer, forgive Our
,coldness in praise. Lez the seed
of Thy Wtord wliich bas been sowvn
to-day spring Up in our bearts, and
bring forth a hundred foid the

fruits of the spirit-love, joy, peace,
lonDg suffering, gentleness, good-
ness, faith, meekness, temperance.
Let us live unto Tbee, and wvith
rfhee rise to cndless giory. G-rant
this for the sake oï' the Lord jesus
Christ. Amen. Our Father, etc.

THE SEVEN WORKS
MERCY.

0F

Boti/y.-
Visit, give drink, give meat, redeern the

slave,
Clothe, tenui the sick, and lay the dead

in grave.
Spiritual.-
Counsel, rebuke, instruct in wisdlom's

wvay,
Console, forgive, endure unmoved, and

pray.

Ti-iEc SEVEN DEADLY SINs.

1Pride, E nvy, Auger, Gluttony,
Covetousness, Lust, and Sloth.

THrE SEVEN GIFTS OF TUE HOLY
GHOST.

Wisdom, IJnderstanding, Coun-
sel, Ghostly strength, Knowledge,
True Godliness, The fear of the
Lord.

LE..soN. 11-TrE WoRD' NEED.

Q. Wý%hat was the condition of
the world wvhen Christ caine ?

A. It w-as fulil of ignorance and
sin.

Q. *WVhat were the chief races
or peopies 'i

A. The Romans, Grecians and
Jews.

Q. Whichi of theun had any
knowiedge of GOD?

A. The Jews alone.
Q. WhVlere did tlue Jeivs for the

înost part resid.e?
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