
We reaffirm that it is the duty of all the peoples of the 
Commonwealth to work together for the total eradication of 
the infamous policy of apartheid which is internationally 
recognised as a crime against the conscience and dignity of 
mankind and the very existence of which is an affront to 
humanity. 

We agree that everyone has the right to protection against acts 
of incitement to racial hatred and discrimination, whether 
committed by individuals, groups or other organisations. 

We affirm that there should be no discrimination based on 
race, corour, sex, descent or national or ethnic origin in the 
acquisition or exercise of the right to vote; in the field of civil 
rights or access to citizenship; or in the economic, social or 
cultural fields, particularly education, health, employment, 
occupation, housing, social security and cultural life. 

We attach particular importance to ensuring that children shall 
be protected from practices which may foster racism or racial 
prejudice. Children have the right to be brought up and 
educated in a spirit of tolerance and understanding so as to be 
able to contribute fully to the building of future societies based 
on justice and friendship. 

We believe that those groups in societies who may be especially 
disadvantaged because of residual racist attitudes are entitled 
to the fullest protection of the law. We recognise that the 
history of the Commonwealth and its diversity require that 
special attention should be paid to the problems of indigenous 
minorities. We recognise that the same special attention should 
be paid to the problems of immigrants, immigrant workers and 
refugees. 

We agree that special measures may in particular circumstances 
be required to advance the development of disadvantaged 
groups in society. We recognise that the effects of colonialism 
or racism in the past may make desirable special provisions for 
the social and economic enhancement of indigenous 
populations. 

Inspired by the principles of freedom and equality which 
characterise our association, we accept the solemn duty of 
working together to eliminate racism and racial prejudice. This 
duty involves the acceptance of the principle that positive 
measures may be required to advance the elimination of 
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