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EDMONTON -When Grant Net-

two of bis supporters fotced the
corduroy-clad 29-year-old to goto
thre tailor.
'if it meafts that much money, 1.
don't know if 1 want Q 6e leader,"
Notley moaned. As he was beng
fitted for Mwo sutshe looked at the
Wl1 and huge tears rolied dewn bis

Later, an NDP celleague would
take hlm aside and say, "Grant,
you're toc damn poor te 6e a
socialisti"t

Notley eventually won the lead-
ersip race he wâs being outfitted
for, but lie dld net finish bis long
catnpalgn te brinig a ignificant
social. democrat presence te the
Alberta leglature.,

He îd in aplane crash Justl19
mo>nths before his party would win
its Niest number cf seats in the
Alberta legilàture: 16, on May 8,

I ** a littie worrled that any-
thinÈ vvritten about hlm would tum
Um lito a saint," says La"yPratt, a
tJuOerly of Aiberta poIltalse-~
Sproýftr and a bru of the late

Imned, m dedded to pulMb
a coUltetin of essayson what
Notey kved bestpobtks.ý

For Soclaksm and Damocrcy In

of Grant NomeyPrawrsbaaiyan
NO? colleagues contributed chap-
ters on everything from "lIntraparty
DemnocracY' te "011, Clasu-and
Developmrü In Aiberta.". lb.
analysi is hard-bitln, the vlew ls
uromantir., ý

la researchigb4s capter, a 4mt
biographybf Netleyi Pratt,disco-
vered alnms forgotten aspects cf

After the DiefenbakerCoera
tiv sweep cf 19%8, the CG -

Ceoperative Commonwealth Fed-
eration -was lefr with eight federal
seais and an enckrsement frem the
Canadian Labour Congress.

1Disenfranchised and disenchan-
ted, the CCF and the CLC joined
forces to create the National Cern-
mittee for the New Party. Soon,

NeW flà-ty clubs- poppéd ido on
campuses across the country to the
dlagrin of llardline CCFer.

"Té people formihg the New
Party, polftics were more important
than Issues and ldeas," says Pratt.

But one CCG loyalit objected te
havine "middle class people srnoth-
ering his sociallst ideas.",'

The New Party ii#tative Wàs
eventuall successful, but divîsive.
A _CC think-tank in Edmonton
r0used for years to assodate wlth
the NDP abter the party's founding
convention i 1962

Notley's organizational aggres-
sien in the New Party campaoign
only prevlewed his tactical Ski,,.

"Netley was a good politiclan.
Even when the NDPwais net popu-
lar, Grant could reach outre m idi-
viduals and groups andger them te
feti they were important te hlm,"
Pratt says.

Despite Notley's personal popu-
larity, the NDP was chronically
unsuccessful at the, polils. Notley
was the lone NDP MLA from 1971
te 197, when Ray Martin,' the cur-
rent provincial NDP leader, was
elected in Edmonton Norwocd.

Effry election was antddpated as
"* he6reakchrough'> bwt for Notley
lt#iewer camne.

»Theoe are twe min reasons

eed " h is -Cçoemrvatfre.'
The Tories represented corpo-

was an Abeta UeutenantSover-
nor),,good organization, and the
rising urbmn middle chu. In Edmon-
ton " dCalgary.

Sut the Tories camne - and con-
ûlnwe -7 to symbjze the second
reason for the NPI, faillng in the
sev*nties the economki boom In

Nothingoucoe4eSsucces,7
or teaperanoe,'hereof. -that

wvasone Tf J'ès mottoes., The
trouble was the NDP did net to
wuccessfuli.
1"Notley belîeved if you can

demonstrate you're successful, that
you're on the rise and that you
were geing te 6e the next govern-
ment, people would join just
because et that," says'Pratt.

In 1984, the future for the NDP
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wà ibokns up . Aibettans *ete
outraged the economy was crash-
ingwhle the premier Was retlrIng.
Tbe t NDP was starting to took lilce a
viable alternative, and the political
climate was perfect for a break-

an lirecoverable setback, both by
political experts and the party faith-
fui. But the tragedy Just maid.e the
cemmnitted more determined.

1A yearard a hait later, the break-
rhrough came.

"Grant always expected there
woutd' be a breakthrdugh,'" says
Pratt. "But he would have neyer
predicted rhis.Y

The NDP Increased its poputar
vote f rom 19 to 29 per cent. it now
dominates the city of Edmonton
and even elected a member in his-
torically more conservative Calgary.

But because lower voter turnour
indicated people were actively not
veting for the Tories rather than
veting for the NDP, Pratt wamns-ali
16 seats are up for grabs in the next
election.

"The dange is the d coser the
NDPgSets te power, the more it will
start acting like other parties."

Pratt called Premier Don Getty's
Tories "oentre<right inte!ventiQnal-
W"f while voters see the NDP.as
being <cenfe-teft interventiona-

What's the differenoe? In bis
essay, Uof A politcal- science chair
Aflan Tupper wrtesthe 'Party must
enmphnire lts Socalist romi. Pratt

"Bêfore the NDP can emphasize
soclallsm, it has to become another
Party."

The hlerarcby of. the NDP is
pyrmidal, says Pratt, with the smal-
lest number of peoplejit the tep of
the power structure and the grass-
rgmSat the bottom.

Ie beuïn&emocratîc. TeNDP
could become more socialist if it
becamne more popular."

Abertas E4m"ntQnians'eés pe-
cially, are getting used te the new
MLAs. Norte cf the NDP MLAs are
asyet as popular as their late leader.

But the delegates at the Novem-
ber provincial NDP convention in
Edmonton, the first since'the break-
through', were stili punch-drunk,
elated, and unused to having so
much te cheer about.

Pratt's book was released in'rime,
te beceme a hit ar the conference,
te ne one's surprise.

lt's really important thar peqple
who lve and work ini a place know
semething about their history," lie
says.

"And it's the winners who write
the history."

coeWd. <Mn, ~ge4
Even though there may be prob-

Iems in the present educational sys-
tem, sucb as using theaverage stu-
dnt as a basis for the curriculum, 1

don't think that Peter Pocklingron's
ideas fer education would work
effectlvely. Mr. Pocklington should
recegnize how important social
involvemnent îs in the classroom,
and make himself more famiiar
wlth the present educational sys-
temn before he cordemns it as being
tee socialistic.
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