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When the British author Salmon Rushdie was threatened with 
death, the British Parliament rose in one voice to condemn the 
country that promoted violence in the death of the British 
citizen.

Not only has silence shown the world that our Canada does not 
care or show concern for its citizens, continuing silence will 
confirm to radicals, zealots and foreign powers that any Cana­
dian can be intimidated or killed without action from this 
government.

This government must show some backbone and speak out 
against threats of any kind against our Canadian citizens.

STATEMENTS BY MEMBERS

[English]

NATIONAL PAROLE BOARD

Mr. John O’Reilly (Victoria—Haliburton, Lib.): Mr. 
Speaker, my statement concerns the recent appointment of Mr. 
Willie Gibbs to the chair of the National Parole Board.

The Auditor General points out in his 1994 report that the 
method of hiring used shows a need for improvement and this 
was followed. Mr. Gibbs, a career corrections civil servant, was 
hired through a two stage selection process and face to face 
interviews.

This is the first time this type of appointment process has been 
held for National Parole Board appointments and we applaud it.

PROGRAM FOR OLDER WORKER ADJUSTMENT

Mr. Janko Peric (Cambridge, Lib.): Mr. Speaker, I would 
like to draw the attention of this House to a matter of grave 
concern to 22 of my constituents from Cambridge.

These constituents are former employees of Bundy Canada. 
They are all over the age of 55 and have received no income 
since they were laid off in 1991 due to problems with the 
program for older worker adjustment.

After numerous delays, my constituents are now being told 
that they must wait until the spring of 1995 for POWA designa­
tions and a resolution to this matter.

Many of these people have been forced to sell their homes, 
cash in their RRSPs and move in with other family members in 
order to survive. It is time that we returned some dignity to the 
lives of these people and relieved their emotional and financial 
distress.

I urge the minister to do whatever he can to encourage the 
Ontario government to agree to provide financial assistance to 
the affected workers under the current Canada-Ontario POWA 
framework agreement.

[Translation]

OCCUPATIONAL TRAINING
Mr. Maurice Bernier (Mégantic—Compton—Stanstead, 

BQ): Mr. Speaker, the fifth anniversary of the Forum pour 
l’emploi du Québec has been an opportunity to stress the 
importance of occupational training and the integration of 
young people in the labour market. That occupational training 
should be patriated to Quebec has been agreed for some time by 
all political, economic and social partners. Only the federal 
government is still turning a deaf ear to these demands.

The Minister of Human Resources Development will have to 
admit that local initiatives will achieve their objectives once the 
federal government has given the provinces full responsibility 
for manpower training.

Why does the minister keep interfering with this sector, when 
he cannot even get good results with the measures he dictates 
from Ottawa?

[English] VIOLENCE AGAINST WOMEN

Mrs. Rose-Marie Ur (Lambton—Middlesex, Lib.): Mr.
Speaker, November is Wife Assault Prevention Month in the 
province of Ontario.

Statistics Canada says that one out of every four rural Cana­
dian women is beaten. My riding of Lambton—Middlesex is 
primarily rural in nature. The fear and sense of isolation that 
every abused woman feels is compounded for abused women 
living in Canada’s rural areas simply because rural living is 
more secluded and women feel they cannot leave the farm and 
farm business in which they are partners.

There is help for abused women in Middlesex county. The 
Women’s Rural Resource Centre of Strathroy & area, which has 
offered protection for 200 area women over the last year, is also

PROTECTION OF CITIZENS

Mr. Myron Thompson (Wild Rose, Ref.): Mr. Speaker, the 
history of this government to protect our Canadian citizens has 
proven to be dismal.

Kenneth Walker, a Canadian businessman, is currently being 
hounded on dubious charges by the United States government 
and our government refuses to assist him.

Victor Ostrovsky, a Canadian author, listened while a zealot 
being interviewed on a morning news show called for anyone to 
murder Victor Ostrovsky.

Why is this government allowing death threats toward a 
Canadian author and a businessman to go unanswered?


