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own definition of just exactly what consti-
tutes pollution? 1 suggest that instead of deal-
ing with this as a problem of national urgen-
cy we will be dealing with it frorn ten points
of view, if indeed we are fortunate enough to
get agreement with ahl the provinces. That, to
rny rnind, is the basic weakness of this
legisiation.

The goverrnent of Newfoundland is a good
exarnple. It knew full well what it was doing
when it gave a financial inducernent to ERCO
to establish a phosphorus plant in Newfound-
land. It knew the consequences of a phos-
phorus plant located at tidewater. It also
knew that this province, backward economi-
cally with a large and growing problern of
unemployrnent, would have an industry pro-
viding jobs. So, Newfoundland turned its eyes
away from the immediate tbreat to the fisher-
ies of the province-the pollution threat to
the bay and the displacernent of the fisher-
men involved in that fishery-and went along
with the short-terrn advantage of creating
ernployrnent for two or tbree hundred people.

That is an example of how one province
rnight be expected to react. I cannot see for
the if e of me the province of Newfoundland
co-operating in any way, shape or forrn with
this governrnent under this bill if it interfered
in any way whatsoever with that province's
plans and efforts to induce industry to estab-
lish there. The same would apply to any other
province in the country. Certainly, it would
apply with a great deal of force to some of
the regionally disadvantaged provinces such
as New Brunswick and Prince Edward Island.

We have what I consider to be a maijor
weakness in the legislatîon in that it does not
even corne close to doing one of the things it
is supposed to do. Let me refer to a statement
issued by the Minister's office. It is suggested
the new bill caîls for the pooling of federal-
provincial resources across the country to
control and combat pollution. That is what
the proposed Canada water act is supposed to
do.

a (4:-50 p.m.)

I arn literally astounded at the manner in
which this governiment is treating this prob-
lern. There is no reference in the bll to the
contiguous waters of Canada. Notwithstand-
ing the immense threat posed to our coastal
waters by the opening of the oll reserves of
the Arctic and Alaska, the opening of the
Northwest passage to supertankers, the possi-
bility of oil being discovered and exploited on
the continental shelf on our east and west
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coasts and the disastrous consequences of
these eff orts in respect of the contiguous
waters, and indeed the whole ecological
balance of life itself, there is no reference
whatever to this. Indeed, the bill in my view
in its present form. is a useless ineffective
piece of window-dressing. It is a farce, noth-
ing more and nothing less. It tries to do what
the Fisheries Act now could do quite efficient-
ly and effectively if it were properly adminis-
tered. It is trying to do sornething in a puny
and ineffective way. I arn concerned about
this. I arn concerned about pollution. I arn
sure many people in this country are con-
cerned about it. Indeed, it is becoming a
world problern.

I arn concerned about this governent's
approach to this problem. There is a jurisdic-
tional haze; there is no question about that.
There is the Navigable Waters Protection Act
which is administered by the Departrnent of
Transport. There is the Fisheries Act admin-
istered by the Minister of Fisheries. There are
various measures which corne under the
Departrnent of Energy, Mines and Resources.
Indeed, there is quite a bit of ambiguity about
who bas the ultimate responsibllity. Surely,
however, the Fisheries Act is quite explicit li
setting out what Parliarnent at that time con-
sidered to be the responsibillty of the Minis-
ter of Fisheries. That responsibiity is to
ensure that the waters of Canada rernain
dlean. So, why do we have this bill? Why do
we have the legislation which is before us?

Mr. Gibson: There are different types of
waters in different parts of the country.

Mr. McGralh: Mr. Speaker, we have
already heard the subrnission of the hion.
member and rnost of us were unimpressed. I
suggest hie restrain birnself until I finish my
speech. There are other areas of pollution
which are not even covered by this legisla-
tion. We are concerned about this. For exam-
pie, we are concerned about the pollution of
the air. In this age of the Apollo when we can
reach the moon, we have yet to corne up with
an effective means to have a dlean automobile
engîne which will not pollute the atmosphere.
We are concerned about the pollution of our
environmient. No one seerns to be doing any-
thing about such tbings as the non-returnable
botties whlch are littering the countryside.
We are concerned about the pollution of the
high seas. We are concerned about the pollu-
tion of our coastal waters. In this House we
have been pressing the governrnent to state
its position on the conference which recently
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