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of Iearning. lis thiades, for example, against a
well-known Oxford professor, Egyptologist, AssYrioloý-

id what not, were hugely invlgoratiug. One had only
tJion his naine to bring forth scathing denunciations.
i was, if I may so, express it, a professional. and not a
Jhatred. Lt was as the bitter invective of the Poli-

mi the hustings who that same evening will dine con-
wlth the object of his attack. Ail the years that I

im 1 cannot recail one bitter word uttered iu general
ation against those Who compassed hi$ withdrawal
>erdeen. lus silence, indeed, about the great trial was
,tceable. Like the sua dial his mind only numnbered
ours. And so it was with those that used hlm despite-
rhe indignation of hie friends against W. C. iHenley
bout bounds. When Henley lay a cripple lu the wards
)Id Edinburgh Infirmary, gaining there the material

Inasterpiece "Ln Hospital," at Leslie Stephens' in-
Robertson Smith visited hlm, visited hlm frequently,
him, rnterested others in him, gaiued hlm emploY-
lIayed, in brief,' the good Samaritan to him-to b,
causelessly and cruelly lu the pagea of the Scot.man
years. It was a brutal returu, but Robertson' Smith,
.acutely he feit the treatmneut, bore it silently-iQr

e diseuss it.
1, too, ho had his national prejudices, of whieh per-
imost comlcal-in hlm, ilebralet a8 he was-was is
tional <Islike of the Jew--couPled with his admiration
eiduat Jews, and his love for the Tal~iud as8w011 al'
014 Testament. Muwch o! the philosophy and the
of the Talmud and of the rbiia oehdsn

o hssoÀ1. One DOSjdeetIrmme ere


