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The N. B. and P. E. L Methodist 
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Moncton, June 23.
The Eighth Annual Meeting of this 

Conference is now going on here. The 
first committee meeting in connection 
therewith was held in the vestry of the 
Church on Monday. It's duty was to 
consider the advisability of effecting jt 
closer union between this C onferefftje 
and that ofNova Scotia, and consisted of 
Rev. Dr. Pickard, Dr. Pope, Dr. Stewart, 
Revs. H. Daniel, H. McKeown, D. D. 
Currie, R. Duncan.

■ On Tuesday several committees met, 
the first being that of the Stationing 
committee, which is composed of the 
Chairman of Districts and one other 
Ministerial representative from each Dis­
trict. The business of this committee is 
to appoint stations for Ministers who 
may be removing to other fields of labor, 
and ip, we may say, of the utmost impor­
tance in the eyes of most of the brethren, 
clerical and lay, within the bouids of the 
Conference.

The Supernumerary Fund committee 
met in the afternoon. During its sitting 
theMiramichi District was referred to by 
the Rev. Dr. Pickard in the most com­
plimentary terms, on account of the in­
crease in the subscriptions of the brethren 
in aid of the Supernumerary Fund, and 
Its general satisfactory standing this year 
in relation to all the connexional funds of 
the Church.

The committee on Education also met 
in the afternoon. In the evening the 
Missionary committee held its first set­
ting. Several laymen were on this com­
mittee, the Miramichi District being re­
presented by Mr. J. J. Anslow. A slight 
increase was exhibited in the contribu­
tions in aid of the Mission fond, the re­
ceipts from the Miramichi District for the 
year being 8287.80 as against 8266.66 for 
the previous year. The nett receipts 
throughout the Conference amounted to 
85202.20 as against 84940.58 in 1880, 
showing a nett increase of 8261.62.

On Tuesday evening the Rev. W. Maggs 
conducted preaching service in the 
Church from the words—“ Whose heart 
the Lord opened.” He was assisted by 
Revds. J. V. Jost and G. M. Campbell.

At 7 a. m.on Wednesday Divine Service 
was conducted by the Rev. W. Harrison, 
who delivered an admirable discourse.

( The interior of the Church has under­
gone considerable change, the walls and 
ceiling having been beautifu lly •frescoed, 
which gives it a cheerful and beautiful 
appearance, and which reflects credit 
upon the congregation for the good taste 
and liberality displayed by them in 
making the pleasing change.

Wednesday, June 22.
Conference opened this morning, the 

President, Rev. E. Evans in the Chair. 
Proceedings commenced with singing 
hymn 753, “ And are we yet alive, Ac. 
after which the Rev. F. Smallwood and 
Qjt. _ rickuü ottered appropriât»» and 
beautiful prayers. The roll being called, 
about sixty ministers answered to their 
names. The number on the roll is be­
tween ninety and a hundred. Others ar­
rived after the opening.

The election of officers was then pro­
ceeded with. For President there were 
nine names balloted for. The choice fell 
on the Rev. D. Chapman, who received 
32 out of 55 votes cast, the next in order 
being the highly respected Chairman of 
the Miramichi District, Rev. S. T. Teed, 
who received ten votes. The President 
elect, who is beloved by all the brethren 
was greeted with applause as he ascended 
the platform, where he received a cordial 
and true brotherly Welcome at the hands 
of the retiring President. «

The President Elect thanked his prede 
cessor for the kind words with which he 
had welcomed him to the chair. In all 
the Conference there was no man he 
would sooner follow, but knowing the 
great ability displayed by him in the dis­
charge of his duties he did so with feel­
ings of trepidation. He could truthfully 
say he esteemed it the greatest honor of 
his life to be elevated to such a high posi­
tion, which had been approved bv the 
brethren in such a hearty and spontane­
ous manner. He could say with all 
modesty he had never lifted a finger to 
obtain the position and when two years 
ago his name had then been mentioned in 
the same connection he could not have 
received a greater surprise had he been 
offered the Governor Generalship. While 
the lesson was being read he reviewed 
the past, and could truthfully say he had 
indeed in honor preferred the brethren. 
Owing to physical disability he was com­
pelled to decline the honor two years ago. 
and if not in bed taste, he would say his 
labors had been carried on in bodily 
weakness, and he had for some time been 
trembling upon the brink of retirement 
and, now having been called to this im 
portant position, the duties of which he 
would endeavor to discharge satisfactori­
ly, he felt that he could not stand much 
mental pressure, and asked the kind con­
sideration of the brethren. His earnest 
v vyer was that He who walketh among 
the golden candlesticks would be with 
the Co u’eie-ice in all its deliberations 
and that best of all—the brethren may 
realize that God is with us.

The Rev. H. P. Co' -perthwaite. M. A. 
was .e-el' ■ ed Secretary ; and Rev. R. 
W. Weddall, A. B., re-elected Journal 
Secy. ; Revds. H. R. Barker, A. B., and 
Wm. Harrison (re-elected) assistant 
Secretaries ; Rev. G. W. Fisher, re-elect­
ed Journal Secy. ; Revs. John A. Clark 
A. M., and Rev. B. Chappell, A. B., Let­
ter Writers; Rev. R. Knight, B. A., re 
porter for Wesleyan.

Votes of thanks were then passed to 
the ex-president for the able and efficient 
manner in which he had discharged his 
duties during his presidental year; also

-to the secretaries and their assistants
The usual annual Conference Praver 

Meeting was held from 12 to 1 o’clock 
the Revds. H. Daniel. Read, Jost, Evans 
Teed and Ackman taking part.

The Annual Missionary Merttno 
was held in the evening. The Rev. Dr. 
Pope presided. The congregation, led 
by a good choir, joined in singing that 
grand old hymn,
“ Jesus shall reign where’er the -sun Ac. 
After which prayer was offered by Dr. 
Pope. After introductory remarks by 
the President, the Rev. R. Dnrcan, the 
Secretary, read the Report, which referr­
ed more particularly to the Indian, the 
French and the Japanese work, as well 
as the work on Domestic stations in the 
North West territory. The summary of 
paid agents was 392 missionaries, 1 
native assistants, 28 teachers. 11 interpre 
ters. Total income 8131.204.26 ; expen 
diture, 8130,210, leaving a small balance 
in hand. The nett amounts raised in our 
Conference are as follows :—St. John 
District 8935.04. Fredericton. 8854.15 
Miramichi. 272.65. Sackville. 8775.68. St 
Stephen, 8323.83. P E. Island. 82040.85. 
Stirring speeches were made by Revds 
Mr. Dobson. Joseph Sellars, Howard 
Sprague (whose address was a most elo­
quent one) Mayor Dawson, of Charlotte­
town, and Mr. James White.

The following resolution was moved by 
Dr. Pickard and carried :—

“ That the thanks of this meeting are here 
by presented to the ministers and collectors

adult and juvenile and other advocates of the 
Society's claims ; to officers, teachers and 
youth "of our Sabbath Schools, and to all who 
have assisted in making up the income of oar 
Conference Auxilliary.

Dr. Pickard remarked that this was the 
best Conference Missionary Meeting he 
had ever attended. Closed with singing 
and prayer. Collection 815.

SECOND DAY.

Thursday, June 23.
As readers of the Advocate will not be 

interested in all the proceedings, I shall 
refer to the most important business at­
tended to each day.

Conference opened in usual form.
A telegram was read from the Nova 

Scotia Conference, asking for the ap­
pointment of a committee to confer with 
a committee of that Conference on mat­
ters relating to the Supernumerary Fund. 
The request was complied with.

The following were recommended for 
ordination, on Monday evening :—Revds. 
John F. Easty, C. S. Wells, Wm. E. 
Johnson.

The following are continued on proba­
tion :—Revs. D. D. Moore, J. W. Wad- 
man, S. B. Gregg. A. Bell, Thos. Pierce. 
Wallace B. Thomas and Alonzo McCulley 
were recommended to return to Sackville 
for another year. >

The following" were recommended to 
be received on trial :—Bros Clement 
Williams. Fredericton District ; Jas. W. 
Tait, Miramichi ; Frederick Black, Sack­
ville ; Samuel Howard, P. E. Island.

Rev. A. Haggerty, who has travelled 
three years, has on account of ill health, 
been compelled to retire from the Min­
istry.

On Question VII coming up the Presi­
dent said it was cause for devout thank­
fulness to God that there had been no 
death in the Ministry during the year.

Rev. R. W. Weddall was granted three 
months rest from serviçe to enable him 
to cr<«s the Atlantic.

ReEdwin Wills. Fredericton District, 
unable to continue ministerial labor, is 
added to Supernumerary list.

Rev. C. W. Dutcher, on account of de­
clining health, is placed on the same list 
one year.

Rev. J. J. Colter cCases to be a super- 
nnmer-ry, having by request of the Con­
ference, although health not altogether 
restored, consented to resume active 
work.

The announcement was made that Rev. 
Job Shenton is to be transferred from 
Newfoundland to this Conference and 
Rev. W. W. Percival vice versa, to take 
effect at the 'close of the present Confer-

ice.-
The Annual Educational Meeting 

was held in the evening. It was a most 
successful gathering. After singing 
hymn 927 and prayer offered by Rev. H. 
McKeown, Dr. Pickard, who presided, 
made few opening remarks.

The Rev. T. Deinstadt, Secretary, read 
the financial report of the Educational 
committee, which showed the total 
amounts contributed to the fond to be 
85820.58, which has been disbursed as 
follows :—
For examination and grants to Theolo­

gical Students, $3037 83
To Victoria College, Arts and

Thelogy, 800 00
Mount Allison College, 400 00
Montreal Theological College. '“00 00
To liquidation cf debt, 1182 75

they deserved. The subject allotted to 
tile last ramed Speakf r was the Model 
Teacher, a theme to which lie did justice, 
showing the qualifications requiied to 
make successful teachers and the great 
and uehlc work to be accomplished by 
those whose hearts were truly in the 
work. The choir sang during collection 
the Anthem “ Jesus, Lover of my Soul,” 
the opening teuor solo in which was 
taken by Mr. J. Auslow, the duct by Miss 
Humphrey and Miss McCarthy, the bass 
solo by Mr. Gesmer, the full choir joining 
iu the chorus. The meeting was an ex­
cellent one in all respects, folly up to 
previous anniversaries, and in keeping 
with the enthusiasm which has so far 
characterized all the meetings of the pre­
sent session thus far.

Miramichi District.
The second draft of appointments 

made by the Stationing committee lias 
been submitted to the Conference. The 
following are the appointments on the 
Miramichi District, which will probably 
not be changed when the committee meet 
for the third and last time.

Chatham—Stephen T. Teed.
Newcastle—Benjamin Chappell. A. B.
Derby—Isaac N. Parker.
Richibucto—Isaac Howie.
Gaspereav—O le to be sent.
This circuit has been added to our Dis­

trict, it being nearer to Richibucto than 
to any other circuit.

Bay du Vin—Samuel Howard.
Tabusint. c—John F. Esty.
Bathurst—Richard W. Weddall, A. B.
Campbellton— Cyrus S. Wells.
The Rev. Geo. Steel is named for Little 

York, P. E. I-, which is said to be a good 
station. Rev. D. H. Lodge is down for 
Mo nt Stewart, P. E. I.x Rev. S. Busby 
Gregg, B. A., removed to St. John 
(Courtney Bay.)

By Telegraph/;
Moncton, June 28th, 1881.

Last eveniqg Rev. Messrs. Estey, 
Johnson and Wells were ordained to the 
ministry. The service, a most impres­
sive one. was conducted by the President, 
assisted by other brethren, and witnessed 
by a large congregation. The charge 
was delivered by ex-President Evans. 
It was a profound, scholarly effort, and 
was made the subject of complimentary 
resolution in Conference to-day. Dr. 
Pickard, the mover, said that he had 
heprd charges In our own and other con­
ferences, and had never heard one that 
had given him so much satisfaction.

Rev. Clement Williams goes to Tabu- 
sin tac instead of Rev. Mr. Estey.

Rev. Mr. Chappell this morning offered 
h’mself for mission work in British Col­
umbia, so that Newcastle has yet to be 
provided for.

J. J. A.

Total, - 85820 58
liter the Pending of this stateir eut the 

audience had the pleasure of listening to 
one of the finest if not the best Educa­
tional address ever heard here. Prof. 
Burwash was the speaker, whose eloquent 
effort was frequently and deservedly ap­
plauded. Excellent addresses were also 
made by Rev. Job Shenton, Rev. D. D. 
Crrrie, and Rev. Geo. H. Cormish, of the 
London (Ont.) Conference.

THIRD DAY.

Moncton, June 24.
The Conference opened in the usual 

form. After the minutes were read, 
church membership and sabbath school 
statistics were read from the various dis­
tricts. The totals are : Church members 
on trial, four hundred and forty-five, an 
increase of thirty. Full membership 
seven thousand eight hundred and forty 
five, an increase of forty-two. Total 
membership in conference, eight thou­
sand two hundred and ninety, an increase 
of seventy-two. Preaching places, four 
hundred and three, a decrease of eleven. 
Sabbath schools—number of schools one 
hundred and fifty-four, decrease two; 

■Dtflcers eleven hundred and twenty five, 
deci ease six : scholars eight thousand 
eight hundred and seventy two, an in­
crease of three hundred and forty five. 
Connexional funds for the year are :— 
Missionary Fund, 85,202.20, an increase 
of 8261.62; contingent ftind $261.26, de­
crease 851.69. Supernumerary fond in­
cluding ministers’ subscriptions, $1.251.- 
93, increase 859.25. General school fond 
858.64. Circuit receipts 843,910.10, an in­
crease of 81,932.10. Educational fond 
8576.63 ; decrease 84.08.

Some of the proceedings of the Mission­
ary Committee came up for discussion 
when Rev. Mr. Duncan read the Report 
of the proceedings of the Missionary 
Committee. At the meeting of the Board 
on Tuesday evening Mayor Dawson, of 
Charlottetown, moved a resolution, 
which was carried 7 to 6, condemning 
the action of the Local Board in with­
holding from Summcrside and Little 
York the amounts granted to those Cir­
cuits for rent by the Central Board-on 
the argument that those ministers were 
still better off, as regards salary, than 
many of their brethren in other Circuits, 
and that the amounts so withheld be 
made the first claim on missionary fond 
next year.

There followed an animated discussion 
pro and con.

Rev. Thos. Marshall moved, seconded 
by Rev. D. H. Lodge, that the report be 
referred back to the Committee so as to 
be amended as follows : that after the 
words a forther sum be added to the 
Summerside Circuit and a substitution of 
the names of all other Circuits or Mis­
sions affected by the same rule of Con­
ference be added for the same purpose.

This also occasioned a lively discussion 
resulting in the following motion, moved 
by Dr. Pickard and seconded by Rev. 
Howard Sprague :—

“That the Missionary Committee be 
re<;nested to apply the same principle in 
regard to grants by the Central Mission­
ary Board for rent in the years of 1879 
and 1880 to all the Circuits concerned.”

Among other speakers the seconder of 
the amendment made a pointed and logi­
cal speech. He did not believe in throw­
ing back the report into the face of the 
committee. If they had not included 
other Circuits it was because no other 
places were named. They simply gave 
expression to the principle affirmed by 
the resolution. Some of the Island min­
isters showed that action in withholding 
rent had already had a damaging effect 
with reference to the funds of the church 
this year.

After some forther discussion the 
amendment was carried.
The Conference Sabbath School An­

niversary

wax held In the Church this evening, and 
was a most interesting gathering. The 
chair was occupied by Rev. Henry Daniel. 
Alter singing and prayer, the president 
made a few introductory remarks, and 
then called upon the Secretary, the Rev. 
Mr. Beyie. to read the report. (The 
principal figures in this report will be 
found above in the proceedings of Con­
ference.) The Secretary said that owing 
to all the reports not having been re­
ceived. there was an apparent decrease 
in the number of schools. He also stated 
that many of the schools were only kept 
open during half the year, which was 
much to be regretted.

The Rev. A. D. Morton—well known 
to our Miramichi people—who caHed at 
Moncton on hi- way home from the Nova 
Scotia Conference, delivered an address. 
The other speakers were Rev. I), D, 
Currie, and Rev. Geo. Steel. Ail the ad­
dressee were listened to attentively, as

Military Matters.
A good deal of busy preparation has 

been observed among military men for 
the past two or three weeks, and every 
effort made by them to make as good an 
appearance as possible at the camp at 
Sussex, which opened on Tuesday of last 
week. Full programmes of the various 
days’ proceedings have been published in 
the Provincial papers. The Camp ground 
is the Keltic Farm. Sussex, and its three 
hundred acres give ample space for the 
drill and evolutions of the 40f0 men ex­
pected to be in camp by Dominion Day. 
The Chatham and Black River companies 
under command of Major McCnlley, left 
Chatham on Tuesday morning by the re­
gular train and reached Sussex the same 
evening.

The Newcastle Field Battery of Artil­
lery went into camp here on Tuesday 
morning, the 21st inst., under command 
of Major R. R. Call, with Sergt. Major 
Hughes as drill instructor. Officers, non­
commissioned offices Ac.. are as follows : 
Major—R. R. Call.
1st Lieut.—R. A. Lawlor.
2nd" “ —C. E. Fish.
Surgeon—J. B. Freeman.
Vet. Surg.—James Brown.
Sergt. Major—R. L. Maltby.
Sergeants—John Morrisv. Henry Copp,

Cameron Smallwood, Thos. Dnffy. 
Quartermaster Sergeant—Thos. Duffy. 
Orderly Sergeant—Thos. G. Johnston. 
Trumpeter—Michael A. Qnigley.
Farrier—Oliver Williamson.
Collar Maker—Frank Griffin.
Corporals—Thos. Russell. Wm. Tushie,

John Halloran, Wm. Stewart. 
Bomhadiers—Hu-h McDonald, J. W.

Henderson, John McAllister. W. F.
Smallwood, John Mather, with 47 gun­
ners, 8 drivers and 29 horses.
Tents were pitched and camp made 

ready in the forenoon, and drill opened 
in the afternoon, though the weather was 
wet.

On Wednesday a long day’s drill was 
gone through in spite of the disagreeable 
weatner. About 10 a. m., the battery be. 
ing all in position for drill, an accident 
unfortunately happened to Major Call, 
about which various nimors were afloat, 
all making' out the accident to have been 
much more serious in its results than it 
fortunately proved to be. The Major’s 
horse was just brought to his tent when 
he ordered that the stlmip strap be short­
ened, which being done he mounted. 
After mounting, the groom observing the 
strap was wrinkled, gave it u sudden pull 
which jerked the Major’s heel' and spur 
into the side of his horse, a very spirited 
animal. The beast sprang suddenly to 
the right, throwing the Major who fell 
heavily to the ground. The fall was a 
severe one, and it was fortunate Major 
Call did not receive more serious hurt 
than a severe shaking. Some bandages 
were put on, and he was in the saddle in 
the afternoon. He still feels the effects of 
the fall, which has taken ail the usual vim 
out of him. yet he hopes to be all right 
by Thursday. 30th, the day of inspection 
in camp, so as to be enabled to perform 
his share of the duties, as well as to take 
part in the review appointed for Dominion 
Day.

Thursday was spent in the usual drill. 
On Thursday night Capt. Drury, of A 
Battery, Quebec, arrived by Northern 
Express, and on Friday the shot and shell 
practice was performed under his super­
intendance according to the rules and re­
gulations of the Dominion Artillery As­
sociation. *

The firing took place over the usual 
range of 1000 yards, the target bcin; 
placed at the head of the marsh just above 
Newcastle, the men firing from a platform 
at the railway crossing of the marsh road.

The following scores were made.
Bomhadier Smallwood, 20 points
Bombadier Tushie, 16 “
Sergt. Mnrrissy. ' 15 “
Bombadier Mather, 14 “
Gunner Wilkinson, _ 13
Gunner Russell, 12 “
Bombadier McAllister.
Corporal Stewart, 11 “
Gunner Beckwith. 11 “
Sergt. Smallwood. 11 “
Corporal Halloran, 10 “
Sergt. Dnffy. 6 “
Gunner McEweu, 6 “
Corporal Russell, 6 “
Sergt. Copp. 5 “
Bombadier McDonald. 5 “

< )ne shot went right through the target 
but the- fact was not discovered until after 
the firing, consequently the Battery gets 
the credit of the good shot, though the 
man did not. The competitors are select­
ed from the Battery to the nember of six­
teen and each fires five shots—2 solid 
shot, 2 sbrapnell shells from the 9 p. r.

and one common shell from the -24 p. r. 
howitzer. The scores do not look as 
good as heretofore, but this is owing in 
a great measure to the change of system 
in marking, making the possible score 
much less than under the old method. 
Capt. Drury left for St.-John by thj- ex­
press train on Friday night for St. John 
and is expected to return to Sussex to 
inspect the practice ol’ the Woodstock 
Field Battery. Battery drilled in field 
movements all the afternoon.

On Saturday morning the Battery was 
early at work, two hours’ drill being gone 
through before breakfast. During the 
rest of the day the usual drill was gone 
through.

The weather so far while iu camp lias 
been unpleasant not a day having passed 
without more or less rain.

The guns Ac., have been mounted < n 
new wheels sent down for the purpose, 
and not hefi re they were required, as the 
old wheels were getting shaky, making 
it dangerous work, especially over rough 
ground. The wheels we e painted in 
camp.

( In Sunday morning a number of the 
men marched to church ill St. James’ 
Church, where service was conducted by 
the pastor. Rev. Mr. Aitkeh.

On Monday morning the Battery was 
turned out at daylight, tents struck, and 
preparations made for departure per 
special train at 8 o’clock. The guns 
were mounted ou platform cars, men 
horses and camp equipage all on board 
when the hour arrived and with hearty 
cheers from those seeing them oil', the 
train of 12 cars started, reaching Monc­
ton at 10.5C o’clock, a. m, and Sussex at 
1.46 P- m.

International Sabbath, School Con­
vention.

Toronto, Ont., 24th June, 1881.
The Third International Sunday School 

Convention was held in Toronto, Out., 
being the first occasion on which Canada 
was selected as the country in which the 
meeting should take place. Hundreds of 
delegates from all parts of the "United 
States and Canada are present, including 
about half a dozen from the Lower Pro­
vinces. England also in the person of 
one celebrated speaker lias sent her greet­
ings, by way of return for the visit of 
Americans and Canadians to the Raike's 
Centennial held in Loudon last year. 
The object of the Convention is to pro­
mote S. S. activity and efficiency, especial­
ly such as is organized under the auspices 
of the International Convention. As 
Canada, otherwise than indirectly and by 
Its general adoption of the “ Internation­
al Scheme of Lessons,” is not yet in al­
liance with the Convention, meetings of 
the Canadian delegates have been held 
with a view of coming into line with the 
United States in this matter. The action 
agreed on so far. is the appointment of a 
committee representing the four different 
organizations of the Dominion—viz., the 
Canada S. S. Association of Ontario, the 
Canada S. S. Union of Quebec, and the 
istcr S. S. Associations of the Maritime 

Provinces and of Manitoba. This com­
mittee is charged with the work of cor­
responding with these several Associa­
tions and arranging a scheme ior a Do­
minion alliance. It is likely the matter 
will come up before the Lower Provinces 
in the S. S. Convention, to be held ill 
August at Woodstock N. 11. Contribu­
tions from all the States of the Union 
and the Province of Canada having been 
asked for, with a view to enlarging the 
work of the Convention, especially in 
respect to the International Lessons, the 
delegates from the Lower Provinces after 
deliberation agreed to represent 840 as 
an equitable sum to be paid by Nova 
Scotia and New Brunswick during the 
ensuing three years.

The meetings of the Convention have 
been held in the Pavilion of the Horti­
cultural Gardens, and have been well at­
tended. In the evenings the huge build­
ings has been filled to overflowing, the 
two tiers of galleries as well as the body 
of it being thronged with thousands. 
The sight is a very impressive one. The 
building is decorated with the flags of 
the various nations included iu the Con­
vention or receiving from it assistance iu 
S. S. work, and emblazoned from wall to 
wall with mottoes and Scripture texts, 
some of them very rich in Aheir adorn­
ment. The delegates are seated accord­
ing to their States or Provinces, so much 
space being accorded each such territory, 
and moreover wear a badge of red or blue- 
ribbon with tlie name of their constitu­
ency upon it. The interest has beeii 
well sustained, and very little time ex­
pended unnecessarily. Speakers arc 
limited to a few minutes each except in 
the evening meetings An efficient choir 
discourses sweet and artistically render­
ed music. Perhaps the ablest exhibition 
so far was presented last night in the 
Teacher's Meeting, conducted by Rev. 
Dr. Meredith of Boston. Certainly we 
have to learn much from the methods in 
use in the United States. The Conven­
tion is to close to-night, having been but 
three days in Session. The delegates 
have been all hospitably entertained by 
the good folks of Toronto, and yesterday 
afternoon availed themselves in great' 
numbers of an invitation extended by 
Colonel Gzowski to a garden party at his 
residence a little distance to the west of 
the city. A most enjoyable time was 
spent, admiring his garden, conserva­
tories, library, art gallery, and the 
numerous objects of interest lie so kindly 
threw open to the inspection of several 
hundred guests. It is confidently ex­
pected that tlie result of this stirring 
Convention will be an Increase tlirougli- 
out the Dominion of practical interest 
in and sympathy with the important 
work of the Sabbath Schools.

lust rated by Miss Burns to the satisfac­
tion of the members of tlie Institute, 
many members having never before seen 
the “ look and method” properly illus­
trated. The lesson was favourably cri­
ticised by Misses Hillock, Rainey, Des- 
Brisay, Burns, McLean, and Messrs. 
Cormier, Carruthers and Merscrcau. 
Miss McLean gave an object lesson on 
the sponge to the members of the Insti­
tute, bringing out the facts that the 
sponge is tough, porous, brown, not im­
pressible, but compressible, soft, elastic, 
opaque, colorless, inedible, etc. Criti­
cism offered by Mr. Silvain Cormier and 
others.

The Institute entered upon the con­
sideration of the course of Instruction. 
Discussion opened bv the President, who 
informed tlie members of tlie Institute' 
that he had purposely avoided asking 
ihcm for an expression of opinion on this 
object last year, as lie thought it rather 
premature but now that they; had been 
working under and lie hoped studying it 
for at least one year, lie exhorted them 
to give their candid opinion on its merits. 
Many members of the Institute spoke in 
favor of the course. Miss Ellen Burns, 
after a few remarks in which she charac­
terized tlie course as the charter of the 
teacher’s liberties, moved the following 
resolution :—Resolved, that tills Institute 
express its cordial approval of the course 
of Instruction for Common Schools pre­
scribed by the Board of Education. 
Resolution was seconded by G. AV. Mer- 
sereau in a telling speech, in which he 
maintained that the Teacher without the 
course, was like the mariner without a 
chart sailing in unknown waters, that it 
was an epitome of the best thoughts of 
the best educationists at whose feet we 
all might sit and learn for years to come. 
Mr. John Hornibrook, Trustee of District 
No. 8, New Bandon, agreed with the last 
speaker in every particular. Inspector 
Landry in the course of his remarks 
showed how difficult it would be for the 
work of inspection to be properly carried 
on without such an aid as the course, and 
that opposition in every case resulted 
from misunderstanding, and melted away 
before bis explanations, which confirms 
the remark in his annual report for 1880. 
After remarks from Misses Rainey, Hil­
lock, McLean, Mealian and others the 
resolution was adopted unanimously. 

fourth session.
Mr. J. C. Carruthers read a paper no 

“ Kleméntary Physics,” which was well 
received by the Institute. Favourable 
comments were made upon the paper by 
Messrs Mcrsereau and Landry. Inspec­
tor Landry then engaged the attention of 
the Institute in a lengthy amt instructive 
address on “ The object of Education and 
Method.” A mere outline of tills address 
is all that can be attempted. Education 
brings tlie man into the command of his 
faculties—their order of development; 
study of mental science recommended ; 
irrational methods deprecated ; sensation­
al method still somewhat practiced ; 
right and wrong methods contrasted ; 
mental picturing in reading lesson. 
Throughout his address Mr. Landry 
made frequent use of the Blackboard to 
illustrate right method with great effect 
in Reading aud Arthmetic. Mr. Onesime 
Blanchard in rising to comment upon the 
above outlined address said that he fol­
lowed with great pleasure and profit the 
various lessons^iven before the Institute. 
It was the first time that he had met the 
Teachers in council assembled and he 
would carry home with him the highest 
opinions of his co-workers iu cause of 
education. He was particularly impress­
ed with the value of right method in 
Reading aud Arithmetic as illustrated by 
I uspector Landry. He referred to the dis­
advantages under which the French 
Teachers laboured in not having text 
books in their own language, making it 
imperative on them to translate all or 
nearly all the work in the French Lan­
guage which entailed a great amount of 
work on the Teacher.

At the conclusion of Mr. Blanchard’s 
address Mr. Cormier moved the follow­
ing resolution which was seconded by 
Mr. Carruthers.

Whereas, The French Teacher of this 
Province is placed at a disadvantage in 
comparison with his English speaking 
brother inasmuch as he had few text 
books in his own language and

Whereas, We believe that the Board of 
Education is disposed to deal equitably 
with the French population of this Pro­
vince.

Therefore Resolved, That we as an In­
stitute respectfully urge upon the Board 
of Education the expedience of selecting 
and authorizing French text books in 
Reading, Physics, Canadian Geography 
and History. The resolution was unani­
mously adopted.

Mr. Fitzpatrick, Catechist of Clifton, 
addressed the Teachers in flattering 
terms.

Resolved, That the fifth annual meeting 
of this institute bt held in New Bandon 
school house in June, 1882. Invitations 
to attend the institute had been tendered 
to and accepted bv Rev. R. Doucctt, lion. 
R. A’oung. K. F. Burns, Esq., John Sive- 
wright, Esq., O. Turgeon, and others 
who were kept from doing so on account 
of stormy weather and bad roads.

Proceedings of Gloucester County 
Teachers’ Institute.

Pursuant to notice the members of 
Gloucester Co. Teachers’ Institute met 
in the Schoolhouse, Clifton, on Thursday, 
June 23rd, 1881. -

first session.
The Institute being called to order by 

President V. A. Landry, routine business 
was taken up. Election of officers re­
sulted iu the President and Secretary be­
ing retained in office, Mr. Onesime 
Blanchard being choseu as Vice-Pres., 
Miss Burns and Mr. Carruthers the other 
members of the Committee of Manage­
ment. The President addressed the In­
stitute at length, dwelling upon the fol­
lowing facts, viz.—The success of any 
undertaking depends upon the interest 
manifested in it by its promoters. The 
powerful influence for good these Insti-, 
tutes may be made to exert on thé teach­
ing profession. To raise the standard of 
the profession, and to elevate the whole 
character of education should he the aim 
of every earnest Teacher. In the Teach­
er’s profession above all others there is 
need of sympathy and mutual support aud 
counsel.

The subject, “ colour and hoiv to teach 
it,"was taken up by MissMcaliauof Bath­
urst. She divided the subject into three 
parts ; 1st, naming colours, 2nd, composi­
tion of colours by mixing water colours, 
crayons, Ac., 3rd, harmony of colors. 
An illustrative lesson iu each of the parts 
was given to a class of children in at­
tendance. The lessons were favourably 
criticised by Mr. Carruthers and other 
members of the Institute.

SECOND SESSION.
Mr. Mcrsereau illustrated his method 

of teaching Botany, using the members 
of the Institute as a class. Remarks 
were made on the subiect by Messrs. 
Cormier, Legere, Carruthers and Landry. 
Discussion on “ School Discipline” was 
at the request of the President opened by 
G. AV. Mcrsereau. who was followed by 
the President, Messrs. Cormier, Car­
ruthers and Legere, the chiei points-made 
being that the teacher should by frequent 
visitations make himself acquainted with 
the circumstances of his pupils and get 
tlie sympathy of the parents with him in 
his work : and that corporal punishment 
should only be resorted to In case of 
moral wrong or persistence iu wilful dis­
obedience, and even then with discretion. 

third session.
Reading lesson in Primer Class was 11-

Alliance, the relegation of the Branches 
to the Council, &c.

Signed by order of. the Council of tlie 
Alliance.

A. Vidal, Prcsideut.
A. Long ley. Vice Pivsidqnt.
J. R. Diiugai.l. Chairman of Executive.
George May. Treasurer.
Thos. Gales, Corresponding Sec’y.
John Wood, Recording Secretary.

Jos. McLeod, 1 Provisional Chairman A 
Geo. J. Bi.iss. ; Sec’y for N- Brunswick.

Educational Institute of New Bruns­
wick.

Tlie following Programme of the Fifth 
Annual Meeting of the above named In­
stitution will lie held in St. John on July 
12th. 13th and 14th :—

1st Session—Tuesday, 2.30 p. m.— 
Opening Exercises. Enrolment. Re­
port of Executive • Committee. Other 
routine business’, etc.

2nd Session—Tuesday, 8 p. m./—Public 
Address by William Crocket,1 A. M., 
Principal of the Normal School of N. B., 
subject : “ Educative Instruction.”

3rd Session—Wednesday, 9.30 a. ill.— 
Subject :—Course of Instruction for High 
Schools and High School Classes. Report 
of Special Committee oil the Course to 
be presented and discussed.

1th Session—Wednesday, 2.30 p. m.— 
Subject : Industrial Drawing,—Profes­
sor Walter Smith, State Director of 
Art Education in Massachusetts.

5th Session—Wednesday, 8 p. m.—Sub­
jects —(a) The co-operation of Parents, 
Trustees and the Community essential to the 
fullest success of the Teacher's work. Dis­
cussion.

(b) Compulsory Attendance at School— 
is it advisable and practicable? Paper by 
A. J. Denton, A. B., followed by dis­
cussion.

6th Session—Thursday. 9.30 a. m.— 
Subjects :—(a) Industrial Drawing,—Ex­
ercises by 1’hoe. Walter Smith, follow­
ed by free conversation.

(b) Tlie proper time for the Enrolment 
of Pupils for entrance upon the First Stan­
dard of the Course: Resolution to be pre­
sented.

7th Session—Thursday, 2.30 p. m.— 
Subject : Thw useful Minerals of New 
Ilrunswick,—Address by G. F. Matthews, 
A. M., with display of specimens.

Business :—Election of Members of 
Executive Committee. •*

Sth Session—Thursday. 8 p. in.—Sub­
ject : Industrial Art Education,—Public 
Address by Prof. Walter Smith.

Unfinished business.
The proceedings will be interpersed 

with music.
By order of the Executive Committee.

HERBERT C. CREfcl), Secretary?

iCS”1 Teachers being members of a 
County Teachers’ Institute, and School 
Officers other than Teachers, (including 
Trustees and their Secretaries), may be­
come members of tlie Educational Insti­
tute on enrolment and annual payment 
of one dollar.

It is hoped there will be a large attend­
ance.

Arrangements will be made for reduced 
fares on all lines of railways and steam­
boats iu the Province.

Temperance Convention.
The Dominion Alliance for the sup­

pression of the Liquor Traffic have issued 
the following in reference to a conven­
tion to be held in St. John on Friday, 
July 15, 1881 :—

The Canada Temperance Act was in­
troduced and carried through Parliament 
in 1878. It has since passed, the o •deal 
of the Courts, and has been pronounced 
constitutional;by the highest tribunal of 
the country. -.-The Act has been brought 
to vote in twenty-seven different Comi­
ties ami Cities, anti lias been carried in 
twenty-three of them, while many con­
stituencies are preparing to vote for it.

The Organization to which this Act is 
due in a greater degree than any other is 
the “Dominion Alliance,” formed in 
February, 1876, of which, from its in­
ception, the Hon. Alexander Vidal has 
been President.

The Alliance welcomes all to its work 
and membership, without prescribing 
any other tests than agreement with it< 
aims and objects : it works through a 
Council, formed of representatives from 
the various Provinces of the Dominion.

Each Province is expected to have its 
own Branch of tlie Alliance.

There jhre Branches already in Ontario, 
Quebec, Nova Scotia, Manitoba, and 
steps are being taken to organize in 
Prince Edward Island and British Co­
lumbia.

It is desirable that there should be a 
■’X ew Brunswick Branch,” principally 
with a view to the enforcement of the 
Canada Temperance Act that lias already 
been accepted by; vote of the people, anil 
to a closer connection through tlie Coun­
cil with those in other Provinces who are 
labouring for tlie same ends. An ac- 
i/uaiutHurc extending from the Atlantic to 
the Pacific, having one name, one object, 
and. where various Branches are acting to­
gether as far as concerns matters affecting 
the fkxminion at large, cannot fail if wisely 
and energetically managed to advance tlie 
cause of Prohibition.

We. therefore, on behalf of the Coun­
cil of the Dominion Alliance, ami with 
the approval of several friends of Tem­
perance and Prohibition in New Bruns­
wick, call a Convention, to be held ill the 
City of Saint John on Friday the 15th day 
of July next, commencing at 10 a. in.,— 
afternoon session at 2.30 p, m.,—for the 
purpose of organizing a Provincial 
Branch of the Alliance, electing officers, 

j adopting Bye-Laws, aud discussing ques­
tions of provincial interest and impor­
tance.

It is desirable that Scott Act Associa­
tions. Tempo ailed Societies (close and 
open), should send delegates, and that 
clergymen "nf all denominations and all 
wlm favor the work should attend.

I be Secretary ol' the Alliance. Rev.
1 bos. Gales of Montreal, with Prof. 
George E. Poster. Secretary of the On­
tario Branch of the Alliance, are ex :t- 
ed to be present to explain the charac er 
and scope of the work p oposed by the

Small Pox.
1 We learn that for some days past there 

lias been much excitement in Chatham in 
reference to some cases of small pox. 
It appears that a ship came into the bal­
last wharf with a man sick on board. It 
appeared to be the duty of no one tc en­
quire what was the matter, aud the ship 
had the usual number of visitors» The 
clothes were sent to a woman to wash 
and we are informed that this woman 
made tlie discovery that small pox was 
aboard. The sick man was sent by the 
Captain to the Marine Hospital at 
Douglastown, and Diy Thompson dis­
covering the nature of tlie disease, or­
dered him to be taken to the hospital on 
Middle Island/ After sending him there 
lie discovered that lie had no authority 
to do so and the man was returned to his 
vessel, wl e’ e another man had been taken 
down with tlie disease. It seems that no 
one had authority to interfere and a 
number of the inhabitants went to the 
vessel and threatened to cut her adrift 
if she was not taken out of that. A tug 
was summoned and she was taken to the 
anchorage at Middle Island and there 
placed in quarantine. Has Chatham no 
health officers? and did the Captain not 
'know that he was liable to a heavy 
penalty by coming into port with any 
contagions disease on board. Somebody 
has certainly neglected their duty and the 
people of Chatham has run the risk of 
having small pox spread almost broadcast 
among them.

Since writing the above, we find that a 
Board of Health has been appointed for 
Chatham.

A Comet
lias been plainly visible every night by 
the naked eye since Thursday night last, 
it is in the northeastern portion of the 
heavens, and is said to be located in the 
constellation auriga, about 8 degrees 
from Capelin, and it is thought to be not 
improbable that it may be the much ex­
pected comet of 1812, which should ap­
pear not far from that locality.

Professor Ormond Stoue, of the Cin­
cinnati Observatory, observed the comet 
Oil tlie night of the 23rd. He says it is 
moving rapidly north. He is quite posi­
tive it is .not the comet of 1812, but 
thinks it may be that ofil807, whose re­
turn was not expected by astronomers 
for seventeen years. He thinks it is the 
same comet that was seen about June 
3rd, by Dr. Gould in South America.

Personal.
Mr. A. A. Davidson, Jr., of this town, 

was sworn in as Barrister in Fredericton 
on Saturday last.

Rev. Richard Opie conducted the usual 
mornfhg and evening services in the 
Methodist Church, Newcastle, on Sunday 
last.

The Toronto Evening Telegraph has the 
following London special ; Dr. Andrew 
Clark alter repeated examination of Sir 
John Macdonald has pronounced his dis­
ease catarrh of the stomach, which is not 
necessarily fatal. Dr. Grant, Sir John’s 
l Ittawa medical adviser, was of the opin­
ion that his disease was cancer of the 
stomach, a different disease aud one that 
is always fatal. Dr. Clark came to this 
conclusion only after the filth diagnosis 
of Sir John’s case.

The Rev. Job Shenton. who lias lately 
removed to New Brunswick from New­
foundland, was very kindly remembered 
by the people of St. John’s on his depar­
ture. Mrs. Shenton received a gold chain 
and locket from the Ladies’ Union, of 
'thick Union for near three years she had 
been President. She received also a gold 
watch from the Reform Club, whose Pre­
sident, Hon. J. J. Rogerson, presented it 
to her, as well as two addresses, one from 
the Union aud tlie other from the Reform 
Club. The daughters of tlie family were 
remembered ii numerous mementoes 
from friends.

lion. Mr. Pope, Minister of Marine A 
Fisheries continues to improve iu health.

It is reported at Hastings that Mr. A. B. 
C. Bartlett, the husband of the Baroness 
Burdett-Coutts, will shortly be announced 
as the second Conservative candidate for 
the borough.

The Chatham Star says that the new 
Sheriff’ of Gloucester was sworn in on 
Friday last.

M r. Thomas Fitzgerald, son of Mr. 
Alex. Fitzgerald of Chatham, was or­
dained to the priesthood iu the Seminary 
of St. Sulpice, Montreal, on the 11th inst.

His Lordship Bishop Rogers, of Chat­
ham, came down from Edmundston to 
Fredericton on Friday last, and left for 
St. John Saturday morning on his return 
home.

The Duke of Argyll who has been suf­
fering severely of late from gout is much 
worse and fears are entertained about his 
recovery.

Presbyterian Church Campbellton.
The following gentlemen were elected 

Trustees of Saint Andrew’s Church, 
Campbellton for the ensuing year.

Adam Ferguson ; John McAllister ; 
John Muir ; Jolm Adams ; G. E. Askar ; 
Alex. li. Chamberlain ; Arch. Duncan ; 
William Andrew aud Thomas Kerr.

Oil W. Mott retiring from the Board, 
who declined to be placed in nomination, 
tlie following resolution was placed on 
the records of tlie Church, at a meeting 
of the Trustees held on the 21st inst.

Resolved, “ That. ■ Mr. William Mott ot 
Campbellton, who has served this corpora­
tion for the last fifteen years, with untiring 
zeal and ability in the office of Secretary, and 
in various other duties in furthering the 
welfare ol our Church, in severing his con­
nection with the corporation—carries with 
him as a token of respect the best regards 
and wishes of the Trustees of St. Andrew’s 
Church, for his future welfare and happiness, 
and all the blessings flowing from a connec­
tion with the Church of our fathers.” Car­
ried Unanimously.

A Big Finà.
The St. Jdhii News ot Monday says :— 

This afternoon Rev. Mr. Hickson, of 
Carleton, met the News reporter aud told 
him that lie (Mr. Ilickson) iu company 
with his brother of Bathurst, and another 
gentleman had formed a company to 
open up a silver aud lead mine in the 
vicinity of Bathurst. An assay has been 
taken of the ore, aud it has been found 
to contain one-third lead of the entire 
hulk and thirty-one ounces of silver to 
tlie ton of lead. Steps are already being 
taken to incorporate a company to be 
known as tlie Nigadeo Silver Mining Co. 
The capital announced is $150,000, of 
which 850,000 is Open to the public. 
Little doubt can be .entertained but that 
tlie rev. gold-liuuters have struck a rich 
lead.

Picked Up. v.
Captain Strnndburg. of tlie bark Jlar- 

garethh from Sweden for Newcastle oil 
the 17th June, in latitude 44.57 longitude 
51.21 picked up a boat containing tlie 
captain and three men of the French fish­
ing schoo icr. Emilie Ernestine, of St. 
Pierre, which vessel was run into on tlie 
tilth June on tlie Southeast- of the banks 
of Newfoundland at 9 a. m. by tlie hark 
Artiste, of Liverpool, G. 11., during a 
heavy fog. Six men of the crew of the 
schr. were drowned. The men saved 
vo ’e put on hoc <1 an American fishing 

schr. for St. Pierre, on the 20th,

Provincial Appointments.
Tlie Royal Gazette of Wednesday last 

publishes the following appointments :— 
His Honor the Lieutenant Governor 

has been pleased to establish a Board of 
Health for that part of the Parish of 
Chatham comprised within the bounds of 
School Districts Nos. 1, 8, and 9, in the 
said Parish, and which part of tlie said 
Parish is hereby set apart as and for the 
Chatham Board of Health District in the 
County of Northumberland, under the 
Act of Assembly 44th Victoria, Chapter 
17, and to appoint lloctor John S. Benson, 
Duncan Davidson Holm Coleman, James 
T. Griffin, and Lemuel J. Tweedie, Mem­
bers of said Board.

WM. WEDDERBURN. 
Provincial Secretary’s Office, 

Fredericton, 6tli June 1881.

Those Hemlock Lands.
On Wednesday last the tract of land on 

Bass River, Kent Co., applied for by the 
Messrs. Miller, of Millerton, tor hemlock 
bark purposes, was brought to sale at the 
Crown Land offices Fredericton. The 
bidders were the Messrs. Miller, Mr. 
Yerxa, tlie York County Registrar (who 
acted as agent for somebody), and Mr. 
George, a bark dealer. The lands, ex­
cept one 2U0 acre lot, were purchased by 
the Messrs. Miller at an average of $1.50 
per acre. Mr. Yerxa had a lot dropped 
on him at 81.80.—Sun.

Commendatory.
From the Aspen (Colorado) Times we 

take the following notice of a young man 
belonging to Newcastle, son of Mr. 
George Brown. His many friends in this 
town are glad to hear of his success in 
life.

In another column will be seen the 
change in the Arm of H. p. Cowenhoven. 
The young man—David R. C. Brown— 
whom Mr. C. has associated with himself, 
is a person of excellent habits and line 
business qualities The Times predicts 
a successful career for him in his new 
enterprise.

A Poor Outlook.
Messrs. Gilbert & Brega, of Chicago, 

received a letter from Kansas City on 
Thursday which gives some startling 
“ news” about the crops in that section. 
The writer says that one of the news­
papers of that city had collected crop 
news from numerous points in Kansas, 
but suppressed it because of certain rail­
road arguments, chief among which was 
the plea that the publication of such 
news would retard immigration to 
Kansas.—Montreal Gazette.
Corner Stone.

Quite an imposing masonic ceremonial 
was gone through at the laying of the 
corner stone of the St. Croix cotton mill 
on Friday last. Grand Master Hon. R. 
B. Stevenson, conducted the ceremonies, 
assisted by members of the Grand Lodge. 
There was a large gathering of members 
of the fraternity from New Brunswick 
and the State of Maine.
The Folio

For July is to hand. This popular 
musical monthly is published by White, 
Smith &.C.O., 516 Washington Street, Bos­
ton, at $1.60 per year. This number 
contains a full page portrait of Helen 
Grayson, a number of original and select­
ed articles relating to music and musical 
news, and sixteen pages of vocal and in­
strumental music.
Saint Nicholas
For July has come to hand. This popu­
lar magazine for the voting folks is pub­
lished by the Century Company, New 
York, at 83.00 per annum, and always 
presents an interesting table of contents 
the various articles being pleasantly 
illustrated. Sample copies 25 cents.
Target Fratice.

Northumberland’s crack shots will be 
disappointed in any hope they may have 
of big scores in rifle practice, as it is an­
nounced that there will be no target 
practice for infantry. If this is a fact 
what then was tlie use of appointing a 
Musketry Instructor and his assistant. 
Excursions.

The Atulovei advertises an excursion 
to Redbank on Friday next, Dominion 
Day.

The railway authorities also announce 
excursion rates at one first class fare on 
the 29tli, 30tii and 1st July, good to re­
turn until the 4th. A good chance to 
visit the Camp at Sussex^
A Post,

The gardens and orchards in Windsor, 
N. S., and vicinity arc alive with cater­
pillars. The Mail says that fruit trees 
and even willows have been stripped of 
their foliage and present an appearance 
like as if they.had been burned by Are.
The Great Eastern.

The directors of the Great Eastern 
Steamship Company have decided to offer 
the Great" Eastern at public auction on 
the 1st of next October unless previously 
disposed of at private sale.
Auction.

Mr. C. C. Watt will offer at auction on 
Saturday next, at 11 a. in., at head of 
Commercial Wharf, a quantity of choice 
Hour, eornmeal, good breakfast tea and 
other articles. Terms—3 months.
Protection.

I'lie steamer Greyhound, re-named La 
Canadienne, has been placed in tlie Gulf 
for the protection of the- Canadian fish­
eries. A stipendiary magistrate will 
have general command of the expedition. 
Lubricate.

Mill and Machine Oils at James Fish’s 
Newcastle. June 8-tf.

Music, 8sc.
Orders ijaken at this office by J. J. 

Anslow for any style of the Mechanical 
Orguinettc, which will be sold here, or 
sent to any addrç**t the same price for 
which tlie instmiuent can be obtained in 
Montreal. A Saiwplc instrument can be 
seen at the agent’s residence. Mason & 
Hamlin and other Instruction books, 
sheet music. &c., furnished at publisher’s 
prices, and sent to anv address, postpaid.

tf.
Smash.

On Friday last the connecting rod in 
the Fish mill broke, arf^hing the main 
crank before the mill Vmld be stopped. 
A new and heavier connecting rod is be­
ing put in as well as new crank. Ex­
pected to lie at work aga in to-morrow.
Fredericton University.

The achromatic miscroscopc that is 
given annually for science iu the junior 
year work was won by Mr. W. J. Fowler, 
of Northumberland, this year, after a 
close competition.
New Fence.

Mr. Geo. Slothart has made good pro­
gress with the new fence around the 
square. The fence is a substantial one, 
and when painted and finished will look 
well.
The Bazaar

Under the auspices of the ladies of St 
Andrew’s Church, Chatham, came off on 
Wednesday last and was a success. 
Over 8300 is reported as the proceeds.
Real Estate Auction.

Mr. C. Marshall will offer at public auc­
tion on Monday, July 11, a commodious 
house, and a lot of Household Furniture 
Ac. See adv. for particulars.
Exiles.

The statement is made that 12,000 
Russian convicts, or more, will in about 
a week’s time be on their way to Siberia.
Holiday.

Friday next, July 1st, being Dominion 
Day. has been proclaimed a General 
Holjday.
Carriages.

Mr. Alex. Robinson of Chatham adver­
tises carriages of various kinds for sale. 
See adv.

At the residence of the bride’s father, 
Campbellton, N. B., on the 22nd June, 
by the Rev. Alex. Russell, Edmund 
Lodge, of Mat&pedia, to Annie, eldest 
daughter of John Duncan, Esq.

At Southesk, on Friday the 24th June, 
of diphtheria, Paulix-a Prudence, daugh­
ter of Jayed and Amy Tozer, aged 4 
years and 4 months.

Shipping Intelligence
portoFnewcastlk

Entered.
June 22.—Barks Prof. Schevugard, 33 

Halvorsen. Dover, ballast, R. A. A , 
Stewart ; Haleos, 384, Gendersen. Goole, d c 
do.; Norton, 489, McGiffen, Belfast, do., d

23—Bark Lothair, 648, Fuin, Belfast, ba 
last, D. & J. Ritchie & Co.

25—Bkte. Sovereign. 332, Morris, St. Job 
Nfld. ballast, D. * J. Ritchie A Co.

27— Bk. Donah ! Ferguson, 583, Brownregj 
Gloucester, ballast, D. * J. Ritchie & Co.

28— Bk. Margaretta, 588, Strandbur 
Sweden, R, A, A J. Stewart.

Cleared.
23—Bk. Brigda, Olsen, Brest, deals, R. A 

& J. Stewart.
25—Bk. Wilheima Foss, Josephsen, Bon 

Africa, deals, R. A. A J. Stewart.

PORT OF CHATHAM.

Entered.
June 18—Barks Albion, 476, Rode. Fowe 

ballast, J. B. Snowball ; Tonni, 512, Carlsei 
Goole, do.,do.

20— Barks Sheffield, 620, Morch, London 
ballast, Guy. Sevan A Co.; Nordcap, 621 
Steen, Laurvig, do., J. B. Snowball; Co, 
current. 548, Caspersen, Glasgow, do., Gu' 
Sevan A Co.

21— Barks Udjus, 320, Hansen, Waterforc 
ballast, to order; Baltic, 641, Wulpber; 
Liverpool, do., W. Muirhead; Vigo, 50 
Bierman, Waterford, do., J. B. Snowbal 
Rogate, 337, Christophersen, Bordeaux, do 
do.; Carmel, 780, McCallum, Liverpool, do 
Jo. ; brig Gitana, 340, Sehaenbern, Madeir: 
do., Guy, Sevan A Co. ; bark Erna, 44 
Joreosen, Gorway, do., A. Morrison.

22— Bark Christina, 664, Andrews, Have 
ballast, A. Morrison.

Cleared.
June 16—Barks Sigred. Olsen, Bochefoi 

deals, J. B. Snowball ; Forest Queen, M 
Gonnell, Belfast, do., Wm. Muirhead.

17— Schr. J. J. Bill. Balcom, Boston, pa 
lugs and laths, J. B. Snowball.

18— Bark Joe Read, Evans, Belfast, deal 
J. B. Snowball.

20—Brig Kron Prinds Carl, Larsen, S 
Servian, deals, J. B. Snowball.

22—Bark Annette, Heggin, Irvine, deal 
Wm. Muirhead.

êamsptmtititrt.

Chatham, 23rd June, 1881
Messrs. Editors.—From the external 

pearance a school house and its adjunct! 
play grounds, fences, &c., present to 
public, of neatness and cars or the reve 
a faiily correct opinion may be forme 
the extent of interest the community or ] 
trict takes in the education and trainin 
its youth.

When the eye rests upon an educatii 
institution—attractive in architectural st 
its exterior walls well painted, ample ] 
grounds enclosed with neat fencing, paii 
and kept in good order, and the whole 
mises presenting an appearance ofrefinen 
and cultivated taste : the beholder will 
totally conclude that the School Trustei 
that District are men faithfully diachar; 
their duties, that the Rate-payers of the 
trict are deeply interested in the educa 
of their children and believe, as the evidi 
justifies, that in maintaining an attrsc 
appearance of the school house and its i 
roundings they thus confer beneficial eff 
upon the mina and habits of the youth, 
thus the Teacher is such an institu 
would be a man thoroughly fitted for 
position.

If these views be correct, what con 
sions will a visitor to the Town of Chat! 
reasonably arrive at, on beholding 
“High School and its premises," situate 
the middle district of that town ? 1 
must surely be most unfavorable to the 
tern and management pursued by either 
Principal, Trustees or Ratepayers, or of 
combined, on the evident lack of inte 
here manifest.

The front gate-ways to the school groii 
have no gates—being either stolen or smi 
ed,up. Its side gates on Henderson st 
each hang by one hinge and at an angl 
45. Vast breaches in the fences from fi 
to rear present themselves every four 1 
from which the palings have been ruthle 
wrenched, and the surrounding street! 
the town as well as the school yards 
strewn with the “ debris” of the now dila 
dated fences intermingled profusely v 
billets of fire-wood, Ac., Ac. The pa 
And fanlight of the frontdoor to this'1 vi 
High School have been battered in and i
broken glass and gaping, windows__
ensemble, present the app^Phnce of hai 
passed through some severe attack of rio 
an infuriated mob.

Every feature of this temple of lean 
denoces wreck and ruin—an utter disret 
for the property itself and for the chara 
and position, as a school of a high grac 
was intended by its founders it should 
cupy in the country, and which was an 
still so much needed, but it has, I am info 
eJ, and as evidence warrants, sadly dege 
ated from the thorough practical systec 
education formerly imparted within its wi 
Such a condition of educational matters 
rw8liVe t0 an intelligent caÉ^unity 
Chatham. The remedy is iiiThe hand 
the Ratepayers of the District. In jus 
to the present and future welfare of t 
children, parents should arouse from 
apathy too long indulged in, and insist u 
a thorough change of the system pursue 
the-training and management of this sch 
inside „s well as out.

Yours, A Visit®:

t


