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Founded in 1785, originally composed of but
nineteen'members and afterwards extended onlý

to men who had served in the Pays dEn Haut,
it soon acquired a reputation for entertaining in
regal style. Why the vertebrae of colonial gentle.
men should sometimes lose the independent,

upright rigidity of self-respect on contact with
old world nobility, I know not. But instantly,
Colonel Adderly's reference to Lord Selkirk and
the Beaver Club called up ýhe picture of a ban.
quet in Montreal, when I was a lad of seven, or

thereabouts. I had been tricked out in some
Highland costume especially pleasing to the Earl

cap, kilts, dirk and all-and was taken by my
Uncle jack MacKenzie to the Beaver Club.

Here, in a roomthat glittered with lights, was a
table steaming with things, which caught and
held my boyish eyes; and all about were crowds
of guesti, gentlemen, who had been invited in
the quaint language of the club, " To discuss the
merits of bear, beaver and venison." The great

Sir Alexander MacKenzie, with his title fresh
from the king, and his fcat of exploring the river
now known by his name and pushing through the

mountain fastnesses to the Pacific on all men's
lips-was to my Uncle jack's ý right. Simon
Fraser and David Thompson and other famous
ex lorers, who were heroes to, my imagination,
were there too. In these men and what they
said of their wonderful voyages I was far more
interested than in the young, keen-faced man
with a tie, that came up in ruffles to his ears,


