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in cat notches, in which they fix their Icg^,

i and over this they place a pole, ccoG^ng the

I pole on each fide with flakes drove in the
ground, and in the crotches of the flakes they
place other poles or riders, cfFedlually con-
fining the prifoners on their backs; befidcs

which, they put a ilrap round their necks,
which they faflcn to a tree: in this manner
the night pafTcd. Their beds were hemlock
branches flrewcd on the grourd, anc^ blankets
rbr a covering, which was an indulgence
fcarccly to have been expected fronr* favagcs:
it may reafonably be cxpedled, that in this

melancholy fituation, deep was a ftranger to
their eye-lids.

Benjamin Peart having far ted in the even-
ing, occafioncd by the fufFerings he endured,
was threatened to be tomahawked by Rowland
Montcur.

26th. Early this morning they continued
their route near the waters of Teropin Ponds.
The Indians thought it mofl eligible tofcpa*
rate the prifoners in companies of two by two,
each company under the command of a par-
ticulaiTndian, fpreading them to a confidcr-
able diftance, in order to render a purfuit as
impradicable as poHible. The old people,
overcome with fatigue, could not make as
much expedition as their fevere tafk-mafters
thought proper, but failed in their journey,

Iand were therefore threatened with death by
A 6 ilic


