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Private Members’ Business

arrangement where they work two shifts a day, seven days a 
week, not unlike the way members of Parliament work.

Allow me to outline some of the obvious flaws in this bill. 
Clause 3 of this legislative proposal calls for governments to 
give priority to the undertaking of sufficient measures to 
achieve full employment in Canada and establish programs that 
ensure that employment opportunities are available to all adult 
Canadians who seek work.

Mrs. Diane Ablonczy (Calgary North): Madam Speaker, I 
am pleased to speak today on this bill. I join the hon. member for 
Yukon in her sincere desire that no Canadian ever have to suffer 
the anxiety and the stress of being unable to find a good job with 
a good income sufficient to provide for themselves and their 
family. I commend her for her compassion and for wishing to 
devise a way to relieve this and other difficulties faced by all too 
many of our citizens.

These suggestions are vague and they are optimistic. The 
shortage of specifics with intent to achieve idealistic goals 
seems to infer that the government should spend tax dollars to 
create employment without creating wealth or economic growth 
to support it.

It seems to me that we have tried these measures before in 
countless forms throughout our history without creating any 
possibility for long term employment. The most recent example 
is this government’s initiative to assist unemployed Canadian 
youth. These programs amount to a redistribution of tax dollars 
to our young people in exchange for performing routine tasks. It 
does nothing to give them long term jobs and skills.

The premier of Ontario tried to spend his way out of reces­
sionary times during his first year in office. We know the results 
there. This type of mentality has already plunged Canada to the 
brink of fiscal collapse. Investor confidence has weakened and 
with it has come a loss of jobs and a shaky economy.

High interest rates are another result of this type of govern­
ment policy. The vicious spiral of government spending leads to 
a high level of taxation which in turn contributes to inflation 
which stifles entrepreneurship.

Unfortunately the measure she is proposing in the bill before 
this House today simply cannot achieve this ideal. It would be 
wonderful if people through their elected representatives could 
by putting the right words on paper eliminate difficulties and 
uncertainty in the economic, political and social spheres of our 
society. In my view it does not work that way. That view is based 
on observations of government actions both past and present, 
some in our own country.

Creating a state bureaucracy which will somehow create jobs 
for everyone is certainly not a new idea. The well known slogan 
of the old Soviet Union was: “From each according to his 
ability, to each according to his need”. What that led to was 
summarized in the typical black humour of the Polish workers 
who used to say: “We pretend to work and the government 
pretends to pay us”.

To suggest to Canadians that governments owe them jobs or 
are even capable of providing them with jobs in every case 
would be a cruel deception. This is particularly true for this 
government, already over half a trillion dollars in debt and 
spending $41 billion and rising every single year just on interest 
on that debt.
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The best way to create employment and thus achieve this 
bill’s objectives is to eliminate government waste, remove 
barriers and regulations that hinder commerce, cut spending and 
reduce taxes. In this environment there would be a streamlined 
bureaucracy serving the real needs of Canadian entrepreneurs. 
Canadians would have more money left in their pockets to start 
and build businesses and there would be enough profit left to 
make their work and risk worthwhile. Only when individuals are 
prepared to risk their own capital can we expect to have a strong 
and vibrant economy.

Studies have shown and indeed the hon. member opposite just 
mentioned that an enormous percentage of real long term jobs 
are created by a healthy small business sector.

We need to get government off the backs of people and keep 
governments’ demands from obstructing their dreams and work. 
There is no need to further encumber the people of Canada with 
yet another government department and still more regulations to 
stimulate employment.

This bill also calls for a draft plan that will include an 
estimate of the number of jobs expected to be created in Canada 
as a result of the plan and a timetable for its implementation and

The tax burden on working Canadians simply to sustain the 
present level of spending is already a crushing load. Where will 
the money come from to create the ministry of plenty envisioned 
in this bill? Governments have no money of their own. They 
must work with money taken from citizens. Even if they 
recovered some revenue in the form of taxes this proposal would 
still require an enormous additional expenditure in terms of the 
bureaucratic handling fee that would be made necessary by this 
new initiative.

If government programs, spending, borrowing for more pro­
grams and increasing tax grabs to fund it all could give people 
jobs, there would be enough programs and spending in Canada 
to give every single citizen three jobs. It has not worked out that 
way.

Since big government, big government programs and interfer­
ence in the economy are what have brought us to today’s fiscal 
mess I am frankly amazed that anyone would be advocating 
more of the same today.


