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TH-E TREATMENT -OF lIIP DISEASE

BY B. E. M'KENZIE, B.A., M.D.

TEE terni "hip disease" bias assumed a very defini te meaning-
soniething more speci*fle than simply disease at the hip joint. Dis-
ease at1 the hip joint nîay mean th it the pathological factor is
gonorrhoea, syphilis, rheunatoid arthritis, malîgnant disease, rheu-
matisni, or tuberuiosis. Trhe termi "hip, disease" is employed to
signify the last, and is 110W almost universally taloen to imply a
foctis of tuibercular disease in sorne of the structures which together
conustitute the hip joint.

Hr. Bowlby, of London, lias recently published àin article whichi
presents certainly very strikin.g resuits. During tw*enty-;ofe years
jusi passe nine hundred cases of tuberculous disease of the hip,
have licou treated at the Alexandra Hospital, writh a xnortalit;y of
les thian 4 per cent. In the year 1879, -the Clinical Society of
Loiidon instituted an enquiry to ascertairi the relative nierits of
treatment -by rest and other associated ineasures, on the 011e band,
and by operation, ùiotably by excision, on the other. The report
ô£ the committee may lie found in the fourteenth volume of the
"Transactions of the Clinical Society" (1881). 0f three hundred
an(1 eighty-four cases treated in the Alexandra Hospital, rýeferred
to .;u the abore enquiry- (1881), one hundred died, a mortalîty. of
-26 ýer cent. The causes of death assigned are as follows: Tuber-
eu! lus meningitis, 23; extension of local diséase And visceral com-
pications, such as amyloid. disease, tuberculous disease of the
lungrý etc., 66; intercurrent diseases, that is to say; other.diseases
which were not di -ectly connected with, the hip disease, il; making


