
CHAPTER III

REGIME RELATING TO HONORARY CONSULAR OFFICERS AND CONSULAR
POSTS HEADED BY SUCH OFFICERS

ARTICLE 58

General provisions relating to facilities, privileges and immunities

1. Articles 28, 29, 30, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38 and 39, paragraph 3 of Article 54 an
paragraphs 2 and 3 of Article 55 shall apply to consular posts headed by a
honorary consular officer. In addition, the facilities, privileges and immun
ties of such consular posts shall be governed by Articles 59, 60, 61 and 62.

2. Articles 42 and 43, paragraph 3 of Article 44, Articles 45 and 53 an
paragraph 1 of Article 55 shall apply to honorary consular officers. In addl
tion, the facilities, privileges and immunîties of such consular officers shall b
governed by Articles 63, 64, 65, 66 and 67.

3. Privileges and immunities provided in the present Convention shaîl not; b
accorded to members of the family of an honorary consular officer or of
consular employee employed at a consular post headed by an honorar
consular officer.

4. The exchange of consular bags between two consular posts headed b
honorary consular officers in different States shaîl not be allowed without til
consent of the two receiving States concerned.

ARTICLE 59

Protection of the consular premises

The receîvîng State shall take such steps as may be necessary to protec
the consular premises of a consular post headed by an honorary consula
officer against any intrusion or damage and to prevent any disturbance of t1i'
peace of the consular post or impairment of its dignity.

ARTICLE 60

Exemption from taxation of consu lar premises

1. Consular premises of a consular post headed by an honorary consule
officer of which the sending State is the owner or lessee shaîl be exempt fr0'1

ahl national, regional or municipal dues and taxes whatsoever, other than su"
as represent payment for specific services rendered.

2. The exemption from taxation referred to in paragraph 1 of this, ril
shaîl not apply to such dues and taxes if, under the laws and regulatiofl5 O0
the receiving State, they are payable by the person who contracted with
sending State.

Article 61

INVIOLABILITY 0F CONS ULAR ARCHIVES AND DOCUMENTS

The consular archives and documents of a consular post headed bY
honorary consular officer shall be inviolable at ail times and wherever t11O


