
Dealer management infor-
mation and control mobile 
equipment system. 

Memory management system 
for IBM PC, plus other 
software. 

Computer assisted learning 
software and productivity 
tools. 

STD BUS compatible com-
puter boards. 

Packaged software products 
for microcomputer-based 
commercial applications. 

Distributors: North Star Com- 
puters Inc. 
Information 
Unitd. Software 

Computer hardware and soft-
ware for local government. 

Distributors: Ernst & Whinney 

Turnkey civil engineering 
computer and software. 

Distributors: Axis Inc., 
San Diego 

Rent-a-car automation system 
microcomputer. 

CAD/CAM Computer graphics 
systems and electronic test 
equipment. Direct sales office 
in CA plus distributors 

Database and conversion 
software Mark IV program-
ming aids; plus education 
courses. 

Microcomputer and applica-
tion software for UNIX 
systems and Telidon graphics 
terminals. 

Non-impact printers & print 
mechanisms for OEMs. 

Networking Package for DEC 
PDP-11 Systems running 
RSTS/E. 

Distributors: North County 
Computer Ser-
vices, Inc., 
Escondido, CA. 

Micro Computers and 
software. 

Distributors: I.E. Jaco 

APPENDIX "A" 
Canadian Computer and Software 

Manufacturers Responding 
to the Study 

Homestead Com-
puter Services, Ltd. 

Human Computing 
Resources Corp. 

Idacom Electronics, 
Ltd. 

lnsystems Inc. 

Nabu Manufacturing 
Corporation 

Nelma Data 
Corporation 

Norpak Corporation 

Northern 
Technologies 

ACT Computer 
Services Ltd. 

AU Computers Inc. 

Bailey & Rose Ltd. 

Baradine Products 
Ltd. 

Basic Software 
Group Inc. 

Cogebec Inc. 

Compeng Computer 
Systems Ltd. 

Comshare Ltd. 

Cymbal Cybernetics 
Corporation 

Data Kinetics 

David Computers 

Delphax Systems 

Digital Management 
Group Ltd. 

DY-4 Systems Inc. 

Matrox Electronic 
Systems Ltd. 

Megatel Computer 
Corporation Inc. 

Memotec Data Inc. 

Netron Inc. 

Network Data 
Systems Ltd. 

Officesmiths Inc. 

Omnitech Graphics 
Systems Inc. 

Farm Management System 
Software. 

Distributors: Delta Farming 
Systems, 
Colorado 

Software. Unity Operating 
System. 

Distributors: International 
Data Services, 
CA 

Plessey Peripheral Systems, 
CA 

Intelligent Data Analyzer, 
Protocol Analyzer. 

Software to develop com-
puter application systems, 
generates Cobol programs. 

Various boards and modules, 
microcomputer products, 
graphics terminals, terminals. 

Single board computers. 

Communications hardware 
and software. 

Distributors: Manufacturer's 
reps. 

Micro Computers, Cable Tele-
communication products. 
Direct sales by Subsidiary 
Consolidated Computer Inc. 

Business computer and 
intelligent terminal. 

Distributors: Computerland 
(May/June 1983) 

Computer Aided COBOL Pro-
grams — customization. 

Interfaces for IBM, Olivetti, 
Olympia electronic type-
writers. Computer for WP & 
electronic mail. 

Distributors: Olivetti Corpora-
tion of America — through 
Olivetti dealers. 

Videotext decoder, teletext 
decoder, information provider 
system, encoder system. 

Customized CRTs, plastic 
connector covers, RFI 
shielded connector covers. 

Distributors: Momentum 
Computers, CA 

Software for Electronic File 
Cabinet. 

Turnkey CAD/CAM systems. 

Distributors: Omnicadd 
Systems, LA 
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