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Grace be with all them that love our Loru Jesus Christ In sincerity."-Eph. vi.. 21.
Earnestly contend for the Faith which waa once delivered unto the saints."-Jude 3.

MONTREAL, WEDNPßDAY, MARCH 7,1894.

ECCLESIASTICAL NOTES.

BisioP HALL, of Vermont, beld his first Con-

tirmation in Christ church, Guilford.

A building in the best part of the city of Da-

venp ort, Iowa, bas been bought at a cost of

,10,000) for a Church Hospital.

A NEw church is to be built nt Heckmond-

wike, Yorkshire, an anonymous donor having
given £5,000 as a nucleus for that purpose.

UEoRGE H. YARNALL, late Rector of St.

Jolns church, Passaic, N.J., bas been deposed
from the ministry of The Church by Bishop
Sta rkey.

Jen A. BEVINOTON, priest of the Diocese of

Massachusetts, bas been deposed by Bishop
Lauwrence for causes not aft'eting his moral
character.

JULoE McSHERRY, of Maryland, vigorously
denounces the plan of dividing the Public
School money among Romanists. He is a Ro-
man Catholie.

TuE Board of Education in New York city
bas adopted a resolution to support ail proper
measures for suppressing the cigarette habit in
the public schools.

THE Bampton Lectures, which are endowed

out of a farm in Buckinghamshire, will have to

be suspended in 1896, 1898 and 1900, owing to
agricultural deprossion.

No fewer than 320 tablets have recontly been
recovered in Palestine and Arabia, ail throwing
more or less light upon contested portions of
the loly Scriptures. The tablets are nearly
4,000 years ol.

BISILOP PARET's gddress upon " Tho Church
of Rome and the Public Schools," in Washing-
ton, Baltimore and elsewhere, bas been issued
in pamphlet form, and is being extensively cir-
culated in the United States.

THE dedication of the new marble and alabas-
ter baldachino in Peterborough Cathedral, with
the new organ, orected at a cost of £4,500, the
stalls, secrons, and choir gates of the new choir,
is to take place on May 1oth.

THE entire restoration of Kidderminster
Parish Church bas been undertaken by an
anonymous donor. Twolve out of the proposed
mneteen memorial windows to the late Bishop
Claughton in the church are in course of pro-
parution.

DURINo Lent London, Eng., is to have a re-

markable Roman Catholie Mission, conducted
by about 150 workers from ail parts of England
and Ireland. These will include Jesuits, Pas-

sionists, Dominicans and Franciscana. Thoy
will, in addition to proaching, go among the
people in their homes. Cardinal Vaughan VA-
gards this as an experiment, and, if sucessfal,
will extend it to ail the great industrial centres
of the kingdom.

IT is announced that the Cathedral of St. John
the Divine, New York, eau be safoly built upon
the ground upon which it was finst commenced.
It was reported that the lundation was ine-
cure, but further examination bas disproved
this.

AT the " Quiet Day" for the Dioceso of West-
cru Michigan t lie Bishop ofSpringfield delivered
an eloquent sermon on "Church Principles,"
the several points of Apostolic Orders, of Fol-
lowship, of Sacramoit and Liturgy being fully
devolopod.

IN the list Of subjecte for the examination of
candidates for Priests' Orders in the Diocese of
Ripon, the " Infallibility of the Church," by the
Rev. Dr. Salmon, Provost of T.C.D., bas now
been substituted for Allen's "Continuity of
Christian Thought." .

AccoRDING to his established custom, the
Bishop of Ohio hold his pro-Lenten "lQuiet
Day" for the clergy at the Cathedral on Febru-
ary 5th ; about thirty-five were present. The
subject of the Meditations was " The Duty and
Art of Cateshising the Young." At the closing
service a Mothodist minister, Mr. Hall, and a
Congregational minister, Mr. Taft, were pre-
sented by Dean MoCabefor Confirmation.

BisHor WITAKER, ofPennsylvania, on Wed-
nesday in Ember week ordained to the Diacon-
ate Dr. Robert McKay and Mr. Lewis C. Baker.
The former was recently a Methodist minister,
and the firat to be ordained under the new
Canon providing for ordination, immodiately
after examination, of those coming from other
religious bodies, and boing over thirty-five
years of age. Mr. Baker was formorly a Pres-
byterian minister.

"You are tried alone ; alono you pass into
the desert; alone yon must bear and conquer in
the agony ; alone you must b sified by the
world. There are moments known only to a
man's own self when ho sits by the poisoned
springs of existence, ' yearaing for a morrow
which shall free him from the strife.' .

Let life ho a life of faith; do not go timorously
about, inquiring what others think, what others
believe, and what othoe Bay. . . . God is near
you. Throw yoursolf fearlessly upon Him."-
Selected.

The Times recently publisbed " A Relie of the
Christian Persocutions" in the shape of the
translation of a fragment of papyrus, which
dates from A.D. 250. It is a certificate that a
native Egyptian accused of being a Christian,

had satisfied the roquiremonts of the law and
had sacrificed. Tho " libel" relates to the Do-
cian persecution. It must bo profoundly dis-
quieting to the know-nothings that, one after
another, testimonies are fortcoiming tu the
veraoity of historians, ospecially in respect of
Christ and Christianity. The Old Testament
and the New are contstantly boing authenticated
by ovidence which may bo igniored but cannot
be refuted.

Brsaor WoanswoRru, in his " Shakospeare
and the Bible," finds in the poot's works, ace-
cording to a writer in the Nineteenth Century,
more than 550 Biblical quotations, allusions,
reforences and sentiments. "ilanlet" alono
contains about oighty, " Richard the Third"
nearly fifty, and " Henry the Fifth" and
" Richard the Second" about forty eacl.
Shakospeare quotes from fifty-four of the Bibli-
cal books, and not one of bis thirty-soven plays
is without a Scriptural roforonco. Genesis fur-
nishes the poet with thirty-onc quotations or al-
lusions, the Psalms with fifty-nine, Proverbs
with thirty-five, Isaiah with tventy-one, Mat-
thew with sixty, Luke with thirty, and Romans
with twenty.

THE Christian at WVork says "'The rapid
growth of Protestant Episcopalians in New
York was some time ago strilkingly illustrated
by the Rev. Dr. A. F. Schaufflor, of the New
York City Mission. A few days ago the Rov.
Dr. A. H. Bradford, of Montelair, N.J., pub-
lished statistics which illustrate the Episcopa-
lian progress of the past twonty years. In that
period the clergy increased fronm 305 to 366;
the number of churches frem 170 to 244 ; Sun-
day-school pupils from 22,473 to 44,465; com-
municants fron 26,282 to 57,639 ; and contri-
butions from $949,00 I to 82,868,480. Anothor
remarkable and suggestive fact is that whilo
some other churclhes have beenu forsaidng the
downtown part of the city, Episcopalians have
only removed one church from bolow Four-
teenth street uptown."

PRnIIENDARY WEBB PEPLoE, one of the most
able and successful clergymen in our Clurch
to-day, uses unsparing language in regard to
sensational proaching: "Tho notice that the
latest poem of Tennyson shall bc the subject of
the next day's addrose, or the latest discovery in
the scientific field, or the most recent geo-
graphical question concerning Central Africa,
compels us to wonder what mon think people
corne to church for, with aching hearts and
heavy woos, Ionging for comfort and for peace,
and for life, and to b brought into relation
with Him who alone cau blesa them. IL is a
marvel in the present day that oven E4vangolical
clergymen should have thought how, by dis-
playing before the people something tricky,
something theatrical, they can best win the at-
tention of the unconvertad and the godless, and
that there is no power in the old Gospel. In my
humble judgment, these things ought not to be
so, and I veriIy believe that it is our highest
honour and privilege still to keop to the pure
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