
July 27, 1911. CANADIAN CHURCHMAN.

MAGIC
BAKING
POWDER
THE STANDARD AND 
FAVORITE BRAND

CONTAINS 
NO ALUM

THE WHITEST, L

Nagig
BAKING
POWDER

MADE IN 
CANADA

pretty mountain side becomes a 
glacial wall, for, while the valleys lie 
basking in the sun, perpetual winter 
reigns within sight, and the Frost 
King has only to loosen his grasp to 
send an>. avalanche of ice down the 
mountain side.

It is the presence, in close prox­
imity, of these powers of nature in 
all the grandeur of their power for 
good or ill, that gives to Alpine 
travel its zest, and to the Alpine 
farmer his strange blending of cour­
age and simplicity.

HABITS.

For one who is born careless and 
procrastinating, it is exceedingly 
difficult to be methodical and prompt. 
The instinct is not to do to-day what 
can by any possibility be put < ff till 
to-morrow ; and trying to take time 
by the forelock involves a struggle 
and much exertion. Yet both method 
and promptitude are to be learnt ; 
and, human nature being on one side 
of it automatic, habits arc formed 
whereby that which was in the be­
ginning beyond measure distasteful, 
becomes comparatively easy.

DON'T 
THROW

THE GIRAFFE.

OPEN A SAVINGS ACCOUNT
WITH JjTHE

BANK OF TORONTO
and deposit there, the small sums 
that are so easily spent, and watch 
the result of the "adding to" prin­
ciple. These "saved dollars" will 
be the seed from which a snug 
bank balance will grow for future 
years.

Interest Paid twice a year on 
all savings balances.

BANK OF TORONTO
HEAD OFFICE - TORON:0. ONT.
Capital -
Reserved
Fund }

$4,000,000
$4,944,777

The giraffe is the tallest of all 
quadrupeds, its head being some­
times eighteen feet from the ground. 
Its great height, however, is due to 
its long neck, and it can feed as well

greater
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land, in Calcutta, it has become the 
custom t.. give each child a doll at 
1 hristmas. As these schools contain 
seven or eight hundred children, the 
amount of work required to dress 
these dolls may be imagined, but 
kind friends at home do the 
part of it.

While the Dasserah festival is 
going on, the boys make of mud the 
head and shoulders of Tcsu, one of 
their idols, and put it on a stick, 
and the girls have a little earthen 
vessel full of^ holes, which looks 
ratljer pretty when the tiny lamp is 
Placed inside at night. It may be 
mentioned in passing that during the 
Dasserah the children often scoop 
the heart out of gourds, make holes 
in the rind, and carry them about at 
night with a light inside, reminding 
one forcibly of the “turnip lanterns’* 
which Hit about the village streets in 
Scotland on Hallowe’en.

The children play with these toys 
-the image of Fesu, and the vessel 

with holes—for nine days, begging 
money all the time from (their friends 
and relatives, or; in face, from any­
one who will give it to them. On the 
tenth day they go in procession as 
before, singing all the while rhymes 
in praise of their heathen gods, and 
when they come to the nearest river 
or tank they throw in the toys. 
I lien, when the children go hornet, 
they expend the money they have col­
lected in a grand feast of sweets.
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ALPINE SCENERY.

No other system of mountains on 
the earth presents such variations of 
beautiful scenery as the Alps, and no 
other system can be so easily pene­
trated to its very heart by the tourist 
who has the strength and the will. 
Covering an area of ninety thousand 
square miles, all the picturesque 
scenery of the surrounding countries, 
F'rance, Italy, Switzerland and Ger­
many, seems concentrated here. Tak­
ing its name from the Celtic Alb, 
signifying white, its eternally snow­
capped peaks are in striking con­
trast with the green of the valleys, 
or projected against the blue Italian 
sky, or the varying hues of the 
northern clouds.

While the ranges preserve a gen­
eral direction, they arc divided into 
innumerable short spurs and inter­
spersed by valleys, which furnish as 
great variety as the elevations* Many 
of them are but enormous crevices, 
with steep, rocky sides, cut through 
by irresistible mountain streams, 
whose roar, as they whirl and toss 
and tumble, is still heard bçlow. 
Others are verdure-clad basins, slop­
ing gracefully from the bases of the 
mountains to peaceful, gurgling rivu­
lets flowing through the. centre, on 
thefr wray to the cold North Sea, or 
the warmer Mediterranean, or per­
haps to the Black Sea. Sometimes 
the green fields become transformed 
in a single day into impassable 
masses of ice and snow, and the

from the ground as from the high j 
branches of trees.^ It is a native of 
Africa, and is found in all parts of j 
that continent south of the Sahara, 
but nowhere in great numbers. In 1 
its wild state it is very shy, and 
easily runs away from any other ani­
mal, its speed being greater than 
that of the fastest horse. It is, how-

"For the land's sake use Bowker’s 
Fertilizers ; they enrich the earth and 
those who till it. Address Bowker 
Fertilizer Co., Buffalo, N.Y."

ever, easily tamed, and now it is 
bred in the zoological gardens of this 
country and Europe. Though its 
safety lies chiefly in its facility for 
flight, it can defend itself very well, 
when pushed to extremity, by kicking 
with its hind legs. In this manner it 
has been known to drive off a lion. 
It has beautiful eyes and a graceful 
neck, which it turns like a bird, of 
which it reminds us in its move­
ments.

THE AMUSEMENTS OF 
CHILDREN.

HINDOO

All Hindoos, young and old—and, 
indeed, Eastern nations generally—

H- H. NIGHTINGALE
Stock Broker and 
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Investments anil Loans Negotiated

33 Melinda St - Toronto

arc much fonder of what we would 
call sights, or shows, and they call 
by the general name of tamasha, 
than of games. Other great sources 
of entertainment are jugglers and 
snake-charmers ; the former certainly 
do most wonderful things, such as 
the mango trick, and many others 
not so famous, but quite as curious.

To return, however, to the 
“amusements” of Hindoo children, 
sights such as those described arc a 
very great delight to them ; then 
t Itère are the festivals, which arc 
constantly occurring. Just before 
the Dassefah festival, which is cele­
brated by the burning of innumer­
able tiny lamps, the girls destroy 
their dolls, and this is a great gala 
day. The children dress themselves 
in their brightest colours, and, fo 
lowed by a crowd of men and women, 
march through the busy bazaars <>t 
the city and along roads shaded by 
overarching mango or sissoo-trees, 
till they come to the nearest water 
probably a tank built by some pious 
Hindoo. Round the tank arc feathery 
bamboos, plantains with their broad, 
pendulous leaves, and mango trees 
crowned in the season with spikes 
of blossom, and on every side are 
flights of steps leading down to the 
water. The children descend these, 
singing all the" time, and throw their 
beloved dolls into the water. Owing 
to this custom no Hindoo girl can 
show the collection of tlplls, which 
some girls in this countrv have. 
They are, however, easily replaced, 
being made either of njud, rudely 
daubed with paint, or of cloth. The 
delight of a Hindoo child over an 
f/hglish doll with fair hair, blue eyes, 
pretty face, and “clothes that^comc 
off and on,” is something very won­
derful ; and in the girls’ schools in 
connection with the Church, uf Scot-

When Blood 
Was Impure

The Old-fashioned Doctor Brought 
Relief by Bleeding.

To-day We Keep the Blood Pure by 
Using

DR. CHASE’S
KIDNEY-LIVER PILLS.

The doctor of a century or two ago 
was accustomed to free his patient of 
a.t excess çf poisoned blood by the 
cruel process of bleeding.

We would not stand for that heroic 
treatment to-day, because we under­
stand better the wont of the liver and 
kidneys and how to awaken them to 
their duty of filtering poisons from 
the blood.

These are the only organs of the 
body which filter poisons frotrF the 
blood, and so cleanse the system of 
the foul waste matter which causes 
pains, aches and dangerous diseases, 
and there is no way you can so quick­
ly bring the liver and kidneys into 
action as by using Dr. Chase’s Kid­
ney-1.iver Pills.

Don't imagine that a liquid medi­
cine is necessary to purify the blood. 
The supreme test is, “Does the 
treatment awaken the action of] the 
liver and invigorate the kidneys ?” 
|)r Chase’s Kidney Liver Pills are 
unique in their combined action on 
tin liver, kidneys and bowels, and on 
this account wonderfully successful 
as a means of purifying the blood.

The whole digestive and excretory 
system is cleansed and invigorated 
by this treatment. The appetite is 
sharpened, digestion improves and 
the tired, languid feelings of a 
poisoned system give way to new 
health and vigor. One pill a dose. 
25 cents a box, at all dealers, or 
F.dmanson, Bates & Co., Limited, 
Toronto.
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