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BUSINESS INVESTMENT - 1970

Mr. Jean-Luc Pepla, Minister of Industry, Trade
end Commerce, recently released the. resuits of a
field survey of the. 1970 capital-spending Intentions
of smre 150 large companies in Canada. This annual
survey la intend.d to provide a preliminary indica-
tio>n of likely trends in buinsless investment as a
'wbole in the. coming year.

The firma surveyed plan to increase expanditures
on new construction, machinery and equipment from
$5,328 million ln 1969 to $6,064 million in 1970 - a
gain of 14 per cent. In 1969 the. same conmpanies
raised their spending by about five per cent, com-
pared to the 1968 figure. Tii. increase indicated for
1969 is aomewhat 10.. than tii... firma iiad planned
earlier la the. year. To a considerable extent this
shortfall resulted trom delays caused 1by work
stoppages in the. construction industry and cthers.
For the, most part, programs tint were delayed in
1969 have been carrid over into 1970 and accounit
for a significant part of the. gain in spendlag planned.

Most major lndustry groupa elcpect te rois. their
oiutlays on new construction, aciinery and equip-
ment in 1970, witii special activity la the. masiufac-
turing sector, where plans involve a 30> percent
advance. Only mining companies expect that thqlr
outisys oni pow capita wilI be lower in 1970 than la
1969.

Under these circumstances, the sharp gains in
business-expansion programs now foreseen la more
likely to resuit ini a shift of available investment
resourcea toward business expansion, particularly in
goods-producing industries, than in excessive new
pressure on such resources.

~The siurvey of business investaient intention)s
for 1970 was carried out la conjuriction witIi a survqy
by the. Economic Council of Canada coverlng inveat-
ment plans of large companlea over the. next five
years. These results will appeax in a subsequent
report to be puhllshed by the Economic Council of
Canada.


