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.to jf* Interested in 
Becoming a Chartered 
Accountant?

4 «

9s

As A THANK YOU TO ALL OUR CUSTOM­

ERS FOR THEIR PATRONAGE IN THE PAST 

YEAR, WE ARE PAYING THE GST FOR 

ANY CLOTHING PURCHASED FROM 

MARCH 31 - APRIL 15.

If your university background is in 
business (or even another discipline) 
and you are interested in becoming a 
chartered accountant, please forward 
the completed ACCIS Application 
form along with a résumé, transcript 
of marks and a list of the courses in 
which you are currently enrolled to 
the Student Placement Service by 
April 6,1994. (The Student 
Placement Service is located in the 
Neville Homestead and can be 
reached at 453-4620.)

SO BEFORE SHIPPING OUT, SHAPE UP 

WITH HOT AND COOL

UNB/STU Clothing!

Ernst & Young, the largest 
professional services firm in the 
world, has 40 offices in Canada 
including Fredericton and Saint John 
New Brunswick.

cjS (Selected items 60-75% oil)
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STORE HOURS: MON-FRI 9:00 - 4:30

=U Ernst &Young
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TWILL SHIRTS 
& SWEATERS
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WOLVERINE
CANADA’S OUTDOOR FOOTWEAR
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GORE-TEX® ?»

Outerwear
Guaranteed To Keep You Dry*
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BARBARIAN® SPORTSWEAR IBI
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CHECK IT OUT!
THE VALUE 
THE LOOK modi’/ UJodt UUeorhou/c
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a 1134 SMYTHE ST. KMART PLAZAEi
Mon.-Sat.

10 a.m.-10 p.m.459-8866
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