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Employment benefits were designed to encourage personal 
initiative, to encourage people to make appropriate job search 
choices. There are management systems to help recipients plan 
their return to the work force in a methodical way. They will 
need to commit to following that plan, and there will be 
follow-up mechanisms.

training, co-operative education programs and on-the-job 
training.

These measures must be implemented as soon as possible. We 
have provided for a transition period of up to three years to give 
the provinces and institutions time to adjust.

Since 1966, we have concluded agreements with Quebec as 
we have with other provinces in this country, and this proves that 
we are able to work in harmony to promote the well being of our 
human resources, with due consideration for the priorities of the 
province.

We have sought to make wage benefits and all employment 
and re-employment measures as flexible as possible. All levels 
of government acknowledge the necessity of bringing their 
labour market-related roles in line with each other; duplication 
of effort, services and expenditures must be avoided, and 
initiatives must be co-ordinated. A province wishing to admin­
ister a service itself, or to substitute another program which 
would yield the same results, will be able to do so. The federal 
government is determined to act in as open a manner as possible, 
within the confines of its mandate under the national Constitu­
tion.

The employment insurance bill is a starting point for discus­
sions with the provinces. These discussions may lead to various 
agreements depending on the particular needs of the provinces, 
their economic situation and the needs and circumstances of 
local labour markets. It is up to us to sit down together at the 
negotiating table and proceed with our discussions while con­
sidering our workers, the jobs they need and the economic 
development of all regions in our country.What will Quebec get out of this new legislative package? 

Respect of our jurisdictions, greater flexibility in human re­
source management, new opportunities for agreements, and the 
continuation of some of the many agreements already in place 
between us relating to employment insurance and human re­
sources development.
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In some cases, for example, a provincial government could 
manage federal employment measures or could use its own 
programs, rather than implement the proposed federal mea­
sures. Similarly, we could combine federal and provincial 
programs along with other programs from the private sector and 
the community.

To prevent overlapping initiatives and programs, we want to 
sit down with Quebec and see how we can focus our efforts in the 
area of manpower training. Parochial squabbles do Canadians a 
disservice and are counterproductive. We are here to serve all 
Canadians and that should be the only rationale for what we do.

These programs could be administered by the private sector, a 
local or provincial organization or a consortium. The employ­
ment benefits and services proposed in Bill C-l 11 are based on 
proven job creation practices.

If the province of Quebec already has a program, we are quite 
willing to let Quebec manage and determine the basic orienta­
tion of this program. We want to avoid duplication at all costs. It 
is too expensive, creates bureaucratic problems and prevents us 
from understanding the needs of workers and employers.

Experience tells us that helping claimants set up a business is 
an effective way to return people to work. Since April 1994, 
34,000 Canadians have set up businesses using this method. 
Seventy per cent of them were still active 18 months later. They 
create an average of 1.1 jobs.

We will try to set up formal and specific agreements with the 
provinces. In each case, we will ask what instruments, programs 
and employment services should be designed and managed 
locally. This will be done keeping efficiency in mind. We must 
give each individual the tools he needs to get back on the labour 
market.

A quick example, before I conclude. In February 1995, 
Dominique Grenier of Sainte-Agathe-des-Monts started a spe­
cialized business in software for people with a disability.

After four years of temporary jobs, he saw self-employment 
assistance as a way of getting a job. After only ten months, his 
business is expanding. Interest in his products, which help 
people cope with their environment, continues to grow. Next 
year, he intends to hire at least one person, and perhaps two. 
Here is what he says: “I would not have been able to carry this 
project out had it not been for the help I received from the 
Department of Human Resources Development. This sort of 
program is vital for anyone wanting to start a business”.

This means that on the basis of such agreements, Quebec will 
be able to assume responsibility for delivering an even larger 
number of projects, programs and services to its workers.

As Prime Minister Jean Chrétien announced a few days ago, 
the federal government will withdraw from manpower training 
activities. We will no longer purchase training courses from 
provincial institutions. We will withdraw from apprenticeship


