
A CAJ.IPORNIA SC.FYE.

present an abrupt forai, and the traveier begins to growv weary
fromn the prospect before him, is a spring of perennial flow, froni,
%vhose waters many a tired pilgriru has slakzed his thirei. 1 8at
dovn by its side, thinking more of the journey before me titan or
quenching my thirst. Neur by I observed a grave; standing nt
each end svas a roughly hiewn pine slab, parîially decayed, tipon
one of wh*lch, had been carved ivith a knife, IlC. Mason," the
name of him who, siept beneaîh. II, was a niiner's grave. On
inquiry I learned that it was my old friend and acquaintance,
Cha8rles Mason, oft Connecticut. HIe was the only son of a
%vidowed mother, a noble fellow-frank, generous, open, who, by
hie owru exertions had obtained a fair education; of poor, but re-
spectable purentage, and moderaiely ambitious. ln '49, when
the gotd-fever raged so generally throughout the country, lie be-
came its early victim. He left ail the endearments of home,
impressed the parting kia upon bis mnother and sisters, and with
..uoyant hopes of speedily obtaining a competency for their sup-
port, sought the for-off ]and of California. He swung the pick
and shovel ini these deep gorges; his rnerry laugh rang through
the hlis ; the sound of his voice echoed alorg the peaks, and his
counisel was listened to by his companions. Time passed
3mootl:Iy on, tili relentless disease seized hlm as bio victim, and
prostrated his manly form. His malady cortimenced with a
diarrhoea, but terminated in a fover. Confined to, the roughi
couch of his narrow tent, lie passod day after day in lonely medi-
tation, as hoe feit his strength fast wasting aivay. IlO, that 1
could seo my mother !" would hie ofîen exclaim, on suddonly
awaking from a féeriali dream. But no mother stood by hlm 10

smooth his burning brow, and with guardian.angel care, ease his
rougit passage from 11e; no sistor bent over hlm as lie conten'Ied
wvith the feli destroyer; but a few cold, unfeeling stmangers only
were thcre, as the icy bands of death closed around hlm, and lits
manly spirit vvas released from its earthly tabernacle. He died.
No friend shrouded his romains, and prepared him for the coffin;
no parents shed tears of affection over bis clayey form; no sob.
bing wife or sisters lient ovor bis coffin-lid 10 catch the last linger-
i ng look; no throng of mourners followoed hlmn to the tomnb no
church.bell tolled at hi8 dopartuire ; no vonterable clergyman ut-
tered a prayer at the funerol, and administered hoavenly consola-
tion to, the weeping. Wrnpt in bis <>wn blanket, a few neighbor-


