
tînics of the people vftre various. England had
eoncluded peaee p-oforma, but she continued Ii08<
tile in faet. Great Bi-itain was but a small iV
laml, yct her sovereign was a king over extensive
régions, and many islandsin various parts of the
globe: tliccxaniplcof sevcralofhepcoloiitiesre- r
jecting her autlioriry, and unitîng îa support o£>-
each olher, was dangeious to the iiarent eountrjr yM was fourni impossible to subdue thein Uj force,
it was detwiftiaed to do so by intrigue, corrup-
tion, and robberj.

^
The colonies remedicd one great ineonTenienee

hy forming a gênerai constitution in 1789, whicfc
stands an uwivalied instanee'of patriotism, wîsr^^
dom, and justice ,• a rapîd growth of population/
and extension of eoinmerce,acaI(ivation ofliter^
ature, arts and sciences, were fast advaueing taa
point tbat would outrival England hievery rcapect.
A» thi» State of things adranak i» America,

England prooeed«d,to measureslmncireased vi-
olence and iiy'ustice, Se^eking for^pretexts, in
principlcs noyel, uiiknown to othcr nations, and
even confravening her own estabjishêd practîce^
she left to America the alternative of submissîon
10 her wi», or résistance bjr war; the lutter was
resortedtow n

^
The hi,toi7 of theRcToîtttionafy war is alrea^

dj before the publie. It is a vahwWe record of
VlMil roen dbteroiMied to be free, «an dft. Thip
war lirought intoaphalanx that mass oÊlmàm
^patrwijgm, ^JdriiiidëFTrB^firtmA^ijJiji^
èoq|m<rDeed its eareer ofglory at
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