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That, alUioii;.'!' tlio said rrovincc .'issnnii">(l control of tlic siii>l Ifousf of
< 'oiit'Ctioii in tlir y«'ar A. J>. I^4_^ it diil iioi sfriiiv lull. iuin[ik-tt' rind abso-

lute roiitrol 1( L'ally until the ,v»'ar A.J.'. I.>ll.

That orir of tho t«'rins of tnin.sffr was, that in ))Ci'itotiiity -hort trrm
prisonois, as well as convicts, wcic to !••> caicil for at the sole i-xju-ii^c of tl>t>

said I'roviui-c ot Now IJriinswick, as far as the City anil County oj Saint

•Irhn wcin lonta rnod.
That this i>i ivilc^c, vi/.- that .short term piiscnors, a.s well as convicts,

were to ijo cured for in jierpetuity by the said Province of New Uriui^wicU,

at the sole e.\)ienso ot ^aid I'rovince,—was .suhsenuently extended to all

l)arts of the I'lovince without any reservation of any nature or kind soever.

That in the year A. 1>. IS,")L', the City and County of Saint .lohn was ob-

liged to ask the Le<,'islature of New jJrunswick for authority to assess and
collect from the ratepayers of the said City an<l Connty of Saint ,Iohn the
sum of eight tliousanil dollars, beinijr a balance still due lor e\iiendituie in

connection wiih the said House of ( orrection above and beyonil the amount
received by former ass(;ssment upon the ratepayers of the said City and
County, as well .as above anil beyo/id the amount received from the said

Province of New Branswick under the arran;;"ement for the transler of said

Institution as aforesaid.

That nj) to the year A. D. l^t'is^ the rights reserved to the said (^ity and
County of Saint -lohn, as well as to the res]»eetive Counties throughout the

Provmce, were never iniestioned, but were on the contrary fully recogni/ml
and maintained in the year A. 1). IS'tl by the (lovernment and Legislature

of 2se'.v Ih'unswifk, as will appear by reference to the Uevised Statutes of
the Province passed in that year.

That The British North America Act of l^C-T, Cap. ."I, intituled "An Act
for the I'nion ot Canada, Nova Scotia and New Brunswick, and foi' the ;j;ov-

ernnient thereof, and for purposes connected therewith," provided amongst
other mattei's and tilings, that the establishment, maintamence anil man-
agement of Penitentiaries, shall devolve exclusively upon the Parliament
of Canada.
That in tliryi-ar A. I). iSG'.t. the Parliament of Canada enacted, that im-

prisonment ibr any term shoit of two ye-MS, should be in a (Jommon <lao)|

or Some Prison or place other than the Penitentiary ; but the Pi'ovince of

Xew Brunswick was exempted from the operation of this Statute.

That the fifth annual report of the Directors of I'enitentiaries of the

Dominion of Canada for the year 1872, made the following recommendation,
viz.— "if it be decided to continue the J'enitentiary at Saint .lohn, the
Directors beg leave most earnestly to .advise that the committal of vagrants
and prisoners under short sentence.s, should be discontinued. This practice

is subversive of discipline, and greatly impedes the reformation of the con-

victs, by their unavoidable intercourse with those who are so fre'iuently

convicted for ])Ptty olFences." Your conunittee beg to submit, that the

arguments of these Directors, although from their stand-point reasonable,

do not oli'er any good reason why the Parliament of Canatla, in contraven-
tion of existing rights, as hereinbefore fully stated, and without fair and
reasonable inilemnlty, transfer the great burden and expense of caring for

these short term prisoners, from the Central Government to the Ixscal Gov-
ernment of the I'rovince of New lirunswick.

That the legislation had in Canada in the year A. D. IS7(I, as well as> in

subsequent years, with a view to the transfer of short term prisoners from
Dominion Penitentiaries to local places of imprisonment, is imfair to the

tax-payers of the Province of New Brunswick, and at variance with the
.spirit and the letter of The British North America Act of 1SG7.

That a reference to the resjjective annual Iteports of the Directors of

Penitentiaries of the Dominion of Canada, for the several years since the

Confederation of these Provinces, will exhibit the relative proportions of


