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If those two people and the people who work with
them can agree with each other on the needs and
principles of sustainable development, working together
to build a healthy forest mndustry and a healthy Canada
for the future, then it is possible. I hope that the minister
will accept this amendment and we can proceed together
to build a stronger industry, a stronger Canada and a
healthy environment.

Mn. John R. Rodriguez (Nickel Beit): Mr. Speaker,
support of the sub-amendment which specifically sup-
ports the principle of sustainable development in rela-
tion to the forestry mndustry of this country.

I wili begin first of ail by saying one neyer knows how
much one appreciates anything until one lias lost it. You
would understand that if you came from the Nickel Beit.
Unfortunately, I neyer did have an opportunity to
appreciate the luxurious growth which did exist in the
Sudbury Basin before the Chicago fire and before the
development of smelting nickel. The folks who had lived
there for a long time told me of the lush growth on the
his, the streams which ran tlirough the hlis, valieys, the
streams fiiled with trout. One old gentleman toid me
that when lie was a boy lie would go witli lis fatlier and
fisli for trout to bring home for supper, and lie had just
gone about a mile from, where lie lived in the smali
community of Coniston.

If you have been to tlie Sudbury Basin in the last 15
years, Mr. Speaker, you will know wliat I mean because
we have lost our forests. We lost tliem because we were
greedy-I am taiking about the species-and cut down
the trees. Everybody attributes that to the Chicago fixe
because the wood from the trees cut in the Sudbury
Basin reaily went to rebuild Chicago after the Chicago
fire. Then along came the smeiting of nickel which was
done on roaster beds. They wouid cut the logs down and
pile them ail up into a huge beds, then they would put
eaves on the ends of these piles and then liglit a fire. 'Me
ore wouid smeit and the nickel wouid run off into the
eaves and be collected.

As a resuit of that, the S02 finished off what little
growth there was close to the ground. Once the growth
was gone the wind removed the soil from. tlie his so that
ail we liad was simply hlis of bedrock.

We miss those forests. I thmnk it really does detract
from the quality of life. I know when people talk about
the quality of life today we talk about food, the clothing
we wear, the kind of houses we live in and the kind of
cars we drive. But I think quality of life also speaks to the
question of the environment as well because I thmnk
there is something very soothing about the forests. It
certainiy keeps man dloser in toudli witli nature. So, we
are attempting now to rebuild the forests. Wlien I began
my speech I said that in fact we do not know what it is
like. We do not know what we have lost until we have
actually iost it. We do not have it, and we want to rebuild
it.

Today Canadians, as a nation, are much more aware of
the importance of the forests in our country. I get letters
from. student groups in higli sdliools who are pleading for
me to intervene with the ambassador from. Brazil, to
write letters imploring li to cease the development in
the Amazon Basin so that we can maintain the tropical
rain forests. There is a heiglitened consciousness of the
need to protect the forests, not only in the world but aiso
in Canada. It is important to know in Canada, in
particular, the importance of forestry to our country.
Haif of the total land area of Canada, 79 per cent of the
area within the 10 provinces, is forested. SLxty percent of
forest land is productive. Production of forest products in
1987 accounted for $38 billion. Only the food and
beverage industry exceeded the forest industry's contri-
bution to manufacturing in Canada.

In 1986 forest product exports were $ 17.9 billion;
lumber exports were $4.1i billion; paper and paperboard,
$7.5 billion; and other forest products accounted for $1.4
billion. In 1987 exports were up to $20.9 billion.

Tley provided Canada witli a net balance of trade of
$18.3 billion in 1987. Farm products in comparison
accounted for $1.4 billion; fishery products, $2 billion;
energy products including petroleum, natural gas, and
eiectricity, $5.5 billion; metal ores and non-ferrous
metais, $6.2 billion.

nhe forest product industries in this country account
for 15 per cent of Canada's total merchandise trade.
Canada supplies 23 per cent of the worid's exports of
pulp and paper, and 23 per cent of total exports of
manufactured forest products. There are 840,000 per-
sons empioyed directly or indirectly in the forestry
industry, representing 7.4 per cent of ail working Cana-
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