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but this came on so suddeniy it has
flot been donc, but I learned from one
of hîs neighbors flot long ago that he
and bis family were in gpod health and
prosperous circumstances, and aithough
our paths have not crossed in many
years and we write each other very
seldomn, he cannot rt fuse to care for
his sister's child. I want thee to write
him immediateiy. Ruth, his address
is in that upper drawer.-' She stopped
out of breath, and the doctor pouring
some liquid into a littie wvater in a
glass gave it to her. After drinking
it she revived a littie and soon spoke
again. "\Vhen Samuel died 1 feit that
1 could flot live, but now I dread to go
and leave Ruth." "lBut, Ellen, thee
knows who bias promised to be a
father to the fatherless." "'Oh, yes,
I know, and 1 have been wonderfuily
supported. Tio-night, while alone, it
was shown to me clearly that Ruth was
to go to my brother's ; perhaps I would
have known sooner had I flot rebelled
agairist it. My brother's wife is a
descendant of a strict line of Puritans,
bis cbildren are brought up that way,
for after his marriage Henry seemed to
lose ail inttrest in Friends, and since
this grievous separation which has
lately refit the cburch, he favors those
who cali iliemrselvcs Orthodox. But
'ail things woi k together for good to
those who love God,' and 1 know thou
dost love Him, daughter Ruthi."
Kneeling by the bedside wvhile the
tears ran in streams down ber face
Ruth clasped her mother's hands, but
could flot answer. IIMy daughter He
will neyer leave thee nor forsake thee,
He wiii be thy guide even unto deatb.
Promise me that under ail circum-
stances thou wiltv-ever listeri for and
obey this Guide." "O , mother, I
pýroiiise," sobbed Ruth, as she buried
her face in the pillow. Soon she feit a
convulsive sbudder pass tbrough the
loved form beside ber, and ere she
could lift her eyes the doctor raised her
to ber feet, and gently holding her
bands in his he said. IlThy mother
lias entered into her rest, Ruth, and I

doubt flot is even now re-united with
thy father, wbere there are no more
sorrowvs and separations." Then, rais-
ing his eyes, he prayed : "lH eavenly
Father, be with and bless this lamb of
tby dlock wbo bas oniy thee to look to
now. Let ber feel thy presence as a
strong tower, where she n1ay at ail
times retire and be safe. Make her a
blepsing in the home wbich will hence-
forth be hers." -As Ruth raised her
bead with a feeling of renewed strength
she saw tears in the doctor's eyes, as
stooping he said to her, "I1 have
neyer seen the righteous forsaken, nor
bis seed begging bread, and rernem ber,
Ruth, His promises in Him are yea
and amen, forever."

Two days later the funeral of Ellen
Atherton was held in Green Street
Meeting bouse, where inany testimon-
ies were borne to the Christian virtues
of the deceased, and the loving wife
was laid to rest by the side of her hius-
band. Ruth returned to ber lonely
house to gather together lier few pos-
sessions, and bid fareweli to the only
home she had ever known.
CHAPTER Il -A NEW ENGLANU HOUSE-

HOLD.
In a spacious New England mari-

sion preparations are going on for
thanksgiving. "'Come girls," said Mar-
gurett Martin, Il will prepare the tur-
key now so it wilI be ready to-morrow
without mo e trouble, and you, Mary,
get at those cakes, and L'il trust you
witb the fruit cake, Annie, only let me
read the recipe to you before you stir
it together.> There was a tired, anx-
ious look on the motber's face, and a
scowl on Mary's as she went to her
work. The la-ge kitchen was scrupul-
ously dlean and lighted by twvo large
windows ; it received iight also from
a windo v in the adjoining pantry.
"'Corne Annie," said her mother, "cail
Lizzîe, it takes ber a great wvbiie to do
the chamber work." Lizzie, as tbey
called her (Lizzette was ber name>, was
a littie French girl bound to Henry
Martin until she was twenty-one ; she
was now fifteen but smnall of her age ;
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