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WrestlerDavid Leek and Tim Arthur. A good 
group of Male divers including Ned 
Blacklock, Jim Day and Philip 
Evans have already been bouncing 
the boards under the watchful eye 
of Dan Mosher, Coach of Diving.

Swimming mentor, Nigel Kemp 
now in his fifth season, is looking 
for competitive performances from 
both Dal squads, who face Mount 
Allison and Memorial Universities, 
in the newly tiled Halifax Centen­
nial Pool, on Friday November 21st 
at 7:00 p.m., for their season 
opener.

* Dal swimmers and divers, who 
have been working out since the 
beginning of October are aiming to 
spend Christmas in Flordia training 
at the University of Miami-Dal- 
housie University is in the swim!!

/C.I.A.U. Championships, during 
the 1975-76 shcedule.

The Women's squad, which last 
season swam to their best ever dual 
meet record and A.U.A.A. standing 
will be relying heavily upon the 
performances of C.W.I .A.U. finalist 
Jean Mason and double A.U.A.A. 
backstroke champion Lynn Sut­
cliffe. Other returnees include Janet 
Bailey, Clare Macintosh, Wendi 
Lacusta, Charmaine Comeau and 
Wally Biskupski. They welcome 
newcomers Joann Duncan, Andrea 
Gillespie, Judy Morris, Sara Smith 
and Anne Campbell who should 
enhance the teams competitive 
outlook. They will be be well 
supported by a healthy diving 
contingent of Margie Barrow and 
first year student Gail Stewart.

The Men’s team will be looking to 
improve upon last season’s record 
and indications are that they have 
the nucleus of swimmers and divers 
to do just that. Returnees include 
last seasons M.V.P. Steve Cann, 
Steve Megaffin, Ron Bates, Larry 
Kerr, David Murphy, Len Rossiter 
and Martin Whitzman. Likely 
freshmen standouts include free- 
stylers Galsor Mezo, Mike Verhey 
and Richard Hall-Jones who to­
gether with butterflyer Cameron 
Rothery should help bring out that 
“Tiger-roar”. Other welcome addi­
tions include John Cuthbertson, 
Philip Evans, Bill Kennedy, Peter 
Poulos, Philip Wood, Steve Dodge,

Swimming
Greg Wilson an Ottawa native 

comes to Dal from Woodruff High 
School where he was an outstanding 
student and athlete. Greg is a 
freshman in Arts with aspirations of 
obtaining a Law degree from Dal. In 
his high school career Greg was the 
Ottawa Valley Champion in the 167 
lb. class. This past year Greg 
competed in the All-Ontario High 
School Championships where he 
finished third. This tournament in 
Canada with some 500 competitors 
from all over Ontario. Greg will 
wrestle for Dal in the 167 lb. class.

As in the past season 
swimmers are looking to be in the 
swim of things at all three levels of 
collegiate swimming 
dual meet league; the A.U.A.A. 
Championships and the C.W.I.A.U.

Dal

A.U.A.A.

Cont’d from page 20
the Tigers into anything great They 
still proceeded to play dreary, 
unimaginative soccer. The 2-1 score 
meant that they were still in the 
game but a defensive error allowed 
the Vikings to get an easy third 
goal. By then it was all over for the 
Tigers.

It was very sad to see such a 
tragic end to a great season. There 
is no doubt about the fact that the 
soccer club has its best team ever. 
The tremendous hard work from all 
the players produced good attrac­
tive soccer but it all seemed to be to 
no avail in the one big game at the 
Nationals. The fact that this is the 
second consecutive year the Tigers 
have been at the Nationals indicates 
that they are certainly the best club 
in the area. Next year will also see 
the team at the National Champion­
ships and with harder work and 
more attention to detail we could 
see a National Champion at 
Dalhousie.

Swim-a-thon
The Dalhousie Swim Team will be 

swimming their annual Swim-A- 
Thon on Tuesday, Nov. 25, 1975, at 
the Centennial Pool from 5-7 p.m.

The swimmers are sponsored to 
swim 200 lengths of the pool or two 
hours straight, non stop- which ever 
comes first.

The Swim-A-Thon is a means of 
raising funds for the teams’ 
Christmas training camp. Come 
sponsor someone or support your 
swim team through this long dreary 
struggle.
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NOW HEAR THIS

THE GRAWOOD LOUNGE
NOW OFFERS THE BEST 

SANDWICHES FRESH DAILY
FROM

THE SUBMARINE
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