
sailorwho had been commissioned
by King Henry Vil of England ta
search for a new route ta the riches
of the east. Cabot reported that the
waters around Newfoundland were
teeming with fish. By the mid-1500s
large fleets of English, French, Por-
tuguese and Spanish ships were
fishing in Newfoundland waters.

Although thefishing ships of vari-
ous nations probably maintained
shore facilities and left overwinter-
ing crews in Newfoundland from the
early 1500s onward, the land was re-
garded largely as a convenience for
the mîgratory fishery and was flot of-
ficially claimed until 1583, when Sir
Humphrey Gilbert visited St. John's
and took possession of Newfound-
land for Queen Elizabeth 1 of Eng-
land. While unofficial settlement was
weIl established by the mid-six-
teenth century, officiaI attempts at
colonization, largely unsuccessful,
did not begin until 1610, Officiai colo-
nization by the French did not occur
untîl 1662, with the establishment of
a settlement at Placentia.

Hostilities between France and
England spread ta the New World in
1692 and St. John's, the main English
settlement in Newfoundîand, was
captured by the French in 1696 and
again in 1708. By the Treaty of Utre-
cht of 1713 France relinquished ta
England ail her rights in Newfound-
land, except to St. Pierre. Neverthe-
Iess, Newfoundland continued ta be
a centre of conflict in the more or

less continuous Englîsh-French and
English-American Wars until the
early part of the nineteenth century.

Du ring the seventeenth Century,
powerfuî fishing interests fromn En-
gland's "West Country" succeeded in
convincing the British Crown to en-
act harsh laws aimed at discourag-
ing the settlement of Newfoundland.
These West Cou ntry merchants
feared that a resident population of
independent Newfoundland fisher-
men would seriously weaken their
monopoîy. The wars of the seven-
teenth century disrupted the Engîish
fishery in Newfoundland and in the
latter part of the Century, a rapid in-
crease occurred in the resident pop-
ulation. By the time the anti-settle-
ment Iaws were finaîly repeaîed in
1824, Newfoundlan ds population
was weI i în excessof 50 000.

Throughout most of the nine-
teenth centurythe Newfoundîand
economy thrived on the twin re-
sources of the cod fishery and the
annual seal hunt. Representative
goverfment was granted in 1832 and
responsible government was ex-
tended in 1855. Many of the most
impressive buildings of present-day
Newfoundland were constructed
during the prosperous years of the
early and middle 1800s.

Du ring the late 1800s, however,
the economy began tadiversfy. The
cross-island railroad, begun in 1881,
was completed in 1898; saw-milling
became an important industry in


