
LAWS OF THE PROVINCE OF UPPER CANADA,

nate and appoint certain Commiffioners for the purpofes therein mentioned," it was
further agreed in manner and form following, that is to fay-

1. That -the Legiflature of Upper Canada nay.ratify the aforefaid Provifional Agree-
rent, with a condition fufpending the operation and execution of the fixth Article
thereof, fo long as the government of the United States of America do not lay duties
on goods, wares and nerchandizes paffing from the province of Upper Canada into the
territories of the faid States.

Il. That the Legiflature of the province of Lower Canada will allow, and pay to the
province of Upper Canada, -fuch jufi proportion àf the duties ii'pofed and levied by the
Legiflature of Lower Canada, as the a~forefaid province of Upper Canada would have had
a right to caim if the aforefaid Articler of Agreement had been ratified and confirmed by
the Legiflature of the province of Upp er Canada.

111. That this agreement fliall continue and be in fozce until the &rft day of March,
one thoufand eight hundred and.one, and nu longer.

Confrmation 6f
&1h agrreements.

Pfotincial Trea-
furer authorized
to receive the mo-
mies which may
become due to
this Province un-
der thli aa.

?herefore may it pleafe your mofl Excellent Mlajcfly,

That it may be enaaed, and it is hereby ena&ed b; 4 e:King's moft Excellent Majef!
ty,-by, and with the advicegnd confent of the Legiflative Council and Affembly of the
province of Upper Canada, confl ituted and affembled by virtue of, and under the autho-
rity.of an a& paffed in the -Parlianient of Great Britain, entitled,· " An a& to repeai cer-
tain parts of an a& pdffed in the:fourteenth year of his Majefly's reign, entitle, " An a&
for making more effeaual provifion for the government of the province of Quebec in
North America, and to make further provifion for the government of the faid province,"
and by the authority of the fame, ha.t the faid two Provifional Agreements are hereby
fevera-Hy approved, ratified an confirmed.

Provided neverthelefs, That tfie operation and execution of the .fixth Article of the faid
firft above-mentioned Provifional Agreement fhall be, and the fame is hereby fufpended,
fo long as the governient of the United States of America lhall not lay duties on goods,
wares, and merchandizes.paffing.from this province.into the territories of the faid States,
and no longer.

Il. And be it further enaEled by.the aui&ority aforefaid, That it ihall and nay be lawful
for the Provincial Treafurer of this province, for the time being, (when, and as often as
the fane may, from time to time become eue and payable) to afk for, demand, and re-
ceive to, and for the ufes of this province, of, and from ali and every the perfon or per-
fons who now are, or at any time hereafter may be-nomina' ed and appointed on the part,
and in behalf of the province of Lower Canada, for the payment.thereof, all and every
fum- and fums-of money which now is, or are become due and payable, or hereafter may
becomedue and payale from the faid province of Lo'wer Canada to this province, pur-
fuant, and by virtue of thiis a&, and of the articIs ot Provifional Agreement berein before


