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IMPLICATIONS

Human security provides a template to assess policy and practict
for their effects on the safety of people. From a foreign policy
perspective, there are a number of key consequences.

First, when conditions warrant, vigorous action in defence of
human security objectives will be necessary. Ensuring human
security can involve the use of coercive measures, including
sanctions and military force, as in Bosnia and Kosovo.

At the same time, the human costs of strategies for promoting
state and international security must be explicitly assessed. This
line of argument dates back to the 19th century movement to
ban the use of inhumane weapons but, as we have seen in the
recent campaign to ban anti-personnel landmines, it continues
to have contemporary relevance. Other security policies, such
as comprehensive economic sanctions, should take into account
the impact on innocent people.

Third, security policies must be integrated much more closely
with strategies for promoting human rights, democracy, and
development. Human rights, humanitarian and refugee law
provide the normative framework on which a human security
approach is based. Development strategies.offer broadly based
means of addressing many long-term human security challenges.
One of the dividends of adopting a human security approach is
that it further elaborates a people-centred foreign policy.

Fourth, due to the complexity of contemporary challenges to the
security of people, effective interventions involve a diverse range
of actors including states, multilateral organizations, and civil
society groups. As the challenges to the safety of people are
transnational, effective responses can only be achieved through
multilateral cooperation. This is evident in the array of new
international instruments developed in the last decade to address
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