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Mr. Jameson urges Integration of developlng nations intu world economic system

The minis terial meeting of the Organization for Economic Co-operation and

Development (OECD) Council, held in Paris on June 23 and 24, was the first op-

portunity for mem ber countries to discuss the resuits of the Con ference on Intern-

ational Economic Co-operation (CIF2C), u;hich was also held in Paris from May 30
to June 2.

Addressing the OECD Council on June 23, Canadazs Secretary of State for

External Affairs, Don Jamieson, described the achievements - and the disap-

pointments - of the CIEC meeting, spoke of the '<imperati se" need to plan for

the future, and urged the OECD countries "to maintain and increase the momentum

of developing countries' integration in the international economic system." Pas-

sages from Mr. Jamieson's speech follow:
..The Conference on International

Economic Co-operation (CIEC) grap-
pied with two of the major challenges
facing mankind - the energy question,
and the acute yet long-term problems of
development. Successes were regis-
tered. Significant efforts were made by
the industrialized countries on deve-
lopment issues. These were acknow-
ledged and welcomed by our own popu-
lations and by the developing coun-
tries - more, I might add, in private
than in public statements.

Dîsappointmeflts
There were also disappointmnents. The
indjistrialized countries were not en-
couraged by the rather cautious res-
ponse of the developing world to new
measu res agreed to in the CIEC. Some
regret accompanied the failure to agree
on an ongoing energy-consultation
mechanism. The developing countries,
for their part, regretted that resuits fell
short of their aspirations for the struct-
ural changesý necessary to the creation
of a new economic order.

Achievements
Against these disappointments must be
recorded the very real achievements of
the Conférence:

, A program for energy co-operation
and development which can serve as a
framework for future international work.
This program includes specific mea-
sures to exploit the energy potential of
the developing countries.

, Commitments for increases in the
flows of development assistance, for a

special action program of assistance
for particularly disadvantaged deve-
loping countries, and support for the
African Infrastructure Development
Decade.

e*Agreement on the establishment of
a Comînon Fund, sud on willingniess to
begin negotiations on a new interna-
tional grain arrangement.

e Other gains on a wide variety of
fronts, from the International Emer-
gency Grain Reserve, to the access
developing countries have to capital
markets.

Above ail, I should like to stress that
CIEC served to underline the persist-
ence of the developing-country demand
for structural change in the interna-
tional economic system. We can expect
this demand to continue and intensify
in the monetary, trade, and raw ma-
teniais fields. It has become increas-
ingiy dlean froîn recent important meet-
ings, including the Downing Street
Summit, that there is a clear perception
of the need for strong co--operative
efforts to meet this challenge.

We see increasing evidence of attitu-
des which acknowiedge that change is
taking place sud must continue to do
so. Ini our future work, however, I be-
lieve the message shouid be given to
the developing countries that it would
be a mistake to underestimate the dif-
ficulties facing the developed world.
We have to muster nublic suruDort ini

ive a common inter
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