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PRAYERS

Ordered,-That any recorded divisions required on the
motion for the second reading and reference of Bill C-83,
An Act for the better protection of Canadian society
against perpetrators of violent and other crime, be deferred
until 4.30 o'clock p.m., Tuesday, April 13, 1976.

Mr. MacLean, from the Standing Committee on Manage-
ment and Members' Services, presented the First Report of
the Committee, which is as follows:

In accordance with 'its Order of Reference of Wednesday,
February 25, 1976, your Committee has considered Votes 5
and 10 under Parliament in the Estimates for the fiscal
year ending March 31, 1977 and reports the same.

A copy of the relevant Minutes of Proceedings and Evi-
dence (Issues Nos. 2 and 3) is tabled.

(The Minutes of Proceedings and Evidence accompanying
the Report recorded as Appendix No. 163 to the Journals).

Mr. McCleave, from the Standing Joint Committee on
Regulations and other Statutory Instruments, presented
the Eighth Report of the Committee, which is as follows:

In relation to its Order of Reference dated Thursday,
February 12, 1976, relating to: the subject-matter of Bill

C-225 (Mr. Baldwin), An Act respecting the right of the
public to information concerning the public business;
Guidelines for Motions for the Production of Papers tabled
December 19, 1974, by the President of the Privy Council;
the Official Secrets Act, the Federal Court Act, the Statis-
tics Act, Prerogative Writs, and other laws which are
related to the question of freedom of information and the
protection of privacy; automatic data processing in the
above context, with due protection for privacy of persons;

Your Committee recommends that one member of the
Committee be authorized to travel outside Canada, namely
to London, England, to attend a "Symposium on Freedom
of Information" to be held on April 29, 1976 by the All-Par-
ty Committee on Freedom of Information of the British
House of Commons.

A copy of the relevant Minutes of Proceedings and Evi-
dence (Issue No. 67) is tabled.

(The Minutes of Proceedings and Evidence accompanying
the Report recorded as Appendix No. 164 to the Journals).

Mr. Basford, a Member of the Queen's Privy Council,
laid upon the Table,-Copies of Report of the Law Reform
Commission of Canada entitled "Expropriation", dated
March 1976, pursuant to section 18 of the Law Reform


