
CASSELL’S
GARDENING HANDBOOKS

Profusely Illustrated.
Paper Covers, i/-"net; post free, i/ai. Cloth, 1/6 net; post free, 1/9.
GARDEN PLANNING AND 
PLANTING

“ Those searching for ideas 
will no doubt 6nd much useful 
Information.” — Birmingham 
Post.

PICTORIAL PRACTICAL 
FRUIT GROWING

A concise manual, giving instruc­
tions for the management of every 
important fruit in cultivation.

PICTORIAL PRACTICAL 
CHRYSANTHEMUM CULTURE

Dealing with every important 
point in the culture of Chrysan­
themums for show, flower gar­
dens and greenhouses.

PICTORIAL PRACTICAL 
GREENHOUSE MANAGEMENT

Directions are given for the 
general management of green­
houses, conservatories, and other 
glass structures.

PICTORIAL PRACTICAL GAR­
DENING

Directions are given for the 
selection and culture of the lead­
ing flowers, fruit, and vegetables.

LITTLE GARDENS: How to 
Make tho Moat of Them

The contents include the making 
and maintaining of lawns and 
small rockeries, the culture of 
roses, carnations, sweet peas, 
hardy borders of flowers, fruits 
and vegetables.

PICTORIAL PRACTICAL CAR­
NATION GROWING

The work practically illustrates 
every important cultural item in 
every class oi Carnations and 
Picotees worth growing.

PICTORIAL PRACTICAL ROSE 
GROWING

Describes the whole art of rose 
culture. In addition to instruc- 
tionshow to prepare the soil,plant 
and prune, the work tells how to 
exhibit Roses, how to grow Roses 
in pots, and other matters.

PERPETUAL CARNATIONS
The cultivation of these beautiful 
flowers is fully discussed, and 
hints are given for obtaining the 
best blooms. (/us< Published).

GARDENING DIFFICULTIES 
SOLVED

" If every amateur, gardener and 
under-gardener, possessed this 
book, their problems would be 
solved.”—Gardeners' Chronicle.

PICTORIAL PRACTICAL TREE 
AND SHRUB CULTURE

A practical manual, giving direc­
tions for propagating and pruning 
trees and shrubs.

Pii CTORIAL PRACTICAL 
POTATO GROWING

Forms a complete and concise 
guide to the growing of Potatoes. 
Among the matters dealt with 
are fertilisation, propagation, 
forcing.

SWEET PEAS, AND HOW TO 
GROW THEM

The work tells how to grow Sweet 
Peas for home and garden, for 
exhibition, and in the suburbs.

FIRST STEPS IN GARDENING
The work shows beginners how 
to succeed with all the most 
popular flowers,fruits,and garden 
crops.

PICTORIAL PRACTICAL BULB 
GROWING

All the salient points in the cult ure 
of bulbous, tuberous, and allied 
plants are given concisely.

PICTORIAL PRÂ CTICAL 
VEGETABLE GROWING

Directions are given for laying 
out kitchen gardens and allot­
ments.

PICTORIAL PRACTICAL 
FLOWER GARDENING

The contents of the book include 
advice as to all phases of flower 
gardening, given in a concise and 
easily understood form.
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