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ere is something worth your while to 
know thoroughlyy and to remember.

It may surprise you to learn that 
Fleischmann’s Compressed Yeast,— 
one of the best known food products,— 
one that is used in some form every 
day in almost every home,—is a valu­
able remedy for some of the most 
common and annoying ailments. 
Among these are Pimples, Blackheads, 
or other forms of skin eruptions and 
disfigurements, so frequently the cause 
of serious annoyance and embarrass­
ment.

Fleischmann’s Compressed Yeast 
has also been proved an almost certain 
remedy in the treatment of Boils, 
Carbuncles, Constipation, and in cer­
tain types of bowel disorders, especially 
Gastro-intestinal Catarrh and intesti­
nal intoxication, the latter being a form 
of poisoning resulting from constipa­
tion or sluggish bowel functioning.

It has long been known to many 
physicians and other scientists, that
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