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Govemment Orders

Motions Nos. 1 and 2 standing in the name of the hon.
member for Glengarry- Prescott -Russell will be
grouped for debate with a vote on Motion No. 1 applied
to Motion No. 2.

Motion No. 3 standing in the name of the hon.
member for Giengarry-Prescott Russeli was moved,
debated and negatived in the Standing Committee on
Finance which studied the bill. Consequentiy, Motion
No. 3 wiil not be seiected.

I shahl now propose Motions Nos. 1 and 2.

MEASURE TO AMEND

Mr. Don Boudria (Glengarr-Prescott- Russell)
moved:

Motion No. 1

That Bill C-74 be amnended by deleting Clause 39.

Motion No. 2

That Bill C-74 be amnended by deleting Clause 40.

He said: Mr. Speaker, first of ail I obviously accept the
Chair's ruling in terms of Motion No. 3. 1 wili make my
remarks to ail three of the motions. I invite the parlia-
mentary secretary to avail himself of the answers to some
of the questions that 1 will be raising.

First of ail, I indicated at second reading that it is my
intention to vote for this bill and to recommend that my
colleagues do the same. 1 want to indicate to the
govemment that we have no interest in blocking, stalling
or otherwise delaying the passage of Bihl C-74.

It should be made clear to ail Canadians and to ail
members of this House that the reason Bill C-74 is
needed is because of an action by the government across
the way some years ago. It decided in its so-called
wisdom to make ail parcels coming into Canada under
$40 exempt from customs duties. In so doing, it lias
created an industry in the United States.

I have here a magazine entitled The Guide to Cross-
Border Shopping, Tourismn and Entertainment. This hittie
publication comes fromt the U.S.A., riglit across the
border in Ogdensburg, New York. It tells of ail the great
ways Canadians can cross-border shop.

1 understand that Canada Post is busy riglit now in the
United States soliciting this kind of business to encour-
age Canadians to shop in the U.S. We will deal with that
some other time. Riglit now, we are going to talk about
the amendments that are before us.

T'he bihl does two things. One, it reduces the tax free
amount from. $40 to $20. I had proposed in the amend-
ment that lias been ruled out of order to reduce that
amount to $5. The government saîd at committee:
"Don't worry because ail articles even under $20 will be
subject to a $5 fee at the border by Canada Post".

T'hat is not true, because in the bill there is what is
known as a foreign certification program by whîch a large
mail order house ini the United States will be able to
apply, collect the taxes themselves, and exempt them-
selves from the $5 surtax.

The long and the short of it is the following: A
company in the United States will be able to by-pass the
new $5 fee that the government is proposing by register-
ing under the foreign certification program. Okay? Now,
say a Canadian small retailer imports by mail some small
article made in the United States to reseli in Canada. It
lias no possibility of bemng so exempted.

What have we created? We are going to make it harder
for a small business in Canada to compete with a large
business in the United States because the certification
program is only made available to foreîgn companies and
not Canadian ones. We are actually creating a new
device in order for foreign companies to exempt them-
selves from paying the $5 surcharge we are initiating in
the bihl.

That is why the government lias to answer for this. I
invite the parliamentary secretary or one of the ministers
across the way to explain to this House and to Canadians
why yet another hoophole lias been created in a law that
is supposed to get rid of loophles this government
created in the first place.

We really need to clarify that. As far as I am con-
cerned, that foreign certification program. sliould not
exist. There is no reason for it. Why are we so desperate
on wanting to export jobs out of this country? I cannot
understand it.

If a Canadian mail order house wants to sehl something
to the U.S., it lias to pay $8.40 U.S. at the border in order
to get the privilege of sending a parcel across the border.
That is roughhy $10.50 Canadian at the time we are
speaking today.

We are proposing to charge them $5 for what they
charge us $10 and then we are proposing to exempt most
of them from. paying it anyway. Do they exempt us?
Likely not. We are proposing to exempt alI the large mail
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