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and Unionist totals being arbitrarily reduced, these definitions, 
plainly enough, are of the “ fancy franchise ” order. They are 
not on any commonly accepted lines, and have been selected 
for the purpose of supporting some exceptional deduction 
from the elections rather than for the expression of the actual 
electoral facts. Take, for instance, the line, “ Social Demo­
cratic votes.” It is wholly meaningless save for the initiated, 
since not a single candidate stood at the General Election pro­
fessedly as the nominee of the Social Democratic Federation, 
or in the sole capacity of a member of that particular organi­
sation, and an advocate of its views in especial. In fact, 
“Social Democrats,” as such, had no electoral existence last 
January. And the calculator who, in certain instances, deter­
mined the difference between Labour and I abend support of 
L.R.C. and Liberal Labour candidates is to be envied his 
powers of second sight, since to him alone were the secrets of 
the ballot-boxes revealed ! Obviously these totals were mere 
guess-work, and render a “ re-count ” absolutely necessary 
before the President of the Trade Union Congress can rein­
force his argument. But, even on their showing, and reading 
“ Socialist ” for “ Social Democratic ” votes, the proportion is, 
roughly, 130 non-Socialists to one Socialist; and, after all, 
there need be little diffidence in accepting the Trade Union 
Congress criterion.

In contact with the actualities of Parliament Mr. Kcir 
Hardie and his immediate Socialist entourage have learnt to 
respect the wisdom and foresight of the “ straight ” Socialists. 
From the standpoint of direct Labour representation it may 
have been a master-stroke of genius which secured the adoption 
of the system of the Trade Union levy for the payment of 
Members and the defraying of their election expenses. 
According to Mr. James Sexton (at the Trade Union Con­
gress), the possession of the means of Parliamentary represen­
tation has, in Trade Union opinion, made the L.U.C. the 
prey of the political adventurer. “ Where the carcase is there 
the eagles are gathered together,” he seemed to say. But the


