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Coiborne Junior League.

Flossie, of course, has had the advant­
age of studying the story of St. Paul in 
the weekly League meeting. Such a 
course, made supplemental to the regular 
Topic Study. may be made very enter­
taining and instructive. Let the superin­
tendent first thoroughly master the re­
corded facts, then tell them in story 
form, and add from time to time ad­
ditional items that will increase the 
learner’s store of information. Use the 
blackboard or map to give an outline 
idea of the localities referred to in the 
story. Then allot certain portions of the 
Scripture record for home study, and in 
all be sure not to go too fast or the 
memory of the junior will fail to retain 
all the truths desired. This leads us to 
make a few observations on
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QUOTATIONS.
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New Testament Study for 
Juniors at Home

St. Paul
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THE IIIIILE FOR CHILDREN.
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