
Moved by George McKenzie, and seconded by Alex. McKenzie :—
''Resolved, That pending the question of Repeal, this mooting dis-

approve of any further attendance of our Ottawa representatives in
the Dominion Parlianpient."

Moved by Duncan Campbell, and seconded by Alex. McKinnon :—

"Whereas, yi.v. Blanchard has not been elected by thi^^ county on
account of his Confederation views :

''Therefore resolved. That he did not represent our views as far as
Confederation is concerned."

F. W. McKENZIE,
Chairman.

a. W. BISHOP,
Secretary.

CAPE BRETON COUNTY.

MEETING IN SYDNEY.

The Electors of Cape Breton County, in compliance with a notice
issued by J. McKeagney, Esq., M. P., met at the Court House at
Sydney, on Monday, 1 7th inst., but finding the Court House too small,
it ^yas resolved to adjourn to Temperance Hall. The immense crowd
arriving there, the meeting was called to order by the Sheriff, who
stated the object of the meeting. Mr. R. J. Ingraham was appointed
Secretary, after which Mr. McKeagney made a few remarks, stating
his reasons for calling the meeting and expressing his loiUingncss to

he guided by their action that day.

N, L. Mackay, Esq., moved, and John Vooght, Esq., seconded, the
following resolution, viz.

:

" Whereas, The confederation of this Province with Canada has
been consummated without our Legislature giving us, the electors of
this County, an opportunity of apprcing or rejecting the same, our
destiny having been thus determined by a few men and not by the
people

;

"And ivhereas, Our late representatives have violated the trust

reposed in them, and one of them, Judas like, has betrayed his trust,

and got honors and rewards for his treason
;

"And whereas, The better to make our desires known and under-
stood by our Representatives at Ottawa and Halifax :

"Besolved, That we, the electors of the county of Capo Breton,
fpill give every legitimate assistance and support to our local and
Dominion representatives, and uphold them in their efforts to procure


