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this government, feel that it is proper to give courtesy to the
press but not to members of this House.

Some hon. Members: Oh, oh!

Mr. Stevens: 1 found it ludicrous that when I asked to, sc
someone senior to Mr. Simoneau, 1 was confronted by two
other members of the Treasury Board, namely, Mr. David
McEacbran and Mr. E. R. Stimpson, who informed me that it
was true, that the minister bad specifically stated no one was
to be admitted other than members of the press. 1 asked
wbetber 1 would be admitted if, prior to tbree o'clock, I
qualified as a member of the press. Mr. McEacbran's answer
was -ycs, you may be accrcdited to the press. If you are, we
will admit you as another press member", and hie said I could
quote him in the House.

That answer struck me as being absolutely ludicrous. It is
government gone mad, on the one hand, to say to a member of
this House that bie bas no rights and not to extcnd to him the
courtesy of letting him sec wbat the press already bas access
to, and, on the other band, to say to a member that if hie
becomes an accredited member of the press quickly, bie wilI be
admitted.

1 almost did get accredited as a member of the press.
Someone overbeard wbat bad been said and offered to take me
on staff if that would help. He said bie would be very interested
in seeing the saine courtesy cxtended to me as that given to the
press, namely, a previcw of the estimates to be tabled.

Although I was able to get on the tecbnical staff of the
press, unfortunately, the Press Gallery bas its own bureaucra-
cy, and I could not be cleared for membership in the Press
Gallery prior to tbree o'clock.

Somne bon. Members: Oh, oh!

Mr. Stevens: But here 1 am, elected as a Member of
Parliament for the riding of York-Peel, elected to represent, as
I understand it, not only the people of York-Peel but generally
the people of Canada, and I amn told that if I could have
cleared my membership in the press gallery quickly, 1 could
have seen the estimates. But as a representative of the people
of Canada, there is no way that this President of the Treasury
Board would let me have access.

We are not naive. We know the real reason why members on
this side of the House are not bcing pcrmittcd to sec the
estimates. In the estimates a spending program of approxi-
mately $70 billion is antîcipatcd, a much highcr figure than
was ever anticipated. In no way does the govcrnment want to
meet embarrassing comments whicb might be raiscd by hion.
members on this side of the House, wbicb, incidcntally, might
be heard by those samne members of the press, and perhaps
even reported. What we are witnessing here is, fi *rst, contempt
of Parliament, and second. something whicb in no uncertain
way is interfering with our activities as Members of Parlia-
ment. We sbould not tolerate two standards with respect to
courtesy extended on Parliament Hill. If it is a matter of
courtesy to allow the press a preview, it should at least be a
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matter of courtesy to allow ail members of this House, to see
the estirnates prior to their being tabled in the House.

Tbe president said there was no lock-up before tbe tabling of
the 1979 Estimates when I was president of the treasury
board. 0f course, the President of tbe Treasury Board was a
mere backbencher in the opposition ranks at that time. Per-
baps hie fails to realize that the critic of bis party, a former
president of tbe treasury board, did discuss the matter with
me. He said, "In view of the fact that they are my estimates
you will be tabling, there is no need to give me a preview of
wbat 1 have already seen." That bas no relevance to the
situation today. The situation today is a clear question of
privilege, and I hope, Madam Speaker, on bebaif of my
colleague you wiIl find a prima facie case.

* (15301)

Hon. Perrin Beatty (Wellington-Dufferin-Simcoe): Madam
Speaker, 1 will be quite brief. As a former minister of state for
Treasury Board, 1 rise in support of my colicague, the hon.
member for Capilano (Mr. Huntington). 1 arn very mucb
concerned about the fact that the President of the Treasury
Board (Mr. Jobnston) sbould make a conscious decision to
exclude Members of Parliament from an information briefing
wbicb is being made available to the press gallery.

1 want to make it very clear to the President of the Treasury
Board that members on this side of the House are not in the
Ieast opposed to a lock-up at wbicb members of the Press
Gallery can be present. We believe it is essential that members
of the press, who are charged with the responsibility of report-
ing on the estimates and other important announcements being
made by the government, have full and complete access to
government information. However, if it is essential that mcm-
bers of the press bave access to this information to do their job
of reporting to Canadians what is being donc by government,
surely it is even more important that Members of Parliament
on ail sides of the House be entitlcd to, the saine information.
Tbey sbould be entitled to receiving the saine briefings and
bave the opportunity to raise questions and get information
from tbe government as to its activities.

The minister says it is not a question of privilege but a
question of courtesy. It is a matter of discourtesy. The Presi-
dent of the Treasury Board made a conscious decision today
and gave orders that Mem bers of Parlia ment 'should be exclud-
ed from that lock-up. That is what the officiais said to my
colleague from York-Peel (Mr. Stevens).

The minister says there are no precedents, it bas not been
done before. If tbe minister lookcd as far back as the budget
produccd by the Minister of Finance (Mr. MacEachen), be
would recognize that there is a long-standing tradition in this
House of Commons of an advance lock-up, that members of
Parliament, and research staff in some instances, should be
allowed in to get advance information about the governmcnt's
plans so that wben the information is 'released, tbey wilI be
able to comment in an informed way about what the govcrn-
ment is doing. This is the essential question on tbe issue.
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