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as are deemed necessary or expedient, but no such debentures shall be for a less
sum than one hundred dollars, hypothecate or pledge the real or personal pro-
perty of the company to secure any sums. borrowed by the company but the
amount borrowed shall not at any time be greater than seventy-five per cent of
the actual paid up stock of the company, but the limitation made by this clause
shall not apply to commercial paper discounts by the company.

" THE GRANITE CREEK MINING COMPANY " (LIMITED).

Incorporated 15th January, 1896. - - Amoint of capital stock, 8150,000.
Number of share4, 15,000.-Amount of each share, $10.

Corporate Members :-Robert Stevenson, of the town of Chilliwack, B. C., Esquire;
and William Lovitt Hogg, inspector of the Western Loan and Trust Company,
(Limited); William Barclay Stephens, manager of the Western Loan and Trust
Company, (Limited), Clarence Richard Gillard, Physician ; and James Naismith
Greenshields, advocate, ail of the city of Montreal, P.Q.; and Andrew Walker
Fleck, Esquire, and William Dale Harris, civil engineer, both of the city of
Ottawa, Ont.

First or Provisional Directors :-Robert Stevenson, William Lovitt Hogg, William
Barclay Stephens, Clarence Richard Gillard, James Naismith Greenshields,
Andrew Walker Fleck, and William Dale Harris.

Chief Place of Business :-City of Montreal, P.Q.

Objects of the Company:-(a.) To purchase, take over or otherwise acquire in whole
or in part, and at one time or from time to time as mav seem best, ail and every
the mineral lands, mines, estate both real and personal, properties, credits,
business, good will and assets of " The Stevenson Gold · and Platinum Hydraulic

Mining Company, Limited Liability," and to assume,'undertako and pay all
liens, charges and i.ncumbrances affecting the same or any one or more of them
or any part thereof respectively, and also to assume, undertake and pay ail the
liabilities of the said " The Stevonson Gold and Platinum Hydraulic Mining
Company, Limited Liability ", in respect thereof. (b.) To acquire by purchase,
location or otherwise, a tract or tracts of mineral lands in the province of British
Columbia and elsewhere in the Dominion of Canada, and to work and develop
the resources of the same. (c.) To carry on the business of exploring for,
mining and gathering gold, silver, copper, niclkel, lead, iron and other metals,
minerais and ores in such form as th e same may be found throughout the
Dominion of Canada and elsewhere. (d.) To dig for, mine, crush, smelt, reduce
and manufacture such metals, minerals and ores, and forward, ship or sell the
same either in crude or other form throughout the Dominion of Canada and
elsewhere, and for such purposes to establish works, factories and warehouses
and operate the same. (e.) To purchase or acquire from any individual in whole
or in part any business of a nature or character similar to the business which
this company is authorized to carry on, as also the good will and any lands,
property, privileges, rights, contracts and liabilities appertaining to any such
business iii whole and in part. (f.) To build, acquire, own, charter or lease,
navigate and use steam and other vessels 80 far as may be necessary or expe-
dient for the conveyance of the products of the company's mines or other like
purposes of the company. (g.) To aid by way of bonus, gift of money or
otherwise in the construction and maintenance of a line or lines of steam tugs,
steamboats, barges and other boats running from or to or connecting with the
lands and properties of the company. (h.) To build, construct and maintain aIl
Iecessary wharves and warehouses, and to make, build, ptovide and carry on,
use and work tramways to be oporated by steam, clectric or other power,
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